2. RFP No. 2020-191 - Hazardous Materials Emergency Response, Remediation
Services, and Waste Disposal - Countywide - Various Vendors - Per Contract Terms



REFERENCE NUMBER

COMMISSIONERS COURT PAGE 1 OF 5

COMMUNICATION

DATE:  11/24/2020

SUBJECT: RFP NO. 2020-191 - HAZARDOUS MATERIALS EMERGENCY RESPONSE,
REMEDIATION SERVICES, AND WASTE DISPOSAL - COUNTYWIDE -
VARIOUS VENDORS - PER CONTRACT TERMS

COMMISSIONERS COURT ACTION REQUESTED:

It is requested that the Commissioners Court award RFP No. 2020-191, Hazardous Materials Emergency
Response, Remediation Services, and Waste Disposal, Countywide, to the following vendors at the per contract
terms:

Primary TAS Environmental Services, LP
Secondary Spur Industrial, LLC, d/b/a Spur Environmental Services, LLC
Alternate US Ecology Houston, Inc.

BACKGROUND:

Notice of the County’s intent to bid was advertised in local newspapers, as required by State statute, and posted
on the Internet, the Arlington Black Chamber of Commerce, the Fort Worth Hispanic Chamber of Commerce,
the Fort Worth Metropolitan Black Chamber of Commerce, and the Tarrant County Asian American Chamber
of Commerce. Three hundred thirty-four (334) vendors were contacted and requested to participate in this
proposal process. All documents pertaining to this RFP were posted on the Tarrant County website and were
downloaded by interested parties. A pre-proposal conference held on September 10, 2020 was attended by eight
(8) vendors as well as representatives from Transportation Services and Purchasing. Five (5) proposals and one
(1) no-bid were received.

Proposals were evaluated by Transportation Services and Purchasing representatives. Evaluations were based
upon the criteria and processes set forth in the RFP.

The term of the contract is twelve (12) months, effective January 1, 2021, with two (2) options for renewal
periods of twelve (12) months each.

Therefore, it is the joint recommendation of Transportation Services and Purchasing that RFP No. 2020-191,
Hazardous Materials Emergency Response, Remediation Services, and Waste Disposal, be awarded to the
vendors listed above at the per contract terms.

FISCAL IMPACT:

Expenses for last year were approximately $6,639.13. Services are provided on an as-needed basis.

SUBMITTED BY: | Purchasing PREPARED BY: | Dianna Lege, C.P.M.
APPROVED BY:




RFP NO. 2020-191 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS EMERGENCY RESPONSE, REMEDIATION
SERVICES, AND WASTE DISPOSAL

Secondary

CRITERIA

MAXIMUM
POINTS

Allied International
Emergency, LLC

Spur Industrial, LLC
d/b/a
Spur Environmental
Services, LLC
HUB - no

HUB - no Cooperative - yes
MObIlIZ.’f\tIOI‘I & Response 5 3.500 3.500
Team/Time
Initial Response Actions 5 4.000 4.000
Spill Cleanup 10 7.500 7.500
Venflca.ltlon Sampling and 5 4.500 4.500
Analysis
Spill Respoqse and Cleanup 5 4.000 4.000
Documentation
Spill Response Equipment 10 7.500 7.000
Personnel Qualifications 15 10.000 11.000
Project Organization 5 3.500 3.500
Project Experience 5 4.500 4.500
Safety/Environmental 10 9.000 9.000
Price 25 15.862 20.458
TOTAL 100 73.862 78.958

Protect Environmental Services, Inc.

submitted a no bid.




RFP NO. 2020-191 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS EMERGENCY RESPONSE, REMEDIATION
SERVICES, AND WASTE DISPOSAL

Primary

CRITERIA MAXIMUM| TAS Environmental | The Cleaning Guys,
POINTS Services LP LLC dba CG
HUB - no Environmental
Cooperative - yes HUB - no
MObIlIZ?tlon & Response 5 3.500 3.500
Team/Time
Initial Response Actions 5 4.000 4.000
Spill Cleanup 10 8.000 7.500
Vel'lfICi.itIOI‘l Sampling and 5 4.000 4.500
Analysis
Spill Respor!se and Cleanup 5 4.500 3,500
Documentation
Spill Response Equipment 10 8.000 7.000
Personnel Qualifications 15 13.500 8.500
Project Organization 5 4.500 3.500
Project Experience 5 4.500 4.500
Safety/Environmental 10 9.500 7.000
Price 25 25.000 20.574
TOTAL 100 89.000 74.074

Protect Environmental Services, Inc.

submitted a no bid.




RFP NO. 2020-191 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS EMERGENCY RESPONSE, REMEDIATION
SERVICES, AND WASTE DISPOSAL

Alternate
MAXIMUM| ys Ecology Houston,
CRITERIA POINTS e
HUB - no
Cooperative - yes
MObIllZ?thl’l & Response 5 3.500
Team/Time
Initial Response Actions 5 4.000
Spill Cleanup 10 8.000
VerIfIC?tlon Sampling and 5 4.000
Analysis
Spill Respor!se and Cleanup 5 3.500
Documentation
Spill Response Equipment 10 7.500
Personnel Qualifications 15 12.000
Project Organization 5 3.500
Project Experience 5 4.500
Safety/Environmental 10 7.000
Price 25 18.846
TOTAL 100 76.346

Protect Environmental Services, Inc.
submitted a no bid.



TAKINGS IMPACT ASSESSMENT CHECKLIST

Complete this form for any County action that involves the adoption of a
regulation, policy, guideline, court resolution or order.

Project/Regulation Name:__ RFP No. 2020-191 — Hazardous Materials Emergency Response,
Remediation Services, and Waste Disposal

County Department: PURCHASING
Contact Person: JACK BEACHAM, C.P.M., A.P.P.
Phone Number for Contact Person: (817) 884-1133

Type of TIA Performed: or FULL TIA. Circle one after answering the

questions in Sections Il and Il below.
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. Stated Purpose

Attach to this checklist an explanation of the purpose of the regulation, policy, guideline,
court resolution or order.
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Note: The remainder of this Takings Impact Assessment Checklist should
be completed in consultation with the Criminal District Attorney’s Office.

1. Potential Effect on Private Real Property

1. Does the County action require a physical invasion, occupation or dedication of
real property?
Yes No v

2. Does the County action limit or restrict a real property right, even partially or
temporarily?
Yes No J

If you answered yes to either question, go to Section Ill. If you answered no to
both, STOP HERE and circle SHORT TIA at the top of the form.
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