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STATE OF TEXAS A 1Mw/f)L. DISTRICT COURT /] //Q < /
;oovs o/ A
/«/, */7/ e L),d/(/ LE Z TARRANT COUNTY, TEXAS

DEFENSE CLAIM FOR FEE PAYMENT/EXPENSES

/ / { Y of
Date of Appointment _ 0¢-0) 5- 23 Offense(s) /QL;;( //ué Z/Mwué’ /7(/ &

(

DAYS IN COURT
#-Bays-/Huy Rate Amount

" NON-EVIDENTIARY
(docket, plea setting, etc.)

EVIDENTIARY .

FILED qT. cLER¥/bench trial, revocations, //’ (/)

(s
1AS AW“(-;D%%’_&‘ rEXAStc. if oral testimony heard)
\RRANT CO

AUG - 7 2003
HOURLY WORK (attach itemized statement)

IE 2 ) pepPuTY # Days Rate Amount
BSE— OUT OF COURT TIME

(trial preparation, motion
preparation, etc.)
APPELLATE WORK
(research, brief preparation, oral
argument, etc.)

For Judge’s Use Only

EXPENSES
=S89 (5"f For Judge’s Use Only
CDCA4-58401F 10000-20-223 4120400000 TOTAL

I certify to the Court and the Tarrant County Auditor that the above information is true and correct to the
best of my knowledge. I further certify that I have not received money or anything of value for
representing the accused since my appointment, nor will I receive same except as disclosed to and
permitted by the Court and by law. I understand this document is 2 government record under Section 37.10

TEX.PEN.CODE.

(A P
PRINTED NAME: / Abreh Oé"/SIGNATURE e
ADDRESS "—i o ! yyan A//a,/\ _ :
Telephone_ S -332 Lo, O State Bar No. 240 94 171 &L SSN»

PURSUANT TO ARTICLE 26.05 TEX. CODE CRIM. PROC. I, THE UNDERSIGNED IUDGRECEIVED
DIRECT THE AUDITOR OF TARRANT COUNTY TO PAY FROM THE GENERAL FUND OF SAID

COUNTY TO THE ABOVE APPOINTED COUNSEL THE TOTAL AMOUNT SHOWN ABOVE F §UG 17 2023
REASONABLE AND NECESSARY LEGAL SERVICES AND/OR EXPENSES IN THE ABOV

T C?‘SE 1)) % // AUDITOR-YC
L " S //(/ /7/ A PRESIDING JUDGE _ (_ / // COURT
7~ DATE i _ 20 a
/Z7 /)//J Effective 12/14/01

DC-691 GPC-1901



Alicia N. Moore

From: Lee A. Swan

Sent: Friday, September 1, 2023 8:11 AM

To: Alicia N. Moore

Subject: RE: Question on Pay Voucher for the Case
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

He was an interpreter for a court setting.

e ENY L
onorable Judge Andy Porter \(/{ 7&

Criminal District Court No. 4
817-884-1980 Phone & Facsimile

laswan@tarrantcountytx.gov

From: Alicia N. Moore <ANMoore@tarrantcountytx.gov> W %[—7 53;- CO

Sent: Thursday, August 31, 2023 9:17 AM
To: Lee A. Swan <LASwan@TarrantCounty.com>
Subject: Question on Pay Voucher for the Case

I'have a yellow pay voucher DEFENSE CLAIM FEE to pay Abraham Lopez Attorney, but at the top of it written is Spanish
Interpreter. | just need to confirm if he worked as an interpreter or as an attorney to represent him Defn?

I would scan it over, but it has his SS# on it.

Thank you for your help.

Alicia N Moore

Acct Payable Auditors
817-884-1008
Anmoore@tarrantcountytx.gov




INVEIEAE

b THOMAS A. WILDER
Et Juliana Ipock Interpretation & Tran¥ffiéd S&fice
= 6806 Winthorp Drive
co Arlington, Texas 76001
= United States
8177211382
BILL TO Invoice Number: 2023379
213th District Court, Tarrant County .
Candace M. Fyfe Invoice Date: August 29, 2023
Tim Curry Justice Center
401 W. Igyelknap Payment Due: September 29, 2023
Fort Worth, 76196 .
United States Amount Due (USD): $190.00

CMFyfe@tarrantcounty.com

Spanish Interpretation Services 2 $95.00 $190.00
Hourly rate: $95.00

Subtotal: $190.00
Total: $190.00
Amount Due (USD): $190.00

Notes / Terms
Services rendered date: 08/29/23

Venue: 213th District Court, Tim Curry Justice Center, 401 W Belknap St, Fort Worth, TX 76196.
Case information: State of Texas v. Nevarez Joseph Christopher - Case: 1677749

Assignment: Interpretation services for Spanish speaking witness

Start time: 1:30 p.m.

Total time: 2 hours - Gancellation fee applied

A CERTIFIED COPY

ATTEST: F\[”%D {9\97 E/g“/%CEIVED

"THOMAS A. WILDER

DISTRICT CLERK
TARRANTGOUNTY, TEXAS SEP 14 2023
v (28 o AUDITOR-YC

Please make checks payable to Juliana Ipock and mail the check to 6806 Winthorp Dr. Arlington, TX 76001.

313TH 5840H- 10000-201254123100000
5 o



Y
A GERTIFIED COPY

AT WIDER

DISTRICT CLERK
TA\\’RRANT GOUNTY,
BY: -

INVOICE

c:'?' : \\i'
cﬂf; ," d \ Juliana Ipock Interpretation & Translation Service
—_—u 6806 Winthorp Drive
=T ﬂﬁ" v (_05[&(4 3] Arlington, Texas 76001
=llc g United States
EHiidure
8177211382
BILLTO Invoice Number: 2023328
Criminal District Court No. 4
Lee Ann Swan Court Coordinator Invoice Date: July 27, 2023
Tim Curry Justice Center
4|01 w Brt)allknap St Payment Due: August 27, 2023

Fort Worth, Texas 76196

United States Amount Due (USD): $380.00

817-884-1980
laswan@tarrantcounty.com

ISEUicES! Holts Hate IAmotigt

Spanish Interpretation Services 4 $95.00 $380.00
Hourly rate: $95.00 (2 hours minimum)

Subtotal: $380.00
Total: $380.00
Amount Due (USD): $380.00

Notes / Terms
Services rendered date: 7/27/23

Venue: Criminal District Court No. 4, Tim Curry Justice Center, 401 W Belknap St, Fort Worth, TX 76196.
Case information: State of Texas v. Leonidas Rodriguez

Case No. 1655267 Indecency w/Child Sexual Contact and 1655275 Agg Sexual Assault Child

Defense attorney: Edwardo Meza

Assignment: Spanish Interpretation services for defendant

FILED
Start Time: 8:30 a.m. DER, DIST. CLERK
Finish time: 12:30 p.m. }*}?&A&RQ‘FV%OUN , TEXAS
Total time: 4 hours | SEP 25 2023
T2 aw
TME—=5C _ DEPUTY

Please make checks payable to Juliana Ipock and mail the check to 6806 Winthorp Dr. Arlington, TX 76001.

ISR
CDC4 534610000-20043 4120400003
S I




CAUSE NOS. 1655267 @wd [ 55 D75~

THE STATE OF TEXAS ' § IN THE CRIMINAL

VS. § DISTRICT COURT NO. 4
LEONIDAS RODRIGUEZ § TARRANT COUNTY, TEXAS
ORDER TO PAY

Having reviewed the bill for Juliana Ipock Interpretation & Translation

Service, the Court orders the Tarrant County Auditor’s Office to pay the bill of
Juliana Ipock Interpretation & Translation Service, as indicated on the bill, for
the referenced amount of $380.00. The payment should be sent to:

Juliana Ipock Interpretation & Translation Service

6806 Winthorp Dr. RECEIVED
Arlington, TX 76001 SEP 25 203
AUDITOR-YC

Signed Friday, September 22, 2023,

) -

ANDY POKTER, JUDGE PRESIDING

FILED
THOMAS A wiL
BASSER B

SEP 25 2023
TIME_B. 3] g

BY. °Y __ DEPUTY

1



A CERTIFIED COPY
ATTEST' q / L = TARRAFhllI'I'ECDOUNTY
THOMAS A WILDER g INVOICE
- Dl}SqER(lgcr CLER’}(EXAS DISTRICT CLERK
= E BY: <P ’ Juliana Ipock Interpretation & Translation Servi.ce
%.: l[aduw ' DEPUTY 6806 Winthorp Drive
cu Arlington, Texas 76001
-'= ” E d "P' United States
8177211382
BILLTO Invoice Number: 2023370
Criminal District Court No. 4 .
Lee Ann Swan Court Coordinator Invoice Date: August 23, 2023
Tim Curry Justice Center .
401 W Brglknap St Payment Due: September 21, 2023
s hall, TeRas Felas Amount Due (USD): $1,757.50
817-884-1980
laswan@tarrantcounty.com
| Srrons HoNE et ANFI
Spanish Interpretation Services 18.5 $95.00 $1,757.50

Hourly rate: $95.00 (2 hours minimum)

Subtotal: $1,757.50
Total: $1,757.50
Amount Due (USD): $1,757.50

Notes / Terms
Services rendered date: 08/21/23 and 08/22/23

Venue: Criminal District Court No. 4, Tim Curry Justice Center, 401 W Belknap St, Fort Worth, TX 76196.
Case information: Cause No. 1758058; State of Texas v. lvan Beniquez Diaz
Attorney of Record: Mr. Harrison Pask

Assignment: Spanish Interpretation services during final trial

Start Time:

Monday, August 21st: 8:30 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. Total hours: 8.5 hours
Tuesday, August 22nd: 9:00 a.m. - 7:00 p.m. Total hours: 10 hours

Total time: 18.5 hours
ng%\gb?
—SgIrT3
CDC4-58401 10000-20- 23 4120400000

Please make checks payable to Juliana Ipock and mail the check to 6806 Winthorp Dr. Arlington, TX 76001.



FILED

TARRANT COUNTY
9/19/2023 10:50 am

CAUSE NOS. 1758058 TDISTRICT CLERK
THE STATE OF TEXAS § IN THE CRIMINAL
§ DISTRICT COURT NO. 4
IVAN BENIQUEZ-DIAZ § TARRANT COUNTY, TEXAS
ORDER TO PAY

Having reviewed the bill for Juliana Ipock (Spanish Interpreter Services),

the Court orders the Tarrant County Auditor’s Office to pay the bill of Juliana

Ipock, as indicated on the bill, for the referenced amount of $1757.50. The payment

should be sent to:

Juliana Ipock RECEIVED

Interpretation & Translation Service
6806 Winthrop Dr.

CED 2904 9072
il L G /.:L:.i)l.,

Arlington, TX 76001 AUDITOR-YC

Signed Friday, September 15, 2023,

ANDY POKTER, JUDGE PRESIDING



- Ams’r: e 9.’. e :'K;I:ANT C.OUNTY%
e
T CLER :
ASL INTERPRETER SERVICES TARRANT COUNTY, TEXAS o e :
BY: =
DEPUTY
Invoice Date Invoice No. Windy Rossi
3608 Wise Ln
August 18, 2023 081823 A

Flower Mound, TX 75022
972.333.6325 ,

wrossi66@yahoo.com
INVOICETO:

Criminal District Court 4 :

401 W. Belknap /
Fort Worth, TX 76196

817.884.1980 P

laswan@tarrantcountytx.gov .77
Attn: Lee Ann Swan )

DATE CASE/CLIENT RATE LINE TOTAL.
August 11, 2023 Kinsey 1641264, 2-hour min $65.00 $130.00
Travel $65.00 $65.00

Total $195.00

RECEIVED
SEP 14 2023
SeSl43
CDC4 5846+ 10000-20- 27 4120400000 B AUDITOR-YC




CAUSE NOS. 1641264

THE STATE OF TEXAS § IN THE CRIMINAL

VS. § DISTRICT COURT NO. 4

LESLIE D. KINSEY : § TARRANT COUNTY, TEXAS
ORDER TO PAY

Having reviewed the bill for Windy Rossi, the Court orders the Tarrant

County Auditor’s Office to pay the bill of Windy Rossi, as indicated on the bill, for

the referenced amount of $195.00. The payment should be sent to:

Windy Rossi
3608 Wise Lane
Flower Mound, TX 75022

Signed Saturday, August 19, 2023,

Y

ANDY PORTER, JUDGE PRESIDING

FILED

TARRANT COUNTY
8/19/2023 10:21AM
THOMAS A. WILDER
DISTRICT CLERK
PC
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A CERTIFIED COPY

52:5 ’ (:o:'. ATTEST: 09/20/2023
i§ W\Z: THOMAS A. WILDER
I\ ONNZ/<!  DISTRICT CLERK
VE#P (ﬂ 9 O 553% NS/ TARRANT COUNTY, TEXAS
'-.Z.""._-““.-' BY: /s/ Bailey Galloway
INTERPRETER INVOICE

JUANITA M. DUNLAP

Spanish Court Interpreter Invoice Date: September 11, 2023

TX Master License No. 652 INVOICE #:396-DR-091123

6359 EIm Crest Ct.

Fort Worth, TX 76132

817-313-5150
dunlapjuanita063@gmail.com

CUSTOMER: m
396TH DISTRICT COURT

ATTN: Honorable Judge George Gallagher RECE'VED
% Tommie LaRue, Court Coordinator i
Tim Curry Criminal Justice Center SEP 25 2023
401 W. Belknap Street

Fort Worth, TX 76196 COUNTY AUDITOR

817-884-2765 Direct & Facsimile
TLLaRue@tarrantcounty.com

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES: -
English<>Spanish interpreting services for State’s witnesses during the trial of defendant
David Rubio in Cause No. 1724378 on Monday, September 11, 2023.

Time: 1:30pm - 3:05pm (2hr minimum applies)
Total hrs.: 2.0

Rate: $95/hr.

FILED
THOMAS A. WILDER, DIST. CLERK
Parking: $10.00 A TARRANT COUNTY, TEXAS
TOTAL DUE: $200.00 GEr 28 A
' ‘ TIME [:37eM

%Pﬂau—l—i- BY A3 oeruty
_ @ cc: Kt
‘\\ RECEIVED
NK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS SEP 21 2073

w ‘ﬂ/ 'with all your heart, as working for the Lord, not men.
wid Col. 3:23 AUDITOR-YC

396TH 5846+ 10000-2023 4124300000
5is4



ACERTIFIED COPY
ATTEST: 08/0§72023
THOMAS A WILDER
DISTRICT CLERK i . - ) . z
— e - ' R A
- X . : -7 TARRANT COUNTY
9/5/2023 11:10 am

THOMAS A. WILDER

DISTRICT CLERK
INTERPRETER INVOICE
JUANITA M. DUNLAP B ’ _ _
Spanish Court Interpreter . . " Invoice Date: August 16, 2023
*- TX Master License No. 652 ' INVOICE #: 297-AVA-081623 -
6359 Elm Crest Ct. - ' S
Fort Worth, TX 76132

817-313-5150 _
-'dunlapjuanita069@gmail.com -

CUSTOMER:

297TH DISTRICT COURT '
ATTN: Honorable Judge David C. Hagerman
% Nona L .McDonald , Court Coordinator
Tim Curry Criminal Justice Center, Sth Floor
401 W. Belknap Street

Fort Worth, TX 76196

817-884-1256
NLMcDonald@tarrantconty.com

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES:

English<>Spanish interpreting request for Defendant ANDREW V. ARGUMEDO Re: the
. Suppression Hearing in Cause No. 1707696, Burglary of Habitation, and Cause No.

1628816, Murder, on Wednesday, August 16, 2023 set to begin at 2:00pm.

Hearing was reset but Interpreter was not notified. The 2 hour minimum fee for late/noRE CE\\/ ED
cancellation applies. ' o ‘
Total Hours: 2.0 ‘ SEP WA

Rate: $95/hr. o | ) g AUD\TOR—YC

Parking: $6.00

TOTAL DU}

45" working for the Lord, not men.
# Col. 3:23

297TH 584011 10000-201. 35123500000






