

F2023207 Annual Contract for Service Awards and Retirement  
Watches

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	MTM Recognition Corp. Oklahoma City, OK HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Beyond Recognition LLC Geneva, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
Section 1: Service Awards				Alternate Award		Primary Award	
				\$43,676.59		\$40,794.11	
1.1	Lapel Pin, 5 Year, 10K	25	EA	\$68.40		\$74.39	
1.2	Pendant, 5 Year, 10K	25	EA	\$68.58		\$75.39	
1.3	Lapel Pin, 10 Year, 14K with one 0.01 carat diamond	25	EA	\$113.82		\$107.25	
1.4	Pendant, 10 Year, 14K with one 0.01 carat diamond	25	EA	\$115.21		\$108.25	
1.5	Lapel Pin, 15 Year, 14K with two 0.01 carat diamond	40	EA	\$123.68		\$114.19	
1.6	Pendant, 15 Year, 14K with two 0.01 carat diamond	50	EA	\$123.86		\$115.19	
1.7	Lapel Pin, 20 Year, 14K with three 0.01 carat diamond	40	EA	\$132.33		\$121.13	
1.8	Pendant, 20 Year, 14K with three 0.01 carat diamond	35	EA	\$132.51		\$122.13	
1.9	Lapel Pin, 25 Year, 14K with four 0.01 carat diamond	25	EA	\$140.98		\$128.07	
1.10	Pendant, 25 Year, 14K with four 0.01 carat diamond	30	EA	\$141.16		\$129.07	
1.11	Lapel Pin, 30 Year, 14K with five 0.01 carat diamond	10	EA	\$149.63		\$135.01	
1.12	Pendant, 30 Year, 14K with five 0.01 carat diamond	15	EA	\$149.81		\$136.01	
1.13	Lapel Pin, 35 Year, 14K with six 0.01 carat diamond	4	EA	\$158.28		\$141.96	
1.14	Pendant, 35 Year, 14K with six 0.01 carat diamond	4	EA	\$158.46		\$142.96	
1.15	Lapel Pin, 40 Year, 14K with seven 0.01 carat diamond	1	EA	\$166.93		\$148.90	
1.16	Pendant, 40 Year, 14K with seven 0.01 carat diamond	1	EA	\$167.11		\$149.90	
1.17	Lapel Pin, 45 Year, 14K with eight 0.01 carat diamond	1	EA	\$175.58		\$155.84	
1.18	Pendant, 45 Year, 14K with eight 0.01 carat diamond	1	EA	\$175.76		\$156.84	
Section 2: Retirement Watches				Primary Award		Alternate Award	
				\$11,439.90		\$17,145.00	
2.1	Men's Dress Watch	30	EA	\$84.74		\$127.00	
2.2	Women's Dress Watch	105	EA	\$84.74		\$127.00	

F2023207 Annual Contract for Service Awards and Retirement  
Watches

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	J. Brandt Recognition, Ltd. Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Promo Solutions Frisco, TX HUB - Yes		
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
Section 1: Service Awards				Secondary Award			\$42,230.50		
1.1	Lapel Pin, 5 Year, 10K	25	EA	\$69.99		\$195.00		\$195.00	
1.2	Pendant, 5 Year, 10K	25	EA	\$69.99		\$195.00		\$195.00	
1.3	Lapel Pin, 10 Year, 14K with one 0.01 carat diamond	25	EA	\$115.00		\$195.00		\$195.00	
1.4	Pendant, 10 Year, 14K with one 0.01 carat diamond	25	EA	\$115.00		\$255.00		\$255.00	
1.5	Lapel Pin, 15 Year, 14K with two 0.01 carat diamond	40	EA	\$121.00		\$255.00		\$255.00	
1.6	Pendant, 15 Year, 14K with two 0.01 carat diamond	50	EA	\$121.00		\$255.00		\$255.00	
1.7	Lapel Pin, 20 Year, 14K with three 0.01 carat diamond	40	EA	\$127.00		\$255.00		\$255.00	
1.8	Pendant, 20 Year, 14K with three 0.01 carat diamond	35	EA	\$127.00		\$255.00		\$255.00	
1.9	Lapel Pin, 25 Year, 14K with four 0.01 carat diamond	25	EA	\$133.00		\$255.00		\$255.00	
1.10	Pendant, 25 Year, 14K with four 0.01 carat diamond	30	EA	\$133.00		\$255.00		\$255.00	
1.11	Lapel Pin, 30 Year, 14K with five 0.01 carat diamond	10	EA	\$139.00		No Bid		No Bid	
1.12	Pendant, 30 Year, 14K with five 0.01 carat diamond	15	EA	\$139.00		No Bid		No Bid	
1.13	Lapel Pin, 35 Year, 14K with six 0.01 carat diamond	4	EA	\$145.00		No Bid		No Bid	
1.14	Pendant, 35 Year, 14K with six 0.01 carat diamond	4	EA	\$145.00		No Bid		No Bid	
1.15	Lapel Pin, 40 Year, 14K with seven 0.01 carat diamond	1	EA	\$151.00		No Bid		No Bid	
1.16	Pendant, 40 Year, 14K with seven 0.01 carat diamond	1	EA	\$151.00		No Bid		No Bid	
1.17	Lapel Pin, 45 Year, 14K with eight 0.01 carat diamond	1	EA	\$157.00		No Bid		No Bid	
1.18	Pendant, 45 Year, 14K with eight 0.01 carat diamond	1	EA	\$157.00		No Bid		No Bid	
Section 2: Retirement Watches				Secondary Award			\$15,795.00		
2.1	Men's Dress Watch	30	EA	\$117.00		\$225.00		\$225.00	
2.2	Women's Dress Watch	105	EA	\$117.00		\$224.00		\$224.00	
				Secondary Award			\$30,270.00		