

F2023165 Plaza Building 3rd Floor Furniture

Description	QTY	UOM	Plano Office Supply Co Plano, TX HUB - No		Intelligent Interiors, Inc DBA II Spaces (Intelligent Interiors, Inc.) Addison, TX HUB - Yes	
			Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
SECTION 1: CASEGOODS AND SEATING						
2.1 U-SHAPE DESK WITH RIGHT SIDE HUTCH	9	EA	\$2,387.26	\$207,020.45	\$2,762.44	\$193,986.46
2.2 U-SHAPE DESK WITH LEFT SIDE HUTCH	11	EA	\$2,387.26		\$2,762.44	
2.3 U-SHAPE DESK WITH RIGHT BACK HUTCH	2	EA	\$2,387.26		\$2,830.70	
2.4 U-SHAPE DESK WITH LEFT BACK HUTCH	3	EA	\$2,387.26		\$2,830.70	
2.5 U-SHAPE DESK WITH HUTCH	5	EA	\$3,289.05		\$3,305.60	
2.6 FREESTANDING DESK AND CREDENZA	2	EA	\$12,114.68		\$3,791.60	
2.7 TASK CHAIR - ADJ. MESH MID BACK & ADJ. ARMS	38	EA	\$456.00		\$303.77	
2.8 GUEST CHAIR - WOOD WITH FABRIC UPHOLSTERY	84	EA	\$468.90		\$434.30	
2.9 CONF CHAIR - HIGH BACK & FIXED ARMS, LEATHER	74	EA	\$436.41		\$531.52	
2.10 TASK CHAIR - ADJ. HIGH BACK & ARMS, LEATHER	2	EA	\$1,152.90		\$556.17	
2.11 TASK CHAIR - ADJ. HIGH BACK & ARMS, LEATHER	4	EA	\$1,152.90		\$556.17	
2.12 LOBBY CHAIR - FABRIC UPHOLSTERY WITH CUSHION	10	EA	\$1,073.70		\$977.90	
SECTION 2: FILES AND CABINETS						
3.1 4-SHELF ADJUSTABLE BOOKCASE, 36" W X 73" H	31	EA	\$397.02	\$18,537.58	\$474.02	\$18,924.82
3.2 3-SHELF FIXED BOOKCASE, 36" W X 42" H	2	EA	\$521.10		\$510.20	
3.3 5-DRAWER LATERAL FILE, 42" W X 18" D X 65.5" H	14	EA	\$1,296.94		\$802.45	
SECTION 3: TABLES						
4.1 CONFERENCE TABLE, 48" D X 120" W, DATA & PO	2	EA	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,892.60	\$41,183.65
4.2 CONFERENCE TABLE, 48" D X 144" W, DATA & PO	1	EA	No Bid		\$2,947.20	
4.3 CONFERENCE TABLE, 60" D X 240" W, DATA & PO	1	EA	No Bid		\$8,868.40	
4.4 CONFERENCE TABLE, 60" D X 216" W, DATA & PO	1	EA	No Bid		\$8,190.00	
4.5 CONFERENCE TABLE, 42" D X 84" W, DATA & POV	2	EA	No Bid		\$1,805.81	
4.6 CONFERENCE TABLE, 36" D X 72" W, DATA & POV	4	EA	No Bid		\$1,670.61	

F2023165 Plaza Building 3rd Floor Furniture

Description	QTY	UOM	Wilson Bauhaus Interiors LLC Dallas, TX HUB - Yes		Interior Resources Group (Texas) Interior Resources LLC Dallas, TX HUB - No	
			Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
SECTION 1: CASEGOODS AND SEATING						
2.1 U-SHAPE DESK WITH RIGHT SIDE HUTCH	9	EA	\$3,282.13	\$213,713.57	\$3,374.78	\$221,943.66
2.2 U-SHAPE DESK WITH LEFT SIDE HUTCH	11	EA	\$3,278.09		\$3,374.78	
2.3 U-SHAPE DESK WITH RIGHT BACK HUTCH	2	EA	\$2,965.78		\$3,461.18	
2.4 U-SHAPE DESK WITH LEFT BACK HUTCH	3	EA	\$2,739.54		\$3,461.18	
2.5 U-SHAPE DESK WITH HUTCH	5	EA	\$3,997.59		\$3,285.60	
2.6 FREESTANDING DESK AND CREDENZA	2	EA	\$3,887.80		\$3,518.60	
2.7 TASK CHAIR - ADJ. MESH MID BACK & ADJ. ARMS	38	EA	\$421.33		\$422.33	
2.8 GUEST CHAIR - WOOD WITH FABRIC UPHOLSTERY	84	EA	\$459.96		\$433.80	
2.9 CONF CHAIR - HIGH BACK & FIXED ARMS, LEATHER	74	EA	\$467.08		\$610.33	
2.10 TASK CHAIR - ADJ. HIGH BACK & ARMS, LEATHER	2	EA	\$1,102.73		\$1,041.80	
2.11 TASK CHAIR - ADJ. HIGH BACK & ARMS, LEATHER	4	EA	\$1,102.73		\$1,041.80	
2.12 LOBBY CHAIR - FABRIC UPHOLSTERY WITH CUSHION	10	EA	\$1,037.42		\$977.40	
SECTION 2: FILES AND CABINETS						
3.1 4-SHELF ADJUSTABLE BOOKCASE, 36" W X 73" H	31	EA	\$427.27	\$19,819.15	\$585.46	\$25,453.10
3.2 3-SHELF FIXED BOOKCASE, 36" W X 42" H	2	EA	\$773.89		\$508.20	
3.3 5-DRAWER LATERAL FILE, 42" W X 18" D X 65.5" H	14	EA	\$1,256.50		\$1,571.86	
SECTION 3: TABLES						
4.1 CONFERENCE TABLE, 48" D X 120" W, DATA & PO2	2	EA	\$2,529.85	\$43,729.19	\$2,894.60	\$43,327.15
4.2 CONFERENCE TABLE, 48" D X 144" W, DATA & PO1	1	EA	\$2,658.32		\$2,948.20	
4.3 CONFERENCE TABLE, 60" D X 240" W, DATA & PO1	1	EA	\$9,563.41		\$8,853.40	
4.4 CONFERENCE TABLE, 60" D X 216" W, DATA & PO1	1	EA	\$8,914.88		\$8,222.00	
4.5 CONFERENCE TABLE, 42" D X 84" W, DATA & POV2	2	EA	\$2,196.04		\$1,797.80	
4.6 CONFERENCE TABLE, 36" D X 72" W, DATA & POV4	4	EA	\$1,946.98		\$1,662.60	

F2023165 Plaza Building 3rd Floor Furniture

Description	QTY	UOM	Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No		WRG, LLC Carrlliton, TX HUB - Yes	
			Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
SECTION 1: CASEGOODS AND SEATING						
2.1 U-SHAPE DESK WITH RIGHT SIDE HUTCH	9	EA	\$3,347.50	\$228,554.13	\$3,967.13	\$278,795.14
2.2 U-SHAPE DESK WITH LEFT SIDE HUTCH	11	EA	\$3,347.50		\$3,872.80	
2.3 U-SHAPE DESK WITH RIGHT BACK HUTCH	2	EA	\$3,443.50		\$5,881.81	
2.4 U-SHAPE DESK WITH LEFT BACK HUTCH	3	EA	\$3,443.50		\$5,103.61	
2.5 U-SHAPE DESK WITH HUTCH	5	EA	\$3,435.23		\$4,278.44	
2.6 FREESTANDING DESK AND CREDENZA	2	EA	\$3,938.13		\$4,904.78	
2.7 TASK CHAIR - ADJ. MESH MID BACK & ADJ. ARMS	38	EA	\$352.41		\$536.94	
2.8 GUEST CHAIR - WOOD WITH FABRIC UPHOLSTERY	84	EA	\$489.74		\$609.95	
2.9 CONF CHAIR - HIGH BACK & FIXED ARMS, LEATHER	74	EA	\$626.56		\$643.37	
2.10 TASK CHAIR - ADJ. HIGH BACK & ARMS, LEATHER	2	EA	\$1,204.14		\$1,499.71	
2.11 TASK CHAIR - ADJ. HIGH BACK & ARMS, LEATHER	4	EA	\$1,204.14		\$1,499.71	
2.12 LOBBY CHAIR - FABRIC UPHOLSTERY WITH CUSHION	10	EA	\$1,121.42		\$1,396.68	
SECTION 2: FILES AND CABINETS						
3.1 4-SHELF ADJUSTABLE BOOKCASE, 36" W X 73" H	31	EA	\$600.50	\$26,490.02	\$618.59	\$32,191.55
3.2 3-SHELF FIXED BOOKCASE, 36" W X 42" H	2	EA	\$544.26		\$677.85	
3.3 5-DRAWER LATERAL FILE, 42" W X 18" D X 65.5" H	14	EA	\$1,696.50		\$2,914.89	
SECTION 3: TABLES						
4.1 CONFERENCE TABLE, 48" D X 120" W, DATA & POV	2	EA	\$3,204.93	\$47,572.09	\$3,991.60	\$61,004.27
4.2 CONFERENCE TABLE, 48" D X 144" W, DATA & POV	1	EA	\$3,235.01		\$4,029.07	
4.3 CONFERENCE TABLE, 60" D X 240" W, DATA & POV	1	EA	\$10,089.02		\$12,565.47	
4.4 CONFERENCE TABLE, 60" D X 216" W, DATA & POV	1	EA	\$9,367.10		\$11,666.35	
4.5 CONFERENCE TABLE, 42" D X 84" W, DATA & POV	2	EA	\$1,949.09		\$2,427.51	
4.6 CONFERENCE TABLE, 36" D X 72" W, DATA & POV	4	EA	\$1,790.23		\$2,229.69	

F2023165 Plaza Building 3rd Floor Furniture

					Plano Office Supply Co Plano, TX HUB - No	Intelligent Interiors, Inc DBA II Spaces (Intelligent Interiors, Inc.) Addison, TX HUB - Yes
4.7	WORKCOUNTER, (3) WS 30" X 48" POWERED PAN 1	EA			No Bid	<u>\$3,924.79</u>
4.8	ROUND END TABLE, 18" D X 18" W X 19" H 2	EA			No Bid	<u>\$587.00</u>
Award						
						<u>\$37,727.10</u>
SECTION 4: WORKSTATIONS						
5.1	6' X 8' WORKSTATION, 66" H ACOUST POWERED 2	EA			No Bid	<u>\$4,313.46</u>
5.2	8' X 8' WORKSTATION, 66" H ACOUST POWERED 6	EA			No Bid	<u>\$4,850.03</u>
SECTION 5: MISCELLANEOUS						
6.1	REFUSE WASTE BASKET, BLACK, 7 GAL. 51	EA			No Bid	\$13.50
6.2	RECYCLE WASTE BASKET, BLUE, 7 GAL. 51	EA			No Bid	\$13.50
6.3	COAT HOOK, SS WALL / DOOR MOUNTED 26	EA			No Bid	\$161.94
6.4	COAT RACK, FREESTANDING 10	EA			No Bid	\$184.74
6.5	GLASSBOARD, 47.2" H X 59.7" W 1	EA			No Bid	\$638.00
6.6	GLASSBOARD, 47.2" H X 94.5" W 2	EA			No Bid	\$704.54

Furniture by William Webb withdrew their bid.

F2023165 Plaza Building 3rd Floor Furniture

				Wilson Bauhaus Interiors LLC Dallas, TX HUB - Yes	Interior Resources Group (Texas Interior Resources LLC) Dallas, TX HUB - No
4.7	WORKCOUNTER, (3) WS 30" X 48" POWERED PAN 1	EA		\$4,172.88	\$5,018.35
4.8	ROUND END TABLE, 18" D X 18" W X 19" H	2 EA		\$590.00	\$1,125.00
	SECTION 4: WORKSTATIONS			\$43,501.02	\$48,277.36
5.1	6' X 8' WORKSTATION, 66" H ACOUST POWERED	2 EA		\$4,480.50	\$5,842.49
5.2	8' X 8' WORKSTATION, 66" H ACOUST POWERED	6 EA		\$5,756.67	\$6,098.73
	SECTION 5: MISCELLANEOUS			\$8,994.54	\$9,673.63
6.1	REFUSE WASTE BASKET, BLACK, 7 GAL.	51 EA		\$11.00	\$17.43
6.2	RECYCLE WASTE BASKET, BLUE, 7 GAL.	51 EA		\$11.00	\$17.43
6.3	COAT HOOK, SS WALL / DOOR MOUNTED	26 EA		\$150.40	\$157.69
6.4	COAT RACK, FREESTANDING	10 EA		\$173.50	\$175.99
6.5	GLASSBOARD, 47.2" H X 59.7" W	1 EA		\$607.54	\$562.95
6.6	GLASSBOARD, 47.2" H X 94.5" W	2 EA		\$809.80	\$736.49

Furniture by William Webb withdrew their bid.

F2023165 Plaza Building 3rd Floor Furniture

			Blue Box LLC McKinney, TX HUB - No	WRG, LLC Carrllton, TX HUB - Yes
4.7	WORKCOUNTER, (3) WS 30" X 48" POWERED PAN 1	EA	\$6,143.00	\$9,405.92
4.8	ROUND END TABLE, 18" D X 18" W X 19" H	2 EA	\$634.50	\$790.24
SECTION 4: WORKSTATIONS				
5.1	6' X 8' WORKSTATION, 66" H ACOUST POWERED	2 EA	\$7,671.50	\$13,833.62
5.2	8' X 8' WORKSTATION, 66" H ACOUST POWERED	6 EA	\$8,031.83	\$11,975.72
<u>Award</u>				
			\$7,921.23	\$10,446.04
SECTION 5: MISCELLANEOUS				
6.1	REFUSE WASTE BASKET, BLACK, 7 GAL.	51 EA	<u>\$11.35</u>	\$26.61
6.2	RECYCLE WASTE BASKET, BLUE, 7 GAL.	51 EA	<u>\$11.35</u>	\$26.61
6.3	COAT HOOK, SS WALL / DOOR MOUNTED	26 EA	<u>\$138.69</u>	\$166.01
6.4	COAT RACK, FREESTANDING	10 EA	<u>\$163.93</u>	\$175.65
6.5	GLASSBOARD, 47.2" H X 59.7" W	1 EA	<u>\$388.09</u>	\$478.62
6.6	GLASSBOARD, 47.2" H X 94.5" W	2 EA	<u>\$565.10</u>	\$590.22

Furniture by William Webb withdrew their bid.