

F2023179 Annual Contract for Aggregate Road Surface Treatment

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	CJA Enterprises LLP Collinsville, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Green Dream International Erie, PA HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC San Antonio, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	COVERSTONE – TXDOT ITEM 302	1	EA	Primary Award	<u>\$20,313.265</u>		\$24,211.00	No Bid	
1.1	Coverstone Type B, Grade 3 SAC B Aggregate	1	PER TON	<u>\$37.00</u>		\$44.00			
1.2	Coverstone Type B, Grade 4 SAC B Aggregate	547	PER TON	<u>\$37.00</u>		\$44.00			
1.3	Coverstone Type B, Grade 5 SAC B Aggregate	1	PER TON	<u>\$37.00</u>		\$38.50			
1.4	Delivery Charge F.O.B. to Precinct Facility or Jobsite	1	PER TON	<u>\$0.265</u>		\$60.50			
				Primary Award					
2	GABION STONE – TXDOT ITEM 459	1	EA	<u>\$2,161.265</u>		\$2,397.45		No Bid	
2.1	Gabion Stone – 4 to 8 inch minimum, wire baskets	91	PER TON	<u>\$23.50</u>		\$25.85			
2.2	Gabion Stone – 3 to 6 inch minimum, mattress	1	PER TON	<u>\$22.50</u>		\$24.75			
2.3	Delivery Charge F.O.B. to Precinct Facility or Jobsite	1	PER TON	<u>\$0.265</u>		\$20.35			
				Primary Award					
3	PEA GRAVEL	1	EA	<u>\$27.265</u>		\$35.20		\$34.90	
3.1	Pea Gravel, inch or less in size, smooth surface, washed	1	PER TON	<u>\$27.00</u>		\$16.50		\$18.00	
3.2	Delivery Charge F.O.B. to Precinct Facility or Jobsite	1	PER TON	<u>\$0.265</u>		\$18.70		\$16.90	
								Primary Award	
4	RIPRAP STONE – TXDOT ITEM 432	1	EA	\$84.295		\$145.10		<u>\$133.97</u>	
4.1	Riprap Stone – 12 inch	1	PER TON	\$27.00		\$29.15		<u>\$28.00</u>	
4.2	Riprap Stone – 15 inch	1	PER TON	\$0.01		\$30.25		<u>\$30.00</u>	
4.3	Riprap Stone – 18 inch	1	PER TON	\$28.00		\$31.35		<u>\$30.00</u>	
4.4	Riprap Stone – 24 inch	1	PER TON	\$29.00		\$31.35		<u>\$32.00</u>	
4.5	Delivery Charge F.O.B. to Precinct Facility or Jobsite	1	PER TON	\$0.285		\$23.00		<u>\$13.97</u>	
				Primary Award					
5	ROCK	1	EA	<u>\$2,889.75</u>		\$5,197.50		\$4,795.50	
5.1	Rock, Belt Run, 1 inch	150	PER TON	<u>\$19.00</u>		\$15.95		\$18.00	
5.2	Delivery Charge F.O.B. to Precinct Facility or Jobsite	150	PER TON	<u>\$0.265</u>		\$18.70		\$13.97	
				Primary Award					
6	SAND	1	EA	<u>\$2,068.935</u>		\$6,050.55		No Bid	
6.1	Sand, Manufactured Type B – Grade Special – ASTM C33 1	PER TON		<u>\$26.00</u>		\$24.20		No Bid	
6.2	Sand, Washed – Fine Aggregate	1	PER TON	<u>\$11.00</u>		\$14.30		No Bid	

F2023179 Annual Contract for Aggregate Road Surface Treatment

Line # Description		QTY	UOM	CJA Enterprises LLP Collinsville, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Green Dream International Erie, PA HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC San Antonio, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
6.3	Sand , Cushion – Fine Aggregate – ASTM 33	1	PER TON	\$15.50		\$6.60		No Bid	
6.4	Sand, Manufactured	179	PER TON	\$11.00		\$14.30		No Bid	
6.5	Delivery Charge F.O.B. to Precinct Facility or Jobsite	179	PER TON	\$0.265		\$19.25		No Bid	

Note: CJA Enterprises LLP is nonresponsive for section 4 for failure to bid all items within the package.