

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

		Medco Supply Company Warrenville, IL HUB - No		Leica Microsystems Inc. Deer Park, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended
2	2-Propanol, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A464	8	Per Bottle	No Bid	
3	Acetone, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A949-4	8	Per Bottle	No Bid	
4	Acetonitrile with 0.1% Formic Acid, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific HB9823-4	8	Per Bottle	No Bid	
5	Acetonitrile, for HPLC and GC, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A996-4, Milapore-Sigma AX0145-1	8	Per Bottle	No Bid	
6	Acid Rinse, 3.5% solution, pre-mixed, 1 gallonStatLab High-Def #SL103	24	Per Gallon	No Bid	
7	Alcohol Reagent, 100%, 1 GallonStatLab 6900-1, Leica 3803686	148	Per Gallon	No Bid	\$11.51 \$1,703.85
8	Alcohol Reagent, 95% 1 GallonStatLab 9500-1, Leica 3803682	32	Per Gallon	No Bid	\$11.22 \$358.88
9	Autopsy Blades #60, 100/BoxMedline Havaut60, MYCO-3001T-60	1000	Per Blade	No Bid	\$1.13 \$1,130.60
10	Bag, Paraffin for VIP-6 ProcessorSakura Finetek #6045	48	Per Bag	No Bid	
11	Blades, Carbon Steel, Size 70, Round Tip, Non-Sterile Myco 2001T-70GV	4000	Per Blade	No Bid	
12	Blades, Microtome, Low-ProfileSakura Finetek Accu-Edge #4689or Statlab TruCul LP blades CUT7500	3000	Per Blade	No Bid	
13	Caps, Snapit, 11 mm, National Scientific C4011-55	16000	Per Cap	No Bid	
14	Cartridge, Print, Black, for Smartwrite Cassette Printer 6/caseSakura Finetek #9030	36	Per Cartridge	No Bid	
15	Cassettes, Stacked, White, for Tissue-Tek Cassette PrinterSakura Finetek #8170	5000	Per Cassette	No Bid	
16	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Autoclavable, Non-sterile, Polyethylene, 16 oz., 4.26" HFisher Scientific 14-955-117A, Globe Scientific 271016	400	Per Container	No Bid	
17	Xylene, 1 Gallon, StatLab 8400-1Leica 3803665, StatLab 8400-1, EK Industries 1250	32	Per Gallon	No Bid	\$36.15 \$1,156.80
18	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53mmEppendorf 022492039	40000	Per epTIP	No Bid	
19	Ethyl acetate, >/=99.9% purity, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific E196-4	16	Per Bottle	No Bid	
20	Film, Coverslipping, 5 rolls/csSakura Finetek #4770	10	Per Roll	No Bid	
21	Filter, Fume, Carbon, 2/caseSakura Finetek #6160or Statlab XHC-0300-00A	40	Per Filter	No Bid	

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items. ^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58				SLMP, LLC dba StatLab Medical Products LLP McKinney, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes				Zhou Medical Solutions LLC Houston, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes			
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended				
2	2-Propanol, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A464	8	Per Bottle	No Bid		No Bid					
3	Acetone, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A949-4	8	Per Bottle	No Bid		No Bid					
4	Acetonitrile with 0.1% Formic Acid, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific HB9823-4	8	Per Bottle	No Bid		No Bid					
5	Acetonitrile, for HPLC and GC, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A996-4, Milapore-Sigma AX0145-1	8	Per Bottle	No Bid		No Bid					
6	Acid Rinse, 3.5% solution, pre-mixed, 1 gallonStatLab High-Def #SL103	24	Per Gallon	P	\$16.50	No Bid	\$396.00				
7	Alcohol Reagent, 100%, 1 GallonStatLab 6900-1, Leica 3803686	148	Per Gallon	S	\$10.00 ^	No Bid	\$1,480.00				
8	Alcohol Reagent, 95% 1 GallonStatLab 9500-1, Leica 3803682	32	Per Gallon	P	\$10.00 ^	No Bid	\$320.00				
9	Autopsy Blades #60, 100/BoxMedline Havaut60, MYCO-3001T-60	1000	Per Blade		\$0.6201	No Bid	\$620.10				
10	Bag, Paraffin for VIP-6 ProcessorSakura Finetek #6045	48	Per Bag		No Bid	No Bid					
11	Blades, Carbon Steel, Size 70, Round Tip, Non-Sterile Myco 2001T-70GV	4000	Per Blade		\$0.7428	No Bid	\$2,971.20				
12	Blades, Microtome, Low-ProfileSakura Finetek Accu-Edge #4689or Statlab TruCul LP blades CUT7500	3000	Per Blade	P	\$1.50	No Bid	\$4,500.00				
13	Caps, Snapit, 11 mm, National Scientific C4011-55	16000	Per Cap		No Bid	No Bid					
14	Cartridge, Print, Black, for Smartwrite Cassette Printer 6/caseSakura Finetek #9030	36	Per Cartridge		No Bid	No Bid					
15	Cassettes, Stacked, White, for Tissue-Tek Cassette PrinterSakura Finetek #8170	5000	Per Cassette		No Bid	No Bid					
16	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Autoclavable, Non-sterile, Polyethylene, 16 oz., 4.26" HFisher Scientific 14-955-117A, Globe Scientific 271016	400	Per Container		No Bid	No Bid					
17	Xylene, 1 Gallon, StatLab 8400-1Leica 3803665, Statlab 8400-1, EK Industries 1250	32	Per Gallon	P	\$14.50	No Bid	\$464.00				
18	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53mmEppendorf 022492039	40000	Per epTIP		No Bid	No Bid					
19	Ethyl acetate, >/=99.9% purity, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific E196-4	16	Per Bottle		No Bid	No Bid					
20	Film, Coverslipping, 5 rolls/csSakura Finetek #4770	10	Per Roll		No Bid	No Bid					
21	Filter, Fume, Carbon, 2/caseSakura Finetek #6160or Statlab XHC-0300-00A	40	Per Filter	P	\$110.00	No Bid	\$4,400.00				

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

		Mercedes Medical LLC dba Mercedes Scientific Bradenton, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes				VWR International, LLC Radnor, PA HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
2	2-Propanol, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A464	8	Per Bottle	\$103.00	\$824.00	P	\$61.51	P	\$492.08
3	Acetone, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A949-4	8	Per Bottle	\$103.00	\$824.00	S	\$87.00	S	\$696.00
4	Acetonitrile with 0.1% Formic Acid, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific HB9823-4	8	Per Bottle	\$152.70	\$1,221.60	S	\$692.29		\$5,538.32
5	Acetonitrile, for HPLC and GC, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A996-4,	8	Per Bottle	\$267.00	\$2,136.00	P	\$92.79	P	\$742.32
6	Milapore-Sigma AX0145-1	24	Per Gallon	No Bid		S	\$20.31		\$487.44
7	Acid Rinse, 3.5% solution, pre-mixed, 1 gallonStatLab High-Def #SL103	148	Per Gallon	\$10.00 ^	\$1,480.00	P	\$10.40		\$1,539.20
8	Alcohol Reagent, 100%, 1 GallonStatLab 6900-1, Leica 3803686	32	Per Gallon	\$10.00 ^	\$320.00	S	\$10.22		\$327.04
9	Alcohol Reagent, 95% 1 GallonStatLab 9500-1, Leica 3803682	1000	Per Blade	\$0.335	\$335.00	P	\$0.2922		\$292.20
10	Autopsy Blades #60, 100/BoxMedline Havaut60, MYCO-3001T-60	48	Per Bag	\$12.50	\$600.00	P	\$8.38		\$402.08
11	Bag, Paraffin for VIP-6 ProcessorSakura Finetek #6045	4000	Per Blade	\$0.437	\$1,748.00	S	\$0.37		\$1,474.40
12	Blades, Carbon Steel, Size 70, Round Tip, Non-SterileMyco 2001T-70GV	3000	Per Blade	\$1.79	\$5,370.00	S	\$1.94		\$5,823.06
13	Blades, Microtome, Low-ProfileSakura Finetek Accu-Edge #4689or Statlab TruCut LP blades CUT7500	16000	Per Cap	No Bid		P	\$0.45		\$7,277.76
14	Caps, Snapit, 11 mm. National Scientific C4011-55	36	Per Cartridge	\$210.50	\$7,578.00	P	\$132.94		\$4,785.90
15	Cartridge, Print, Black, for Smartwrite Cassette Printer 6/casesakura Finetek #9030	5000	Per Cassette	No Bid		P	\$0.14403		\$720.15
16	Cassettes, Stacked, White, for Tissue-Tek Cassette PrinterSakura Finetek #8170	400	Per Container	\$0.655	\$262.00	P	\$0.8045		\$321.80
17	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Autoclavable, Non-sterile, Polyethylene, 16 oz., 4.26" HFisher Scientific 14-955-117A, Globe Scientific 271016	32	Per Gallon	\$20.00	\$640.00	S	\$15.63		\$500.16
18	Xylene, 1 Gallon, StatLab 8400-1Leica 3803665, StatLab 8400-1, EK Industries 1250	40000	Per epTIP	\$0.07	\$2,800.00	S	\$0.058**		\$2,333.60
19	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53mmEppendorf 022492039	16	Per Bottle	\$130.75	\$2,092.00	P	\$63.76		\$1,020.16
20	Ethyl acetate, >/=99.9% purity, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific E196-4	10	Per Roll	\$244.80	\$2,448.00	P	\$137.176		\$1,371.76
21	Film, Coverslipping, 5 rolls/csSakura Finetek #4770	40	Per Filter	\$218.50	\$8,740.00	S	\$131.46		\$5,258.40

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

Fisher Healthcare
Houston, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended
2	2-Propanol, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A464	8	Per Bottle	\$76.3875	\$611.10
3	Acetone, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A949-4	8	Per Bottle	\$53.64	\$429.14
4	Acetonitrile with 0.1% Formic Acid, HPLC Grade, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific HB9823-4	8	Per Bottle	\$115.90	\$927.16
5	Acetonitrile, for HPLC and GC, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific A996-4, Millapore-Sigma AX0145-1	8	Per Bottle	\$106.415	\$851.32
6	Acid Rinse, 3.5% solution, pre-mixed, 1 gallonStatLab High-Def #SL103	24	Per Gallon	\$32.48	\$779.52
7	Alcohol Reagent, 100%, 1 GallonStatLab 6900-1, Leica 3803686	148	Per Gallon	\$31.21	\$4,619.08
8	Alcohol Reagent, 95% 1 GallonStatLab 9500-1, Leica 3803682	32	Per Gallon	\$31.16	\$997.12
9	Autopsy Blades #60, 100/BoxMedline Havaut60, MYCO-3001T-60	1000	Per Blade	\$0.384	\$383.74
10	Bag, Paraffin for VIP-6 ProcessorSakura Finetek #6045	48	Per Bag	No Bid	
11	Blades, Carbon Steel, Size 70, Round Tip, Non-Sterile Myco 2001T-70GV	4000	Per Blade	\$0.112	\$447.48
12	Blades, Microtome, Low-ProfileSakura Finetek Accu-Edge #4689or Statlab TruCut LP blades CUT7500	3000	Per Blade	\$4.353	\$13,059.00
13	Caps, Snapit, 11 mm. National Scientific C4011-55	16000	Per Cap	\$0.48833	\$7,813.28
14	Cartridge, Print, Black, for Smartwrite Cassette Printer 6/caseSakura Finetek #9030	36	Per Cartridge	No Bid	
15	Cassettes, Stacked, White, for Tissue-Tek Cassette PrinterSakura Finetek #8170	5000	Per Cassette	No Bid	
16	Container, Specimen Storage with Lid, Autoclavable, Non-sterile, Polyethylene, 16 oz., 4.26" HFisher Scientific 14-955-117A, Globe Scientific 271016	400	Per Container	\$0.7149	\$285.96
17	Xylene, 1 Gallon, StatLab 8400-1Leica 3803665, StatLab 8400-1, EK Industries 1250	32	Per Gallon	\$77.06	\$2,465.92
18	epTIPS, 2-200 uL, 53mmEppendorf 022492039	40000	Per epTIP	\$0.06	\$2,386.40
19	Ethyl acetate, >/=99.9% purity, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific E196-4	16	Per Bottle	\$72.81	\$1,164.88
20	Film, Coverslipping, 5 rolls/csSakura Finetek #4770	10	Per Roll	\$252.00	\$2,520.00
21	Filter, Fume, Carbon, 2/caseSakura Finetek #6160or Statlab XHC-0300-00A	40	Per Filter	No Bid	

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

				Medco Supply Company Warrenville, IL HUB - No		Leica Microsystems Inc. Deer Park, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
22	Formaguard Pads, Small 8 x 11Leica 38007530810, Azer ES86672	300	Per Pad	No Bid		No Bid	
23	Formalin, NBF 20%, 5 Gallon CubitainerStatLab 28620-5 Cubitainer	24	Per Cubitainer	No Bid		No Bid	
24	FTA Micro Card, WhiteWhatman WB120210	4800	Per Card	No Bid		No Bid	
25	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 12 x 75 mmVWR 47729-570, Globe Scientific 1505	6000	Per Tube	No Bid		No Bid	
26	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 16 x 100 mmFisher Scientific 14-961-29	34000	Per Tube	No Bid		No Bid	
27	Kimwipes, 4.4" x 8.4", delicate task wipes, light-duty wiperKimberly Clark 34120	16800	Per Wipe	No Bid		No Bid	
28	WypAll X60 Cloths, 11" x 23" Quarter FoldedKimberly Clark 34470	2700	Per Wipe	No Bid		No Bid	
29	Headspace Vials, 20 mm Disposable Glass, 23 x 75 mm, 20 mlThermo Scientific C40202	5000	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid	
30	Hematoxylin, Vintage Stain, 500 mL StatLab SL100	16	Each	No Bid		No Bid	
31	Hexanes, ACS Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle Fisher Scientific H292-4	16	Per Bottle	No Bid		No Bid	
32	Insert, for 9mm HPLC and GC autosampler vials, Clear Glass or Poly. Thermo Scientific C4010-S629	6000	Per Insert	No Bid		No Bid	
33	Lab Coat, Disposable, Polypropylene, Single Use, Snap Closures, Knit Cuffs, Medical Blue, Length: 35", Sizes: S, M, L, XLFisher Scientific Fisherbrand 17100889A-17100893A, StatLab SL326	400	Per Coat	No Bid		No Bid	
34	Methanol, Optima LC/MS Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle Millipore Sigma MX0480-1	48	Per Bottle	No Bid		No Bid	
35	Methylene Chloride, min. 99.9% purity, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific D154-4	16	Per Bottle	No Bid		No Bid	
36	Microscope Slides, White-Frosted Ground Corners One Side/End, 75mm L x 25mm W x 1mmStatLab 315 or Sakura Finetek Smartwrite 9035	4320	Per Slide	No Bid		No Bid	
37	Needles, 16 gaugeBD 305198	3000	Per Needle	No Bid		No Bid	
38	Paraffin, 2 pound bagsLeica Blue Ribbon 3801360	150	Per Bag	No Bid	S	\$10.394	\$1,559.10
39	Pipet, Transfer, Single-Squeeze, Disposable, Draw up to 2.4 mL, 5 mL capacity.Fisher Scientific 137115AM	10000	Per Pipet	No Bid		No Bid	

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

		SLMP, LLC dba StatLab Medical Products LLP McKinney, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes				Zhou Medical Solutions LLC Houston, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes			
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended
22	Formguard Pads, Small 8 x 11Leica 38007530810, Azer ES86672	300	Per Pad	P	\$1.344	\$403.20		No Bid	
23	Formalin, NBF 20%, 5 Gallon CubitainerStatLab 28620-5 Cubitainer	24	Per Cubitainer	P	<u>\$38.95</u>	\$934.80		No Bid	
24	FTA Micro Card, WhiteWhatman WB120210	4800	Per Card		No Bid			No Bid	
25	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 12 x 75 mmVWR 47729-570, Globe Scientific 1505	6000	Per Tube		No Bid			No Bid	
26	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 16 x 100 mmFisher Scientific 14-961-29	34000	Per Tube		No Bid			No Bid	
27	Kimwipes, 4.4" x 8.4", delicate task wipes, light-duty wiperKimberly Clark 34120	16800	Per Wipe		No Bid			\$0.0196	\$329.28
28	WypAll X60 Cloths, 11" x 23" Quarter FoldedKimberly Clark 34470	2700	Per Wipe		No Bid		S	\$0.2418	\$652.86
29	Headspace Vials, 20 mm Disposable Glass, 23 x 75 mm, 20 mlThermo Scientific C40202	5000	Per Vial		No Bid			No Bid	
30	Hematoxylin, Vintage Stain, 500 mL StatLab SL100	16	Each	P	<u>\$17.64</u>	\$282.24		No Bid	
31	Hexanes, ACS Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle Fisher Scientific H292-4	16	Per Bottle		No Bid			No Bid	
32	Insert, for 9mm HPLC and GC autosampler vials, Clear Glass or Poly. Thermo Scientific C4010-S629	6000	Per Insert		No Bid			No Bid	
33	Lab Coat, Disposable, Polypropylene, Single Use, Snap Closures, Knit Cuffs, Medical Blue, Length: 35", Sizes: S, M, L, XLFisher Scientific Fisherbrand 17100889A-17100893A, StatLab SL326	400	Per Coat		\$2.436	\$974.40	S	\$1.978	\$791.20
34	Methanol, Optima LC/MS Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle Millipore Sigma MX0480-1	48	Per Bottle		No Bid			No Bid	
35	Methylene Chloride, min. 99.9% purity, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific D154-4	16	Per Bottle		No Bid			No Bid	
36	Microscope Slides, White-Frosted Ground Corners One Side/End, 75mm L x 25mm W x 1mmStatLab 315 or Sakura Finetek Smartwrite 9035	4320	Per Slide	P	<u>\$0.06875</u>	\$297.00		No Bid	
37	Needles, 16 gaugeBD 305198	3000	Per Needle		No Bid		S	\$0.1901	\$570.30
38	Paraffin, 2 pound bagsLeica Blue Ribbon 3801360	150	Per Bag		No Bid			No Bid	
39	Pipet, Transfer, Single-Squeeze, Disposable, Draw up to 2.4 mL, 5 mL capacity.Fisher Scientific 137115AM	10000	Per Pipet		No Bid			No Bid	

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

				Mercedes Medical LLC dba Mercedes Scientific Bradenton, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			VWR International, LLC Radnor, PA HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
22	Formaguard Pads, Small 8 x 11Leica 38007530810, Azer ES86672	300	Per Pad	S	\$1.44		\$432.00	\$4.3424	\$1,302.72
23	Formalin, NBF 20%, 5 Gallon CubitainerStatLab 28620-5 Cubitainer	24	Per Cubitainer		No Bid			\$42.12	\$1,010.88
24	FTA Micro Card, WhiteWhatman WB120210	4800	Per Card		No Bid			\$3.5014	\$16,806.72
25	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 12 x 75 mmVWR 47729-570, Globe Scientific 1505	6000	Per Tube		\$0.04		\$240.00	\$0.02894	\$173.64
26	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 16 x 100 mmFisher Scientific 14-961-29	34000	Per Tube		\$0.084		\$2,856.00	\$0.04533	\$1,541.22
27	Kimwipes, 4" x 8.4", delicate task wipes, light-duty wiperKimberly Clark 34120	16800	Per Wipe	S	\$0.014		\$235.20	\$0.01029	\$172.87
28	WypAll X60 Cloths, 11" x 23" Quarter FoldedKimberly Clark 34470	2700	Per Wipe		No Bid			\$0.187	\$504.90
29	Headspace Vials, 20 mm Disposable Glass, 23 x 75 mm, 20 mlThermo Scientific C40202	5000	Per Vial		No Bid			\$0.41923	\$2,096.15
30	Hematoxylin, Vintage Stain, 500 mL StatLab SL100	16	Each		No Bid			\$22.07	\$353.12
31	Hexanes, ACS Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle Fisher Scientific H292-4	16	Per Bottle		\$93.00		\$1,488.00	\$77.69	\$1,243.04
32	Insert, for 9mm HPLC and GC autosampler vials, Clear Glass or Poly. Thermo Scientific C4010-S629	6000	Per Insert		No Bid			\$1.0984	\$6,590.40
33	Lab Coat; Disposable, Polypropylene, Single Use, Snap Closures, Knit Cuffs, Medical Blue, Length: 35", Sizes: S, M, L, XLFisher Scientific Fisherbrand 17100889A-17100893A, StatLab SL326	400	Per Coat		No Bid			\$1.065	\$426.00
34	Methanol, Optima LC/MS Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle Millipore Sigma MX0480-1	48	Per Bottle		\$105.00		\$5,040.00	\$42.8475**	\$2,056.68
35	Methylene Chloride, min. 99.9% purity, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific D154-4	16	Per Bottle		\$131.15		\$2,098.40	\$49.76	\$796.16
36	Microscope Slides, White-Frosted Ground Corners One Side/End, 75mm L x 25mm W x 1mmStatLab 315 or Sakura Finetek Smartwrite 9035	4320	Per Slide		No Bid			No Bid	
37	Needles, 16 gaugeBD 305198	3000	Per Needle		\$0.233		\$699.00	\$0.17875	\$536.25
38	Paraffin, 2 pound bagsLeica Blue Ribbon 3801360	150	Per Bag		No Bid			\$9.493	\$1,423.95
39	Pipet, Transfer, Single-Squeeze, Disposable, Draw up to 2.4 mL, 5 mL capacity.Fisher Scientific 137115AM	10000	Per Pipet		No Bid			\$0.0278	\$278.00

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

					Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended		
22	Formaguard Pads, Small 8 x 11Leica 38007530810, Azer ES86672	300	Per Pad		\$5,2456	\$1,573.68	
23	Formalin, NBF 20%, 5 Gallon CubitainerStatLab 28620-5 Cubitainer	24	Per Cubitainer	No Bid			
24	FTA Micro Card, WhiteWhatman WB120210	4800	Per Card	S	\$3.8333	\$18,399.84	
25	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 12 x 75 mmVWR 47729-570, Globe Scientific 1505	6000	Per Tube	S	\$0.03905	\$234.30	
26	Glass Tubes, Disposable Culture, 16 x 100 mmFisher Scientific 14-961-29	34000	Per Tube	S	\$0.05982	\$2,033.88	
27	Kimwipes, 4.4" x 8.4", delicate task wipes, light-duty wiperKimberly Clark 34120	16800	Per Wipe		\$0.01911	\$321.05	
28	WypAll X60 Cloths, 11" x 23" Quarter FoldedKimberly Clark 34470	2700	Per Wipe	No Bid			
29	Headspace Vials, 20 mm Disposable Glass, 23 x 75 mm, 20 mlThermo Scientific C40202	5000	Per Vial	S	\$0.43892	\$2,194.60	
30	Hematoxylin, Vintage Stain, 500 mL StatLab SL100	16	Each		\$30.61	\$489.76	
31	Hexanes, ACS Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle Fisher Scientific H292-4	16	Per Bottle	P	\$37.39	\$598.24	
32	Insert, for 9mm HPLC and GC autosampler vials, Clear Glass or Poly. Thermo Scientific C4010-5629	6000	Per Insert	No Bid			
33	Lab Coat, Disposable, Polypropylene, Single Use, Snap Closures, Knit Cuffs, Medical Blue, Length: 35", Sizes: S, M, L, XLFisher Scientific Fisherbrand 17100889A-17100893A, StatLab SL326	400	Per Coat		\$9.62	\$3,848.00	
34	Methanol, Optima LC/MS Grade, 4 Liter Amber Bottle Millipore Sigma MX0480-1	48	Per Bottle		\$135.34	\$6,496.32	
35	Methylene Chloride, min. 99.9% purity, 4 Liter Amber BottleFisher Scientific D154-4	16	Per Bottle	S	\$85.26	\$1,364.16	
36	Microscope Slides, White-Frosted Ground Corners One Side/End, 75mm L x 25mm W x 1mmStatLab 315 or Sakura Finetek Smartwrite 9035	4320	Per Slide	S	\$2.44437	\$10,559.68	
37	Needles, 16 gaugeBD 305198	3000	Per Needle		\$0.249	\$747.00	
38	Paraffin, 2 pound bagsLeica Blue Ribbon 3801360	150	Per Bag		\$13.454	\$2,018.10	
39	Pipet, Transfer, Single-Squeeze, Disposable, Draw up to 2.4 mL, 5 mL capacity.Fisher Scientific 137115AM	10000	Per Pipet	S	\$0.02922	\$292.20	

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

				Medco Supply Company Warrenville, IL HUB - No		Leica Microsystems Inc. Deer Park, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
40	Pipet, Non-sterile, Transfer, Disposable, 3 mL, with 1 mL and 2 mL graduations. Falcon 357524	10000	Per Pipet	No Bid		No Bid	
41	Pipet Tips, Refill, 2 to 200 uLEppendorf 22491539	4800	Per Pipet Tip	No Bid		No Bid	
42	Reagent, Vintage Bluing, 1 gallonStatLab #SL102	24	Per Gallon	No Bid		No Bid	
43	Seal, Magnetic Crimp, 20mmDWK Life Sciences 20-0000ML	3000	Per Seal	No Bid		No Bid	
44	Solution, Rapid Decalcifier, 1 gallonApex RDO	4	Per Gallon	No Bid		\$53.60	\$214.40
45	Syringe, 30cc, Sterile, Luer Lock, w/o needleExel 26290	75000	Per Syringe	No Bid		No Bid	
46	Tips, Wide Orifice, Universal Fit, 250 uLMettler Toledo #17001127	11520	Per Tip	No Bid		No Bid	
47	Treosin, Stain, PintStatLab #SL93-16	20	Each	No Bid		No Bid	
48	Underpad, Super Absorbent, 30 x 36Medline MUP2030P, Dynarex 1348	10240	Per Pad	\$0.24**	\$2,469.89	No Bid	
49	Vacutainer Tube, Blood Collection, with Fluoride, 6 mL, Gray Top, with Hemogard ClosureBD 367925	12000	Per Tube	No Bid		No Bid	
50	Vial Cap, Target Snap-IT, 11mm Snapcap Closure, Clear Poly/Red RubberNational Scientific C4011-51	12000	Per Cap	No Bid		No Bid	
51	Vial Inserts, 0.25 mL, Conical Bottom for Wiedmount, 12 x 32 gc VialSUN SRI 500 304	1200	Per Insert	No Bid		No Bid	
52	Vial Inserts, 350 uL, Conical, Pulled-PointMicroliter 09-0000-101	1200	Per Insert	No Bid		No Bid	
53	Vial, 2mL Clear Glass, 12 x 32 mm Flat BaseNational Scientific C4011-5W	30000	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid	
54	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Amber w/Patch, 9mm Screw ThreadMicroliter 09-2200	3600	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid	
55	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Clear, 9mm Screw ThreadMicroliter 09-1000	1000	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid	
56	Vials, Septa, 20mm, for headspace vialsNational Sci #C4020-30	12000	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid	
57	Wristbands, Write-On, Tri-Laminate, Snap Closure, 12", Various Colors Medline MDS133045 and MDS133045Y	8000	Per Wristband	No Bid		No Bid	
58	Formalin, NBF 10%, 5 gallon cubeStatlab	10	Per Cube	No Bid		No Bid	
59	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, clear, 11mm crimp topChromtech CTV-1830SIL	5000	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 2 - DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE							
Discount Offered				0-25%		10% Histology Consumables Only	

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

				SLMP, LLC dba StatLab Medical Products LLP McKinney, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Zhou Medical Solutions LLC Houston, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
40	Pipet, Non-sterile, Transfer, Disposable, 3 mL, with 1 mL and 2 mL graduations. Falcon 357524	10000	Per Pipet	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
41	Pipet Tips, Refill, 2 to 200 uLEppendorf 22491539	4800	Per Pipet Tip	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
42	Reagent, Vintage Bluing, 1 gallonStatLab #SL102	24	Per Gallon	P	\$15.00		\$360.00	No Bid	
43	Seal, Magnetic Crimp, 20mmDWK Life Sciences 20-0000ML	3000	Per Seal	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
44	Solution, Rapid Decalcifier, 1 gallonApex RDO	4	Per Gallon	P	\$38.50		\$154.00	No Bid	
45	Syringe, 30cc, Sterile, Luer Lock, w/o needleExel 26290	75000	Per Syringe			No Bid		No Bid	\$39,240.00
46	Tips, Wide Orifice, Universal Fit, 250 uLMettler Toledo #17001127	11520	Per Tip	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
47	Treosin, Stain, PintStatLab #SL93-16	20	Each	S	\$15.75		\$315.00	No Bid	
48	Underpad, Super Absorbent, 30 x 36Medline MUP2030P, Dynarex 1348	10240	Per Pad			No Bid		No Bid	\$5,629.95
49	Vacutainer Tube, Blood Collection, with Fluoride, 6 mL, Gray Top, with Hemogard ClosureBD 367925	12000	Per Tube			No Bid		P	\$4,557.60
50	Vial Cap, Target Snap-IT, 11mm Snapcap Closure, Clear Poly/Red RubberNational Scientific C4011-51	12000	Per Cap	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
51	Vial Inserts, 0.25 mL, Conical Bottom for Wiedmount, 12 x 32 gc VialSUN SRI 500 304	1200	Per Insert	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
52	Vial Inserts, 350 uL, Conical, Pulled-PointMicroliter 09-0000-101	1200	Per Insert	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
53	Vial, 2mL Clear Glass, 12 x 32 mm Flat BaseNational Scientific C4011-5W	30000	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
54	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Amber w/Patch, 9mm Screw ThreadMicroliter 09-2200	3600	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
55	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Clear, 9mm Screw ThreadMicroliter 09-1000	1000	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
56	Vials, Septa, 20mm, for headspace vialsNational Sci #C4020-30	12000	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
57	Wristbands, Write-On, Tri-Laminate, Snap Closure, 12", Various Colors Medline MDS133045 and MDS133045Y	8000	Per Wristband	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
58	Formalin, NBF 10%, 5 gallon cubeStatlab	10	Per Cube	S	\$20.00 ^		\$200.00	No Bid	
59	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, clear, 11mm crimp topChromtech CTV-1830SIL	5000	Per Vial	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
SECTION 2 - DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE									
Discount Offered									5.0%

F2023171 Annual Contract for Medical Examiner Supplies

P = Primary

S = Secondary

Notes: **Item does not meet specifications

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and

51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because

only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

				Mercedes Medical LLC dba Mercedes Scientific Bradenton, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			VWR International, LLC Radnor, PA HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
40	Pipet, Non-sterile, Transfer, Disposable, 3 mL, with 1 mL and 2 mL graduations. Falcon 357524	10000	Per Pipet	No Bid		S	\$0.10975		\$1,097.50
41	Pipet Tips, Refill, 2 to 200 uLEppendorf 22491539	4800	Per Pipet Tip	\$0.085	\$408.00	S	\$0.07525		\$361.20
42	Reagent, Vintage Bluing, 1 gallonStatLab #SL102	24	Per Gallon	No Bid		S	\$22.48		\$539.52
43	Seal, Magnetic Crimp, 20mmDWK Life Sciences 20-0000ML	3000	Per Seal	No Bid		P	\$0.1243		\$372.90
44	Solution, Rapid Decalcifier, 1 gallonApex RDO	4	Per Gallon	\$55.00	\$220.00	S	\$53.20		\$212.80
45	Syringe, 30cc, Sterile, Luer Lock, w/o needleExel 26290	75000	Per Syringe	\$0.44	\$33,000.00		\$0.53628		\$40,221.00
46	Tips, Wide Office, Universal Fit, 250 uLMettler Toledo #17001127	11520	Per Tip	No Bid		No Bid			
47	Treosin, Stain, PintStatLab #SL93-16	20	Each	No Bid		P	\$12.76		\$255.20
48	Underpad, Super Absorbent, 30 x 36Medline MUP2030P, Dynarex 1348	10240	Per Pad	\$0.57	\$5,836.80				
49	Vacutainer Tube, Blood Collection, with Fluoride, 6 mL, Gray Top, with Hemogard ClosureBD 367925	12000	Per Tube	No Bid			\$0.40271		\$4,832.52
50	Vial Cap, Target Snap-IT, 11mm Snapcap Closure, Clear Poly/Red RubberNational Scientific C4011-51	12000	Per Cap	No Bid		P	\$0.26742		\$3,209.04
51	Vial Inserts, 0.25 ml, Conical Bottom for Wiedmount, 12 x 32 gc VialSUN SRI500 304	1200	Per Insert	No Bid		No Bid			
52	Vial Inserts, 350 ul, Conical, Pulled-PointMicroliter 09-0000-101	1200	Per Insert	No Bid		No Bid			
53	Vial, 2ml Clear Glass, 12 x 32 mm Flat BaseNational Scientific C4011-5W	30000	Per Vial	No Bid		P	\$0.22383		\$6,714.90
54	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Amber w/Patch, 9mm Screw ThreadMicroliter 09-2200	3600	Per Vial	No Bid		P	\$0.2553		\$919.08
55	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Clear, 9mm Screw ThreadMicroliter 09-1000	1000	Per Vial	No Bid		P	\$0.2204		\$220.40
56	Vials, Septa, 20mm, for headspace vialsNational Sci #C4020-30	12000	Per Vial	No Bid		P	\$0.20326		\$2,439.12
57	Wristbands, Write-On, Tri-Laminate, Snap Closure, 12", Various Colors Medline MDS133045 and MDS133045Y	8000	Per Wristband	No Bid		P	\$0.19524		\$1,561.92
58	Formalin, NBF 10%, 5 gallon cubeStatlab	10	Per Cube	\$20.00 ^	\$200.00		\$24.44		\$244.40
59	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, clear, 11mm crimp topChromtech CTV-1830SIL	5000	Per Vial	No Bid		P	\$1.9421		\$9,710.50

SECTION 2 - DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE

Discount Offered		25.0%	
------------------	--	-------	--

P = Primary
S = Secondary

No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items.

^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58

<p>Fisher Healthcare Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes</p>					
<p>Notes: **Item does not meet specifications No awards for item 34 because all responsive bids are cost prohibitive. No awards for items 46 and 51 because only no-bids were received. No secondary awards for items 15, 32, 52, 57, and 59 because only one bid was received for these items. ^ Tie bids received for items 7, 8, 58</p>					
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended
40	Pipet, Non-sterile, Transfer, Disposable, 3 mL, with 1 mL and 2 mL graduations. Falcon 357524	10000	Per Pipet	P	\$982.10
41	Pipet Tips, Refill, 2 to 200 uLEppendorf 22491539	4800	Per Pipet Tip	P	\$352.27
42	Reagent, Vintage Bluing,1 gallonStatLab #SL102	24	Per Gallon	\$28.70	\$688.80
43	Seal, Magnetic Crimp, 20mmDWK Life Sciences 20-0000MML	3000	Per Seal	S	\$421.50
44	Solution, Rapid Decalcifier, 1 gallonApex RDO	4	Per Gallon	No Bid	\$68,523.00
45	Syringe, 30cc, Sterile, Luer Lock, w/o needleExel 26290	75000	Per Syringe	\$0.91364	\$68,523.00
46	Tips, Wide Orifice, Universal Fit, 250 uLMettler Toledo #17001127	11520	Per Tip	No Bid	\$421.50
47	Treosin, Stain, PintStatLab #SL93-16	20	Each	\$21.075	\$421.50
48	Underpad, Super Absorbent, 30 x 36Medline MUP2030P, Dynarex 1348	10240	Per Pad	No Bid	\$4,787.04
49	Vacutainer Tube, Blood Collection, with Fluoride, 6 mL, Gray Top, with Hemogard ClosureBD 367925	12000	Per Tube	S	\$3,937.08
50	Vial Cap, Target Snap-IT, 11mm Snapcap Closure, Clear Poly/Red RubberNational Scientific C4011-51	12000	Per Cap	S	\$3,937.08
51	Vial Inserts, 0.25 mL, Conical Bottom for Wiedmount, 12 x 32 gc VialSUN SRI 500 304	1200	Per Insert	No Bid	\$777.84
52	Vial Inserts, 350 uL, Conical, Pulled-PointMicroliter 09-0000-101	1200	Per Insert	P	\$7,101.00
53	Vial, 2mL Clear Glass, 12 x 32 mm Flat BaseNational Scientific C4011-5W	30000	Per Vial	S	\$1,055.52
54	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Amber w/Patch, 9mm Screw ThreadMicroliter 09-2200	3600	Per Vial	S	\$252.90
55	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, Clear, 9mm Screw ThreadMicroliter 09-1000	1000	Per Vial	S	\$2,779.08
56	Vials, Septa, 20mm, for headspace vialsNational Sci #C4020-30	12000	Per Vial	S	
57	Wristbands, Write-On, Tri-Laminate, Snap Closure, 12", Various Colors Medline MDS133045 and MDS133045Y	8000	Per Wristband	No Bid	
58	Formalin, NBF 10%, 5 gallon cubesStatlab	10	Per Cube	No Bid	
59	Vials, 12 x 32 mm, clear, 11mm crimp topChromtech CTV-18305IL	5000	Per Vial	No Bid	
SECTION 2 - DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE					
Discount Offered					