



TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

100 E. Weatherford St. #303 • Fort Worth, TX 76196 • (817) 884-1414 • (817) 884-2629 (Fax)

Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.  
Purchasing Agent

Chris Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP  
Assistant Purchasing Agent

July 14, 2023

Rockdale Country Ford  
Vendor # 7014021  
479 US-79  
Rockdale, TX. 76567  
Contacts: Averyt Knapp and Adrienne Gattis  
Phone Number: 979-567-6116  
E-mail: [averyt@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:averyt@caldwellcountry.com)  
[agattis@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:agattis@caldwellcountry.com)  
[ben@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:ben@caldwellcountry.com)

Re: BID NO. 2023-016 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with one (1) option to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of December 4, 2022 through December 3, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from December 4, 2023 through December 3, 2024.

☒ Yes, Rockdale Country Ford will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period. **Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.**

☐ No, Rockdale Country Ford will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? ☒ Yes ☐ No  
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

Julie Nichols

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer  
(P) 817.884.1133  
(F) 817.884.1133  
(E) [jmnichols@tarrantcountytexas.gov](mailto:jmnichols@tarrantcountytexas.gov)

A Knapp

Name: Averyt Knapp  
Averyt Knapp  
(P) 979 567 1500  
(F) —  
(E) averyt@caldwellcountry.com



TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

100 E. Weatherford St. #303 • Fort Worth, TX 76196 • (817) 884-1414 • (817) 884-2629 (Fax)

Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.  
Purchasing Agent

Chris Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP  
Assistant Purchasing Agent

July 14, 2023

Cameron Country CDJR  
2102 Thornton Street  
Cameron, TX. 76520  
Contacts: Averyt Knapp and Adrienne Gattis  
Phone Number: 979-567-6116  
E-mail: [averyt@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:averyt@caldwellcountry.com)  
[agattis@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:agattis@caldwellcountry.com)  
[ben@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:ben@caldwellcountry.com)

Re: BID NO. 2023-016 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with one (1) option to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of December 4, 2022 through December 3, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from December 4, 2023 through December 3, 2024.

☒ Yes, Cameron Country CDJR will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period. **Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.**

☐ No, Cameron Country CDJR will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? ☒ Yes ☐ No

If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

*Julie Nichols*

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer  
(P) 817.884.1133  
(F) 817.884.1133  
(E) [jmnichols@tarrantcountytexas.gov](mailto:jmnichols@tarrantcountytexas.gov)

*Averyt Knapp*

Name: Averyt Knapp  
Averyt Knapp  
(P) 979 567 1500  
(F) \_\_\_\_\_  
(E) averyt@caldwellcountry.com



**TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT**

100 E. Weatherford St. #303 • Fort Worth, TX 76196 • (817) 884-1414 • (817) 884-2629 (Fax)

Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.  
Purchasing Agent

Chris Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP  
Assistant Purchasing Agent

July 14, 2023

Sam Pack's Five Star Ford  
Vendor # 7001031  
6618 NE Loop 820  
North Richland Hills, TX. 76180  
Contacts: Odie Terry and Bobby Zelt  
Phone Number: 817-519-6821  
E-mail: [ar@5starford.com](mailto:ar@5starford.com)  
[Bzelt2@5starford.com](mailto:Bzelt2@5starford.com)

Re: BID NO. 2023-016 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with one (1) option to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of December 4, 2022 through December 3, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from December 4, 2023 through December 3, 2024.

☐ Yes, Sam Pack's Five Star Ford will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period. **Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.**

**xx** No, Sam Pack's Five Star Ford will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? ☐ Yes ☐ No

If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

*Julie Nichols*

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer  
(P) 817.884.1133  
(F) 817.884.1133  
(E) [jmnichols@tarrantcountytexas.gov](mailto:jmnichols@tarrantcountytexas.gov)

*Alan J Rosner - Fleet Director*

Name: Alan J Rosner \_\_\_\_\_  
(P) 214-837-3054 \_\_\_\_\_  
(F) \_\_\_\_\_  
(E) [alanr@spford.com](mailto:alanr@spford.com) \_\_\_\_\_



TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

100 E. Weatherford St. #303 • Fort Worth, TX 76196 • (817) 884-1414 • (817) 884-2629 (Fax)

Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.  
Purchasing Agent

Chris Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP  
Assistant Purchasing Agent

July 14, 2023

Caldwell Country Chevrolet  
Vendor # 7007452  
800 TX-21  
Caldwell, TX. 77836  
Contacts: Averyt Knapp and Adrienne Gattis  
Phone Number: 979-567-6116  
E-mail: [averyt@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:averyt@caldwellcountry.com)  
[agattis@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:agattis@caldwellcountry.com)  
[ben@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:ben@caldwellcountry.com)

Re: BID NO. 2023-016 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with one (1) option to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of December 4, 2022 through December 3, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from December 4, 2023 through December 3, 2024.

☒ Yes, Caldwell Country Chevrolet will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period. **Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.**

☐ No, Caldwell Country Chevrolet will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? ☒ Yes ☐ No  
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

*Julie Nichols*

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer  
(P) 817.884.1133  
(F) 817.884.1133  
(E) [jmnichols@tarrantcountytx.gov](mailto:jmnichols@tarrantcountytx.gov)

*Averyt Knapp*

Name: Averyt Knapp  
Averyt Knapp  
(P) 979 567 1500  
(F) —  
(E) [averyt@caldwellcountry.com](mailto:averyt@caldwellcountry.com)



July 14, 2023

Grapevine DCJ, LLC  
Vendor # 7010416  
2601 William D Tate Avenue  
Grapevine, TX. 76051  
Contacts: Dennis Thomas  
Phone Number: 817-410-7541  
E-mail: dthomas@grapevinedcj.com

Re: BID NO. 2023-016 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with one (1) option to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of December 4, 2022 through December 3, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from December 4, 2023 through December 3, 2024.

Yes, Grapevine DCJ, LLC will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period. **Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.**

No, Grapevine DCJ, LLC will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? Yes ☒ No  
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

*Julie Nichols*  
v SKIP v

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer  
(P) 817.884.1133  
(F) 817.884.1133  
(E) jmnichols@tarrantcountytexas.gov

*Police Charger discontinued  
1500 Special Service discontinued*

Name: *[Signature]*  
Dennis Thomas  
(P) *817-410-7541*  
(F) \_\_\_\_\_  
(E) *dthomas@grapevinedcj.com*



TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

100 E. Weatherford St. #303 • Fort Worth, TX 76196 • (817) 884-1414 • (817) 884-2629 (Fax)

Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.  
Purchasing Agent

Chris Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP  
Assistant Purchasing Agent

July 27, 2023

Holiday-Graham CDJR, LLC  
1609 Hwy 380 Bypass  
Graham, TX. 76450  
Contacts: Bryan Brooks  
Phone Number: 903-771-1960  
E-mail: bryan@holidayfleet.com

Re: BID NO. 2023-016 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with one (1) option to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of December 4, 2022 through December 3, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from December 4, 2023 through December 3, 2024.

☐ Yes, Holiday-Graham CDJR, LLC will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period. **Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.**

☒ No, Holiday-Graham CDJR, LLC will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? ☐ Yes ☐ No  
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

Julie Nichols

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer  
(P) 817.884.1133  
(F) 817.884.1133  
(E) jmnichols@tarrantcountytx.gov

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Bryan Brooks", written over a horizontal dashed line.

Name: Bryan Brooks  
Bryan Brooks  
(P) 903-771-1960  
(F) 903-564-6363  
(E) bryan@holidayfleet.com



TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

100 E. Weatherford St. #303 • Fort Worth, TX 76196 • (817) 884-1414 • (817) 884-2629 (Fax)

Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.  
Purchasing Agent

Chris Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP  
Assistant Purchasing Agent

July 27, 2023

Holiday Chevrolet  
Vendor # 7011320  
1009 Hwy 82 West  
Whitesboro, TX. 76273  
Contacts: Bryan Brooks  
Phone Number: 903-771-1960  
E-mail: bryan@holidayfleet.com

Re: BID NO. 2023-016 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with one (1) option to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of December 4, 2022 through December 3, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from December 4, 2023 through December 3, 2024.

☐ Yes, Holiday Chevrolet will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period. **Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.**

☒ No, Holiday Chevrolet will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? ☐ Yes ☐ No  
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

Julie Nichols

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer  
(P) 817.884.1133  
(F) 817.884.1133  
(E) jmnichols@tarrantcountytx.gov

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Bryan Brooks", written over a horizontal dashed line.

Name: Bryan Brooks  
Bryan Brooks  
(P) 903-771-1960  
(F) 903-564-6363  
(E) bryan@holidayfleet.com



**TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT**

**100 E. Weatherford St. #303 • Fort Worth, TX 76196 • (817) 884-1414 • (817) 884-2629 (Fax)**

**Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.**  
**Purchasing Agent**

**Chris Lax, CPSM, CPSP, CPCP**  
**Assistant Purchasing Agent**

July 27, 2023

Holiday Ford  
Vendor # 7010400  
1003 Hwy 82 West  
Whitesboro, TX. 76273  
Contacts: Bryan Brooks  
Phone Number: 903-771-1960  
E-mail: bryan@holidayfleet.com

Re: BID NO. 2023-016 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with one (1) option to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of December 4, 2022 through December 3, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from December 4, 2023 through December 3, 2024.

☐ Yes, Holiday Ford will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period. **Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.**

☒ No, Holiday Ford will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? ☐ Yes ☐ No  
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

*Julie Nichols*

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer  
(P) 817.884.1133  
(F) 817.884.1133  
(E) jmnichols@tarrantcountytx.gov

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Bryan Brooks", written over a horizontal dashed line.

Name: Bryan Brooks  
Bryan Brooks  
(P) 903-771-1960  
(F) 903-564-6363  
(E) bryan@holidayfleet.com



# Memorandum

To: Joylee Russell  
Dept.: Transportation  
From: Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department  
Date: July 11, 2023  
Re: BID 2023-016 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR THE PURCHASE OF POLICE  
PACKAGE VEHICLES

---

The above referenced contract will expire on 12/03/2023. This contract included options to renew with the vendor for one (1) additional twelve (12) month terms. The first and final renewal term will commence December 4, 2023 and would expire December 3, 2024.

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form **back to me on or before Friday, July 14, 2023.**

Rockdale Country Ford  
Cameron Country CDJR  
Sam Pack's Five Star Ford  
Caldwell Country Chevrolet  
Grapevine DCJ, LLC  
Holiday-Graham CDJR, LLC  
Holiday Chevrolet  
Holiday Ford

☒ Yes, I wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for the first and final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be provided below.

542310 / 45400 / 6840200000 / NGR

☐ No, I do not wish to continue the current contract with the above-mentioned vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

---

---

SIGNATURE:

DATE: 07-11-23

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

P = Primary	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
	Item	Price	Price
1	Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; RWD; 4-Door	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid
2	Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; RWD; 4-Door	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid
3	Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L; RWD; 4-Door	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Holiday Chevrolet Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday Ford Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC Graham, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
		Price			Price			Price		
1	Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; RWD; 4-Door		No Bid			No Bid		P \$	34,769.00	
	Year		No Bid			No Bid		2023		
	Make		No Bid			No Bid		Dodge		
	Model		No Bid			No Bid		Charger Pursuit		
	Engine		No Bid			No Bid		3.6L		
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid			No Bid		V6		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid			No Bid		90-120		
2	Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; RWD; 4-Door		No Bid			No Bid		P \$	35,321.00	
	Year		No Bid			No Bid		2023		
	Make		No Bid			No Bid		Dodge		
	Model		No Bid			No Bid		Charger Pursuit		
	Engine		No Bid			No Bid		5.5L		
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid			No Bid		V8		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid			No Bid		90-120		
3	Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L; RWD; 4-Door		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Year		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Make		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Model		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Engine		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
		Price		Price	
1	Dodge Sedan; 3.6L V6; RWD; 4-Door	No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid	
2	Dodge Sedan; 5.7L V8; RWD; 4-Door	No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid	
3	Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L; RWD; 4-Door	No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid	

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

P = Primary	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
	Item	Price	Price
4	Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 4WD; Super Crew	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days	No Bid	No Bid
	A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid
5	Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; AWD; 5-Door	P \$ 44,575.00	P \$ 40,470.00
	Year	2023-2024	2023
	Make	Dodge	Dodge
	Model	WDDE75	Durango Police
	Engine	3.6L	3.6L
	Engine Cylinder	V6	V6
	Number of Delivery Days		
	A.R.O	360	90-240
6	Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; AWD; 5-Door	P \$ 46,990.00	P \$ 43,193.00
	Year	2023-2024	2023
	Make	Dodge	Dodge
	Model	WDDE75	Durango Police
	Engine	5.7L	5.7L
	Engine Cylinder	V8	V8
	Number of Delivery Days		
	A.R.O	360	90-240

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Holiday Chevrolet Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Holiday Ford Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC Graham, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Item	Price		Price
4	Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 4WD; Super Crew	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid
5	Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; AWD; 5-Door	No Bid	P \$ 38,087.00
	Year	No Bid	2023
	Make	No Bid	Dodge
	Model	No Bid	Durango Pursuit
	Engine	No Bid	3.6L
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	V6
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	90-120
6	Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; AWD; 5-Door	No Bid	P \$ 41,193.00
	Year	No Bid	2023
	Make	No Bid	Dodge
	Model	No Bid	Durango Pursuit
	Engine	No Bid	3.6L
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	V6
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	90-120

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Price			Price
		P	\$	P	
4	Ford Pickup Truck; 3.5L; 4WD; Super Crew				41,790.00
	Year		2023-2024		2023
	Make		Ford		Ford
	Model		W1P		F-150 Responder
	Engine		3.5L		3.5L GTDI
	Engine Cylinder		V6		V6
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		360		120
5	Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; AWD; 5-Door		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid		No Bid
6	Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; AWD; 5-Door		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid		No Bid
		Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

P = Primary	Item	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
		Price		Price		Price	
7	Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; AWD; 5-Door	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
8	Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; AWD; 5-Door	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
9	Ford Explorer; 3.0L V6; AWD; 5-Door	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	



RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Holiday Chevrolet Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday Ford Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC Graham, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
		Price			Price			Price		
7	Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; AWD; 5-Door	No Bid			P \$	45,217.00		No Bid		
	Year	No Bid			2023			No Bid		
	Make	No Bid			Ford			No Bid		
	Model	No Bid			Police Interceptor			No Bid		
	Engine	No Bid			3.3L Hybrid			No Bid		
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid			V6			No Bid		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid			90-120			No Bid		
8	Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; AWD; 5-Door	No Bid			P \$	42,691.00		No Bid		
	Year	No Bid			2023			No Bid		
	Make	No Bid			Ford			No Bid		
	Model	No Bid			Police Interceptor			No Bid		
	Engine	No Bid			3.3L FFV			No Bid		
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid			V6			No Bid		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid			90-120			No Bid		
9	Ford Explorer; 3.0L V6; AWD; 5-Door	No Bid			P \$	46,065.00		No Bid		
	Year	No Bid			2023			No Bid		
	Make	No Bid			Ford			No Bid		
	Model	No Bid			Police Interceptor			No Bid		
	Engine	No Bid			3.0L EcoBoost			No Bid		
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid			V6			No Bid		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid			90-120			No Bid		

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes				Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			
		Price				Price			
7	Ford Hybrid Explorer; 3.3L; AWD; 5-Door	P	\$	49,970.00	P	\$	45,269.00		
	Year			2023-2024			2023		
	Make			Ford			Ford		
	Model			K8A-99W			Police Interceptor		
	Engine			3.3L HYBRID			3.3L HYBRID		
	Engine Cylinder			V6			V6		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O			360			180		
8	Ford Explorer; 3.3L V6 FFV; AWD; 5-Door	P	\$	47,225.00	P	\$	41,243.00		
	Year			2023-2024			2023		
	Make			Ford			Ford		
	Model			K8A-99B			Police Interceptor		
	Engine			3.3L HYBRID			3.3L TI-VCT		
	Engine Cylinder			V6			V6		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O			360			180		
9	Ford Explorer; 3.0L V6; AWD; 5-Door	P	\$	50,885.00	P	\$	45,717.00		
	Year			2023-2024			2023		
	Make			Ford			Ford		
	Model			K8A-99C			Police Interceptor		
	Engine			3.0L			3.0L Eco-Boost		
	Engine Cylinder			V6			V6		
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O			360			180		

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

P = Primary	Item	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
		P	\$	Price			Price			Price
10	Chevrolet Tahoe, 5.3L V8, 2WD; 5-Door	P		46,775.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		2023-2024			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		Chevrolet			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		CC10706 9C1			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		5.3L			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		V8			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days		360			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
11	Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door	P		49,775.00		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		2023-2024			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		Chevrolet			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		CK10706 9C1			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		5.3L			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		V8			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days		360			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
12	Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L PHEV; FWD; 4-Door		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Holiday Chevrolet Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday Ford Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC Graham, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
		P	\$	Price		Price		Price		
10	Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8, 2WD; 5-Door			37,686.00		No Bid		No Bid		
	Year		2023			No Bid		No Bid		
	Make		Chevrolet			No Bid		No Bid		
	Model		Tahoe 9C1 PPV			No Bid		No Bid		
	Engine		5.3L			No Bid		No Bid		
	Engine Cylinder		V8			No Bid		No Bid		
11	Number of Delivery Days		90-120			No Bid		No Bid		
	A.R.O					No Bid		No Bid		
	Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door	P	\$	40,347.00		No Bid		No Bid		
	Year		2023			No Bid		No Bid		
	Make		Chevrolet			No Bid		No Bid		
	Model		Tahoe 9C1 PPV			No Bid		No Bid		
12	Engine		5.3L			No Bid		No Bid		
	Engine Cylinder		V8			No Bid		No Bid		
	Number of Delivery Days		90-120			No Bid		No Bid		
	A.R.O					No Bid		No Bid		
	Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L PHEV; FWD; 4-Door		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Year		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
12	Make		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Model		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Engine		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	Number of Delivery Days		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		
	A.R.O		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid		

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
		Price		Price	
10	Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8, 2WD; 5-Door		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days		No Bid		No Bid
11	A.R.O		No Bid		No Bid
	Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid		No Bid
12	Number of Delivery Days		No Bid		No Bid
	A.R.O		No Bid		No Bid
	Ford Hybrid Sedan; 2.0L PHEV; FWD; 4-Door		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days		No Bid		No Bid
	A.R.O		No Bid		No Bid

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

P = Primary	Item	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
		P	\$	P	\$	P	\$
13	Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab		44,940.00				
	Year		2023-2024				
	Make		Chevrolet				
	Model		CC10543 5W4				
	Engine		5.3L				
	Engine Cylinder		V8				
14	Number of Delivery Days		360				
	A.R.O						
	Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab	P	\$ 51,570.00				
	Year		2023-2024				
	Make		Chevrolet				
	Model		Ck10543 9C1				
15	Engine		5.3L				
	Engine Cylinder		V8				
	Number of Delivery Days		360				
	A.R.O						
	Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; Crew Cab		No Bid				
	Year		No Bid				
	Make		No Bid				
	Model		No Bid				
	Engine		No Bid				
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid				
	Number of Delivery Days		No Bid				
	A.R.O		No Bid				

	Holiday Chevrolet Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Holiday Ford Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC Graham, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Item	Price	Price	Price
13	Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid
14	Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid
15	Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; Crew Cab	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
		Price		Price	
13	Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid		No Bid
14	Chevrolet 1/2 Ton; 5.3L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab		No Bid		No Bid
	Year		No Bid		No Bid
	Make		No Bid		No Bid
	Model		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine		No Bid		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid		No Bid
15	Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 2WD; Crew Cab	P	\$ 46,955.00		No Bid
	Year		2023-2024		No Bid
	Make		Ford		No Bid
	Model		W1S-SSV		No Bid
	Engine		3.5L		No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		V6		No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		360		No Bid



# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

P = Primary	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
	Item	Price	Price	Price	Price	Price
16	Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; Crew Cab	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Number of Delivery Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Engine	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
19	Make	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Holiday Chevrolet Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday Ford Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC Graham, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
		Price			Price			Price		
16	Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; Crew Cab		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Year		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Make		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Model		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Engine		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
17	Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Year		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Make		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Model		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Engine		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
18	Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Year		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Make		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Model		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Engine		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

		Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
	Item	Price			Price		
		P	\$		P	\$	
16	Ford F150; 3.5L V6; 4WD; Crew Cab			50,770.00			45,900.00
	Year		2023-2024			2023	
	Make		Ford			Ford	
	Model		W1P-PPV			W1E	
	Engine		3.5L			3.5L GTDI	
	Engine Cylinder		V6			V6	
17	Number of Delivery Days		360			180	
	A.R.O						
	Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 2WD; Crew Cab	P	\$	46,915.00	P	\$	42,900.00
	Year		2023-2024			2023	
	Make		Ford			Ford	
	Model		W1S-SSV			W1C	
18	Engine		5.0L			5.0L	
	Engine Cylinder		V8			V8	
	Number of Delivery Days		360			180	
	A.R.O						
	Ford F150; 5.0L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab	P	\$	49,925.00	P	\$	48,750.00
	Year		2023-2024			2023	
	Make		Ford			Ford	
	Model		W1T-SSV			W1E	
	Engine		5.0L			V8	
	Engine Cylinder		V8			5.0L	
	Number of Delivery Days		360			180	
	A.R.O						

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	P = Primary	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Item	Price	Price	Price	Price
19	Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab	No Bid	P \$ 47,735.00	P \$ 38,920.00
	Year	No Bid	2023-2024	2023
	Make	No Bid	RAM	RAM
	Model	No Bid	DS6T98 SSV	1500 SSV
	Engine	No Bid	5.7L	5.7L
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	V8	V8
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	360	90-240
20	Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; RWD; 5-Door	No Bid	P \$ 45,950.00	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	2023-2024	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	Dodge	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	WDEE75 PPV	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	3.6L	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	V6	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	360	No Bid
21	Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; RWD; 5-Door	No Bid	P \$ 47,975.00	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	2023-2024	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	Dodge	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	WDEE75 PPV	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	5.7L	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	V8	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	360	No Bid

	Holiday Chevrolet Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Holiday Ford Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC Graham, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
Item	Price	Price	Price
19	Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab	No Bid	P \$ 36,420.00
	Year	No Bid	2023
	Make	No Bid	Ram
	Model	No Bid	1500 SSV
	Engine	No Bid	5.7L
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	V8
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	90-120
20	Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; RWD; 5-Door	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid
21	Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; RWD; 5-Door	No Bid	No Bid
	Year	No Bid	No Bid
	Make	No Bid	No Bid
	Model	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid	No Bid

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
		Price		Price	
19	Ram 1500; 5.7L V8; 4WD; Crew Cab	No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid	
20	Dodge Durango; 3.6L V6; RWD; 5-Door	No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid	
21	Dodge Durango; 5.7L V8; RWD; 5-Door	No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid	

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

P = Primary	Item	Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Cameron Country CDJR Caldwell, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Grapevine DCJ, LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
		P	\$	Price	Price	Price	Price
22	Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door			52,275.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Year		2023-2024		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Make		Chevrolet		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Model		CK10706 5W4		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine		5.3L		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		V8		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		360		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; RWD; 5-Door		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Year		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Make		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Model		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 5-Door		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Year		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Make		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Model		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Notes: There are no awards for items 3 & 12 because no bids were received.

# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Holiday Chevrolet Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday Ford Whitesboro, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Holiday -Graham CDJR, LLC Graham, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
		P	\$	Price	Price			Price		
22	Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door			39,789.00			No Bid			No Bid
	Year		2023				No Bid			No Bid
	Make		Chevrolet				No Bid			No Bid
	Model		Tahoe 5W4 SSV				No Bid			No Bid
	Engine		5.3L				No Bid			No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		V8				No Bid			No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		90-120				No Bid			No Bid
23	Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; RWD; 5-Door		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Year		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Make		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Model		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Engine		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
24	Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 5-Door		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Year		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Make		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Model		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Engine		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Engine Cylinder		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O		No Bid				No Bid			No Bid

Notes: There are no awards for items 3 & 12 because no bids were received.



# RFB 2023-016 Annual Contract for Police Package Vehicles

	Item	Rockdale Country Ford Rockdale, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Sam Pack Five Star Ford LTD Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
		Price		Price	
22	Chevrolet Tahoe; 5.3L V8; 4WD; 5-Door	No Bid		No Bid	
	Year	No Bid		No Bid	
	Make	No Bid		No Bid	
	Model	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine	No Bid		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	No Bid		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	No Bid		No Bid	
23	Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; RWD; 5-Door	P \$ 54,220.00		No Bid	
	Year	2023-2024		No Bid	
	Make	Ford		No Bid	
	Model	K1F-SSV		No Bid	
	Engine	3.5L		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	V6		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	360		No Bid	
24	Ford Expedition Max; 3.5L V6; 4WD; 5-Door	P \$ 57,785.00		No Bid	
	Year	2023-2024		No Bid	
	Make	Ford		No Bid	
	Model	K1G-SSV		No Bid	
	Engine	3.5L		No Bid	
	Engine Cylinder	V6		No Bid	
	Number of Delivery Days A.R.O	360		No Bid	

Notes: There are no awards for items 3 & 12 because no bids were received.