
Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

A #1993 Denim Jeans, Sizes 
28-42 117 26.92$          3,149.64$     27.50$           3,217.50$      22.40$            2,620.80$       

B #1994 Denim Jeans, Sizes 
28-42 38 25.00$          950.00$        26.00$           988.00$         22.40$            851.20$          

C #43214 Cargo Shorts, 
Sizes 28-42 10 20.00$          200.00$        26.00$           260.00$         26.98$            269.80$          

D #85283 Work Pants, Sizes 
28-42 39 22.68$          884.52$        27.00$           1,053.00$      29.27$            1,141.53$       

E #874 Work Pants, Sizes 
28-42 43 24.17$          1,039.31$     26.00$           1,118.00$      25.80$            1,109.40$       

F #LD200 Denim Jeans, 
Sizes 28-42 13 21.16$          275.08$        25.20$           327.60$         23.23$            301.99$          

G #LS516 SS Performance 
Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 22.50$          225.00$        25.00$           250.00$         20.73$            207.30$          

H #TJ350 Hooded Jacket, 
Sizes S-XL 10 35.00$          350.00$        60.00$           600.00$         53.67$            536.70$          

I #XD730 Denim Jeans, 
Sizes 28-42 28 12.00$          336.00$        37.00$           1,036.00$      19.43$            544.04$          

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted Dickies 
Garments 10% 30% 25%

DICKIES BRANDED GARMENTS

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

A #1993 Denim Jeans, Sizes 
28-42 117 34.19$            4,000.23$       

B #1994 Denim Jeans, Sizes 
28-42 38 90.00$            3,420.00$       

C #43214 Cargo Shorts, 
Sizes 28-42 10 22.49$            224.90$          

D #85283 Work Pants, Sizes 
28-42 39 26.99$            1,052.61$       

E #874 Work Pants, Sizes 
28-42 43 32.39$            1,392.77$       

F #LD200 Denim Jeans, 
Sizes 28-42 13 28.76$            373.88$          

G #LS516 SS Performance 
Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 35.99$            359.90$          

H #TJ350 Hooded Jacket, 
Sizes S-XL 10 670.00$          70.19$            701.90$          

I #XD730 Denim Jeans, 
Sizes 28-42 28 756.00$          35.99$            1,007.72$       

67.00$             

27.00$             

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid15%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

10%Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted Dickies 
Garments

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

DICKIES BRANDED GARMENTS

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

A #1993 Denim Jeans, Sizes 
28-42 117 3,744.00$       29.74$            3,479.58$       

B #1994 Denim Jeans, Sizes 
28-42 38 1,216.00$       29.74$            1,130.12$       

C #43214 Cargo Shorts, 
Sizes 28-42 10 320.00$          21.24$            212.40$          

D #85283 Work Pants, Sizes 
28-42 39 1,248.00$       29.74$            1,159.86$       

E #874 Work Pants, Sizes 
28-42 43 1,376.00$       25.49$            1,096.07$       

F #LD200 Denim Jeans, 
Sizes 28-42 13 416.00$          29.74$            386.62$          

G #LS516 SS Performance 
Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 340.00$          25.49$            254.90$          

H #TJ350 Hooded Jacket, 
Sizes S-XL 10 820.00$          63.74$            637.40$          

I #XD730 Denim Jeans, 
Sizes 28-42 28 33.99$            951.72$          

32.00$             

34.00$             

32.00$             

32.00$             

32.00$             

32.00$             

32.00$             

82.00$             

No Bid

20%

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted Dickies 
Garments 15%

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

DICKIES BRANDED GARMENTS

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

A #7502 Scrub V-Neck Top, 
Sizes S-XL 10 11.00$          110.00$        12.33$           123.30$         14.83$            148.30$          

B #7602 Scrub Drawstring 
Pant, Sizes S-XL 10 11.00$          110.00$        13.33$           133.30$         23.91$            239.10$          

C #83221 Women's Cargo 
Pant, Sizes S-XL 10 12.00$          120.00$        11.33$           113.30$         13.13$            131.30$          

D #8555 Men's Cargo Pant, 
Sizes S-XL 44 12.00$          528.00$        19.00$           836.00$         23.26$            1,023.44$       

A #112 Trucker Hat 78 8.80$            686.40$        7.99$             623.22$         5.00$              390.00$          

A #CTK122 Hooded 
Sweatshirt, Sizes S-XL 27 41.40$          1,117.80$     41.25$           1,113.75$      52.77$            1,424.79$       

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS

RICHARDSON BRANDED GARMENTS

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted 
Richardson Garments 10% 30% 25%

LANDAU BRANDED GARMENTS

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted Landau 
Garments 10% 30% 25%



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

A #7502 Scrub V-Neck Top, 
Sizes S-XL 10 200.00$          171.00$          17.09$            170.90$          

B #7602 Scrub Drawstring 
Pant, Sizes S-XL 10 220.00$          180.00$          8.98$              89.80$            

C #83221 Women's Cargo 
Pant, Sizes S-XL 10 183.00$          161.50$          15.27$            152.70$          

D #8555 Men's Cargo Pant, 
Sizes S-XL 44 1,331.00$       1,148.40$       26.09$            1,147.96$       

A #112 Trucker Hat 78 702.00$          7.82$              609.96$          

A #CTK122 Hooded 
Sweatshirt, Sizes S-XL 27 1,478.25$       1,863.00$       101.93$          2,752.11$       

No Bid

No Bid

9.00$               

15%

20.00$             

22.00$             

18.30$             

30.25$             

10%

17.10$             

26.10$             

16.15$             

18.00$             

5%

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS

54.75$             69.00$             

10%

RICHARDSON BRANDED GARMENTS

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted 
Richardson Garments

10%

LANDAU BRANDED GARMENTS

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted Landau 
Garments



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

A #7502 Scrub V-Neck Top, 
Sizes S-XL 10 200.00$          17.08$            170.80$          

B #7602 Scrub Drawstring 
Pant, Sizes S-XL 10 170.00$          17.98$            179.80$          

C #83221 Women's Cargo 
Pant, Sizes S-XL 10 200.00$          15.28$            152.80$          

D #8555 Men's Cargo Pant, 
Sizes S-XL 44 1,012.00$       26.08$            1,147.52$       

A #112 Trucker Hat 78 1,014.00$       10.19$            794.82$          

A #CTK122 Hooded 
Sweatshirt, Sizes S-XL 27 1,458.00$       46.75$            1,262.25$       

13.00$             

20%

23.00$             

20.00$             

17.00$             

20.00$             

20%

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS

54.00$             

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted 
Richardson Garments 15%

RICHARDSON BRANDED GARMENTS

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted Landau 
Garments 15%

LANDAU BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

B #CTSJ140 Active Jacket, 
Sizes S-XL 13 84.00$          1,092.00$     82.50$           1,072.50$      97.31$            1,265.03$       

C #2200 Tank Top, Sizes S-
XL 10 4.12$            41.20$          5.75$             57.50$           7.27$              72.70$            

D #2300 T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 123 5.00$            615.00$        8.00$             984.00$         9.03$              1,110.69$       

E #2300 T-Shirt, Size 2XL 10 6.00$            60.00$          10.00$           100.00$         9.03$              90.30$            

F #4200 Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 2.95$            29.50$          6.00$             60.00$           4.51$              45.10$            

G #5190 T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 17 6.88$            116.96$        9.50$             161.50$         10.27$            174.59$          

H #5190 T-Shirt, Size 2XL 10 7.88$            78.80$          11.50$           115.00$         10.27$            102.70$          

I #5250 T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 2.77$            27.70$          4.57$             45.70$           5.30$              53.00$            

J #29LS T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 120 4.52$            542.40$        8.39$             1,006.80$      8.09$              970.80$          

K #29MR T-Shirt, Sizes S-
XL 113 2.85$            322.05$        4.57$             516.41$         4.81$              543.53$          

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

B #CTSJ140 Active Jacket, 
Sizes S-XL 13 1,293.50$       1,755.00$       57.38$            745.94$          

C #2200 Tank Top, Sizes S-
XL 10 62.50$            95.00$            4.61$              46.10$            

D #2300 T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 123 1,020.90$       1,476.00$       5.98$              735.54$          

E #2300 T-Shirt, Size 2XL 10 109.00$          150.00$          5.98$              59.80$            

F #4200 Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 66.00$            140.00$          3.92$              39.20$            

G #5190 T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 17 170.00$          255.00$          7.99$              135.83$          

H #5190 T-Shirt, Size 2XL 10 120.00$          170.00$          7.99$              79.90$            

I #5250 T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 50.00$            85.00$            3.78$              37.80$            

J #29LS T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 120 1,044.00$       1,620.00$       6.18$              741.60$          

K #29MR T-Shirt, Sizes S-
XL 113 565.00$          960.50$          3.78$              427.14$          

15.00$             

12.00$             

9.50$               

135.00$           

10.90$             

8.30$               

6.25$               

99.50$             

8.50$               

13.50$             

8.50$               

17.00$             

15.00$             

14.00$             

5.00$               

8.70$               

5.00$               

12.00$             

10.00$             

6.60$               

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

B #CTSJ140 Active Jacket, 
Sizes S-XL 13 1,235.00$       93.50$            1,215.50$       

C #2200 Tank Top, Sizes S-
XL 10 62.50$            7.01$              70.10$            

D #2300 T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 123 953.25$          9.58$              1,178.34$       

E #2300 T-Shirt, Size 2XL 10 63.50$            12.69$            126.90$          

F #4200 Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 94.50$            7.39$              73.90$            

G #5190 T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 17 148.75$          11.69$            198.73$          

H #5190 T-Shirt, Size 2XL 10 102.50$          13.99$            139.90$          

I #5250 T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 52.50$            5.44$              54.40$            

J #29LS T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 120 786.00$          9.97$              1,196.40$       

K #29MR T-Shirt, Sizes S-
XL 113 559.35$          4.21$              475.73$          

9.45$               

6.35$               

7.75$               

6.25$               

95.00$             

4.95$               

6.55$               

5.25$               

10.25$             

8.75$               

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

L #29MP T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 5.50$            55.00$          5.50$             55.00$           8.60$              86.00$            

M #29MP T-Shirt, Sizes 2XL 10 8.50$            85.00$          8.25$             82.50$           8.60$              86.00$            

N #436MP Sport Shirt, Sizes 
S-XL 28 10.75$          301.00$        8.56$             239.68$         11.90$            333.20$          

O #PC61P Pocket Tee, Size 
S-XL 186 6.11$            1,136.46$     7.29$             1,355.94$      7.61$              1,415.46$       

P #PC61PT Tall Tee, Size 
2XL 180 9.12$            1,641.60$     10.17$           1,830.60$      7.61$              1,369.80$       

Q #PC61PT Tall Tee, Size 
3XL 10 10.12$          101.20$        11.77$           117.70$         7.61$              76.10$            

R #PC61PT Tall Tee, Size 
3XL 10 10.62$          106.20$        11.77$           117.70$         7.61$              76.10$            

S #C112 Trucker Cap 118 4.00$            472.00$        4.70$             554.60$         5.00$              590.00$          

T #C911 Mesh Back Cap 12 3.10$            37.20$          4.13$             49.56$           3.93$              47.16$            

U #K500P Polo, Sizes S-XL 28 13.42$          375.76$        14.99$           419.72$         16.44$            460.32$          

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

L #29MP T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 80.00$            130.00$          5.85$              58.50$            

M #29MP T-Shirt, Sizes 2XL 10 120.00$          160.00$          5.85$              58.50$            

N #436MP Sport Shirt, Sizes 
S-XL 28 343.00$          476.00$          9.50$              266.00$          

O #PC61P Pocket Tee, Size 
S-XL 186 1,227.60$       2,232.00$       5.49$              1,021.14$       

P #PC61PT Tall Tee, Size 
2XL 180 1,791.00$       2,880.00$       5.49$              988.20$          

Q #PC61PT Tall Tee, Size 
3XL 10 105.00$          180.00$          7.31$              73.10$            

R #PC61PT Tall Tee, Size 
3XL 10 105.00$          180.00$          8.32$              83.20$            

S #C112 Trucker Cap 118 601.80$          1,003.00$       3.86$              455.48$          

T #C911 Mesh Back Cap 12 57.00$            94.20$            3.50$              42.00$            

U #K500P Polo, Sizes S-XL 28 420.00$          574.00$          11.24$            314.72$          

12.00$             

17.00$             

16.00$             

13.00$             

20.50$             

7.85$               

8.50$               

18.00$             

18.00$             

16.00$             

15.00$             

4.75$               

5.10$               

10.50$             

10.50$             

9.95$               

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS

6.60$               

12.25$             

12.00$             

8.00$               



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

L #29MP T-Shirt, Sizes S-XL 10 69.50$            9.35$              93.50$            

M #29MP T-Shirt, Sizes 2XL 10 85.50$            14.02$            140.20$          

N #436MP Sport Shirt, Sizes 
S-XL 28 295.40$          14.55$            407.40$          

O #PC61P Pocket Tee, Size 
S-XL 186 1,348.50$       8.67$              1,612.62$       

P #PC61PT Tall Tee, Size 
2XL 180 1,539.00$       12.10$            2,178.00$       

Q #PC61PT Tall Tee, Size 
3XL 10 97.50$            14.01$            140.10$          

R #PC61PT Tall Tee, Size 
3XL 10 97.50$            14.01$            140.10$          

S #C112 Trucker Cap 118 1,091.50$       5.30$              625.40$          

T #C911 Mesh Back Cap 12 114.00$          4.91$              58.92$            

U #K500P Polo, Sizes S-XL 28 539.00$          17.83$            499.24$          

7.25$               

10.55$             

8.55$               

6.95$               

19.25$             

9.50$               

9.25$               

9.75$               

9.75$               

8.55$               

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

V #K525 Polo, Sizes S-XL 498 14.50$          7,221.00$     19.27$           9,596.46$      21.43$            10,672.14$     

W #K567 Polo, Sizes S-XL 22 7.96$            175.12$        14.27$           313.94$         12.80$            281.60$          

X #L525 Polo, Sizes S-XL 10 16.86$          168.60$        19.27$           192.70$         20.67$            206.70$          

Y #S608 Shirt, Sizes S-XL 30 17.26$          517.80$        19.27$           578.10$         22.42$            672.60$          

Z #PT88 Cargo Pant, Sizes 
S-XL 18 21.57$          388.26$        24.65$           443.70$         47.29$            851.22$          

AA #SP14-SOLID Work Shirt, 
Sizes S-XL 10 13.64$          136.40$        24.65$           246.50$         14.94$            149.40$          

BB #SP24-SOLID Work Shirt, 
Sizes S-XL 42 11.38$          477.96$        11.44$           480.48$         14.19$            595.98$          

CC #JST72 Wind Shirt, Sizes 
S-XL 30 14.43$          432.90$        18.56$           556.80$         18.69$            560.70$          

DD #JST72 Wind Shirt, Size 
2XL 10 16.18$          161.80$        19.99$           199.90$         18.69$            186.90$          

EE #LST650 Polo, Sizes S-XL 71 15.80$          1,121.80$     16.01$           1,136.71$      16.44$            1,167.24$       

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

V #K525 Polo, Sizes S-XL 498 9,586.50$       12,699.00$     15.74$            7,838.52$       

W #K567 Polo, Sizes S-XL 22 319.00$          385.00$          7.16$              157.52$          

X #L525 Polo, Sizes S-XL 10 192.50$          255.00$          15.74$            157.40$          

Y #S608 Shirt, Sizes S-XL 30 577.50$          765.00$          15.74$            472.20$          

Z #PT88 Cargo Pant, Sizes 
S-XL 18 486.00$          711.00$          22.04$            396.72$          

AA #SP14-SOLID Work Shirt, 
Sizes S-XL 10 153.00$          225.00$          12.59$            125.90$          

BB #SP24-SOLID Work Shirt, 
Sizes S-XL 42 585.90$          861.00$          11.24$            472.08$          

CC #JST72 Wind Shirt, Sizes 
S-XL 30 562.50$          765.00$          13.49$            404.70$          

DD #JST72 Wind Shirt, Size 
2XL 10 202.00$          275.00$          14.39$            143.90$          

EE #LST650 Polo, Sizes S-XL 71 1,153.75$       1,526.50$       11.89$            844.19$          

19.25$             

19.25$             

14.50$             

19.25$             

25.50$             

25.50$             

17.50$             

25.50$             

16.25$             

20.20$             

18.75$             

13.95$             

15.30$             

27.00$             

21.50$             

27.50$             

25.50$             

20.50$             

22.50$             

39.50$             

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

V #K525 Polo, Sizes S-XL 498 11,080.50$     22.93$            11,419.14$     

W #K567 Polo, Sizes S-XL 22 412.50$          16.98$            373.56$          

X #L525 Polo, Sizes S-XL 10 222.50$          22.93$            229.30$          

Y #S608 Shirt, Sizes S-XL 30 667.50$          22.93$            687.90$          

Z #PT88 Cargo Pant, Sizes 
S-XL 18 540.00$          34.83$            626.94$          

AA #SP14-SOLID Work Shirt, 
Sizes S-XL 10 200.00$          20.38$            203.80$          

BB #SP24-SOLID Work Shirt, 
Sizes S-XL 42 808.50$          17.83$            748.86$          

CC #JST72 Wind Shirt, Sizes 
S-XL 30 480.00$          22.08$            662.40$          

DD #JST72 Wind Shirt, Size 
2XL 10 180.00$          23.78$            237.80$          

EE #LST650 Polo, Sizes S-XL 71 1,420.00$       19.05$            1,352.55$       

22.25$             

22.25$             

18.75$             

22.25$             

20.00$             

18.00$             

16.00$             

19.25$             

20.00$             

30.00$             

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

FF #ST650 Polo, Sizes S-XL 114 15.80$          1,801.20$     16.01$           1,825.14$      16.44$            1,874.16$       

GG #T474 Polo, Sizes S-XL 117 15.00$          1,755.00$     19.27$           2,254.59$      22.18$            2,595.06$       

HH #CSJ501 Jacket, Sizes S-
XL 10 58.22$          582.20$        74.27$           742.70$         71.90$            719.00$          

II #CSJ501 Jacket, Sizes 
2XL-3XL 10 60.50$          605.00$        78.56$           785.60$         71.90$            719.00$          

JJ #CSJ503 Jacket, Sizes S-
XL 10 38.86$          388.60$        51.41$           514.10$         48.84$            488.40$          

KK #CSJ503 Jacket, Sizes 
2XL-3XL 10 42.10$          421.00$        55.70$           557.00$         48.84$            488.40$          

A #00096 Pants, Sizes 28-
42 41 22.50$          922.50$        29.33$           1,202.53$      40.00$            1,640.00$       

B #13MWZ Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 86 24.00$          2,064.00$     26.33$           2,264.38$      32.02$            2,753.72$       

WRANGLER BRANDED GARMENTS

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted SanMar 
Garments 10% 30% 25%



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

FF #ST650 Polo, Sizes S-XL 114 1,852.50$       2,451.00$       11.89$            1,355.46$       

GG #T474 Polo, Sizes S-XL 117 2,275.65$       3,100.50$       15.74$            1,841.58$       

HH #CSJ501 Jacket, Sizes S-
XL 10 730.00$          995.00$          50.39$            503.90$          

II #CSJ501 Jacket, Sizes 
2XL-3XL 10 760.00$          1,055.00$       53.09$            530.90$          

JJ #CSJ503 Jacket, Sizes S-
XL 10 510.00$          675.00$          35.99$            359.90$          

KK #CSJ503 Jacket, Sizes S-
XL 10 530.00$          725.00$          38.69$            386.90$          

A #00096 Pants, Sizes 28-
42 41 1,312.00$       36.00$            1,476.00$       

B #13MWZ Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 86 3,268.00$       35.10$            3,018.60$       38.00$             

32.00$             No Bid

No Bid

16.25$             

67.50$             

105.50$           

99.50$             

26.50$             

21.50$             

72.50$             53.00$             

51.00$             

76.00$             

73.00$             

19.45$             

10%

WRANGLER BRANDED GARMENTS

18% 5%

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted SanMar 
Garments



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

FF #ST650 Polo, Sizes S-XL 114 2,280.00$       19.05$            2,171.70$       

GG #T474 Polo, Sizes S-XL 117 2,603.25$       22.93$            2,682.81$       

HH #CSJ501 Jacket, Sizes S-
XL 10 750.00$          88.38$            883.80$          

II #CSJ501 Jacket, Sizes 
2XL-3XL 10 780.00$          93.48$            934.80$          

JJ #CSJ503 Jacket, Sizes S-
XL 10 550.00$          61.18$            611.80$          

KK #CSJ503 Jacket, Sizes S-
XL 10 580.00$          66.28$            662.80$          

A #00096 Pants, Sizes 28-
42 41 1,476.00$       36.00$            1,476.00$       

B #13MWZ Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 86 3,870.00$       36.00$            3,096.00$       

20%

45.00$             

36.00$             

58.00$             

55.00$             

78.00$             

75.00$             

22.25$             

20.00$             

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted SanMar 
Garments 15%

WRANGLER BRANDED GARMENTS

SANMAR BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

C #13MWZ Jeans, Sizes 44-
54 10 24.92$          249.20$        28.00$           280.00$         32.02$            320.20$          

D #22MWX Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 29 30.00$          870.00$        40.00$           1,160.00$      48.65$            1,410.85$       

E #31MWZ Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 118 24.00$          2,832.00$     26.33$           3,106.94$      42.22$            4,981.96$       

F #35001 Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 65 21.00$          1,365.00$     24.00$           1,560.00$      28.40$            1,846.00$       

G #35001 Jeans, Sizes 44-
54 10 25.30$          253.00$        26.67$           266.70$         28.40$            284.00$          

H #47MWZ Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 37 22.68$          839.16$        27.00$           999.00$         32.02$            1,184.74$       

I #70127 Denim Shirt, Sizes 
15-18 83 21.50$          1,784.50$     26.00$           2,158.00$      39.00$            3,237.00$       

J #70127 Denim Shirt, Sizes 
18.5-20 10 23.40$          234.00$        26.67$           266.70$         39.00$            390.00$          

K #70136 Chambray Shirt, 
Sizes 15-18 49 20.50$          1,004.50$     24.67$           1,208.83$      33.12$            1,622.88$       

L #70136 Chambray Shirt, 
Sizes 18.5-20 10 23.40$          234.00$        26.67$           266.70$         33.12$            331.20$          

WRANGLER BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

C #13MWZ Jeans, Sizes 44-
54 10 410.00$          35.10$            351.00$          

D #22MWX Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 29 1,247.00$       53.10$            1,539.90$       

E #31MWZ Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 118 5,310.00$       49.49$            5,839.82$       

F #35001 Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 65 1,755.00$       35.99$            2,339.35$       

G #35001 Jeans, Sizes 44-
54 10 330.00$          35.99$            359.90$          

H #47MWZ Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 37 1,480.00$       39.60$            1,465.20$       

I #70127 Denim Shirt, Sizes 
15-18 83 2,407.00$       35.10$            2,913.30$       

J #70127 Denim Shirt, Sizes 
18.5-20 10 300.00$          35.10$            351.00$          

K #70136 Chambray Shirt, 
Sizes 15-18 49 1,372.00$       33.29$            1,631.21$       

L #70136 Chambray Shirt, 
Sizes 18.5-20 10 300.00$          33.29$            332.90$          

45.00$             

43.00$             

41.00$             No Bid

No Bid

28.00$             

30.00$             

29.00$             

40.00$             

33.00$             

27.00$             

30.00$             No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

WRANGLER BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

C #13MWZ Jeans, Sizes 44-
54 10 480.00$          49.49$            494.90$          

D #22MWX Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 29 53.10$            1,539.90$       

E #31MWZ Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 118 3,540.00$       49.49$            5,839.82$       

F #35001 Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 65 1,950.00$       35.10$            2,281.50$       

G #35001 Jeans, Sizes 44-
54 10 330.00$          47.69$            476.90$          

H #47MWZ Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 37 1,665.00$       44.10$            1,631.70$       

I #70127 Denim Shirt, Sizes 
15-18 83 33.15$            2,751.45$       

J #70127 Denim Shirt, Sizes 
18.5-20 10 33.15$            331.50$          

K #70136 Chambray Shirt, 
Sizes 15-18 49 35.10$            1,719.90$       

L #70136 Chambray Shirt, 
Sizes 18.5-20 10 35.10$            351.00$          

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

45.00$             

33.00$             

30.00$             

30.00$             

48.00$             

WRANGLER BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

M #936DEN Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 15 22.71$          340.65$        26.33$           394.95$         32.23$            483.45$          

A Embroidery of Text 256 1.00$            256.00$        3.50$             896.00$         

B Embroidery of Department 
Logo 309 0.50$            154.50$        3.50$             1,081.50$      

C Embroidery of Tarrant 
County Seal 892 4.00$            3,568.00$     3.50$             3,122.00$      

D Silk Screening of Text 162 0.25$            40.50$          1.00$             162.00$         

E Silk Screening of 
Department Logo 50 0.25$            12.50$          1.00$             50.00$           

F Silk Screening of Tarrant 
County Seal 642 1.79$            1,149.18$     1.00$             642.00$         

G Department Logo 
Digitization/Artwork Fee 10 0.25$            2.50$            15.00$           150.00$         

Included

Included

Included

Included

GARMENT CUSTOMIZATION SERVICES

Included

Included

Included

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted 
Wrangler Garments 10% 30% 25%

WRANGLER BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

M #936DEN Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 15 450.00$          35.10$            526.50$          

A Embroidery of Text 256 768.00$          2,560.00$       18.30$            4,684.80$       

B Embroidery of Department 
Logo 309 1,081.50$       3,090.00$       5.70$              1,761.30$       

C Embroidery of Tarrant 
County Seal 892 3,122.00$       8,920.00$       5.20$              4,638.40$       

D Silk Screening of Text 162 243.00$          486.00$          3.20$              518.40$          

E Silk Screening of 
Department Logo 50 75.00$            250.00$          5.90$              295.00$          

F Silk Screening of Tarrant 
County Seal 642 963.00$          2,247.00$       5.20$              3,338.40$       

G Department Logo 
Digitization/Artwork Fee 10 200.00$          550.00$          50.00$            500.00$          

3.00$               

10.00$             

10.00$             

10.00$             

15%

20.00$             

1.50$               

1.50$               

1.50$               

3.50$               

3.50$               

3.00$               

55.00$             

No Bid

3.50$               

5.00$               

GARMENT CUSTOMIZATION SERVICES

10%No BidDiscount Off Catalog for Unlisted 
Wrangler Garments

WRANGLER BRANDED GARMENTS

30.00$             



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

M #936DEN Jeans, Sizes 28-
42 15 35.10$            526.50$          

A Embroidery of Text 256 768.00$          6.00$              1,536.00$       

B Embroidery of Department 
Logo 309 927.00$          10.00$            3,090.00$       

C Embroidery of Tarrant 
County Seal 892 2,230.00$       10.00$            8,920.00$       

D Silk Screening of Text 162 486.00$          7.00$              1,134.00$       

E Silk Screening of 
Department Logo 50 172.50$          3.90$              195.00$          

F Silk Screening of Tarrant 
County Seal 642 1,284.00$       3.16$              2,028.72$       

G Department Logo 
Digitization/Artwork Fee 10 60.00$            600.00$          

3.45$               

2.00$               

Included

3.00$               

3.00$               

2.50$               

3.00$               

20%

No Bid

GARMENT CUSTOMIZATION SERVICES

Discount Off Catalog for Unlisted 
Wrangler Garments 15%

WRANGLER BRANDED GARMENTS



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

H Sew-On Patch 20 4.00$            80.00$          3.00$             60.00$           

GARMENT CUSTOMIZATION SERVICES

Included

Bid Total 51,929.11$                          62,458.03$                              62,622.77$                               



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

H Sew-On Patch 20 40.00$            300.00$          6.00$              120.00$          

* *

2.00$               15.00$             

61,801.85$                           64,011.60$                           77,859.78$                               

GARMENT CUSTOMIZATION SERVICES

Bid Total



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

H Sew-On Patch 20 115.00$          

*

5.75$               

Bid Total 65,717.50$                           88,152.79$                               

GARMENT CUSTOMIZATION SERVICES

Included



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

Brand - Discount  Cinch - 10% N/A N/A

Brand - Discount  Ariat - 10% N/A N/A

Brand - Discount  Healing Hands - 10% N/A N/A

Brand - Discount  5.11 - 10% N/A N/A

Brand - Discount  Nike - 10% N/A N/A

Brand - Discount  Dickies - 10% N/A N/A

Brand - Discount  Red Kap - 10% N/A N/A

Brand - Discount  Carhartt - 10% N/A N/A

Brand - Discount  Bulwark - 10% N/A Corporate Apparel Direct Mall - 
25%

DISCOUNTS OFF CATALOG FOR BRANDS NOT LISTED



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

 Wrangler - 15% 

 Red Kap - 15% 

 San Mar - Port Authority - 18% 

 Dickies - 15% 

 Propper - 10% 

 Occunomix - 15% 

 Gildan, Jerzee, Fruit of the 
Loom - 18% 

 Cornerstone - 15% 

 Portwest - 10% 

N/AN/ABrand - Discount

Wrangler FR Clothing Images - 
10%N/ABrand - Discount

Wrangler Apparel - 10%N/ABrand - Discount

SS Catalog with Prices - 10%N/ABrand - Discount

San Mar SP23-Priced-Generic-
Zoom - 10%N/ABrand - Discount

Levi's SP23-NP - 10%N/ABrand - Discount

Dickies SP23 Master Work - 
10%N/ABrand - Discount

A4 Sports Catalog - 10%N/ABrand - Discount

2023-Gildan - 10%Other Catalog Categories / 
Brands - 5%Brand - Discount

DISCOUNTS OFF CATALOG FOR BRANDS NOT LISTED



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Brand - Discount Smith Warren/Blackinton - 15%N/A

Brand - Discount Premier Emblem - 15%N/A

Brand - Discount Dutyman/Perfect Fit - 15%N/A

Brand - Discount Safariland - 15%N/A

Brand - Discount TruSpec - 15%N/A

Brand - Discount Tact Squad - 15%N/A

Brand - Discount Elbeco - 15%N/A

Brand - Discount 5.11 - 15%N/A

Brand - Discount Blauer - 15% All - 20% 

DISCOUNTS OFF CATALOG FOR BRANDS NOT LISTED



Item Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Just Right Products d/b/a 
FW Promo

Haltom City, TX
HUB - No

CO-OP - Yes 

 Cen-Tex Uniform Sales Inc
Burleson, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

 UniFirst Corporation
Haltom City, TX

HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

Primary Award Secondary Award Alternate Award

* Anchorage Medical, Promotional Designs Inc., and Promo Solutions did not meet specifications for failing to provide pricing for all items as required.

Service - Fee  N/A N/A N/A

Service - Fee  N/A N/A N/A

Service - Fee  N/A N/A N/A

Service - Fee  Pant Hemming - $12.00/pr N/A N/A

FEES FOR GARMENT CUSTOMIZATION SERVICES NOT LISTED



Item Description Qty Ext Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promotional Designs Inc
Green Bay, WI

HUB - Yes 

 Anchorage Medical
Grand Prairie, TX

HUB - Yes 

Unit Price Unit Price

 Jonah's Enterprises Inc.
Brooklyn, NY
HUB - Yes 

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

N/A

N/A

Hemming - $8.00/pr

Hemming - $8.00/pr

* Anchorage Medical, Promotional Designs Inc., and Promo Solutions did not meet specifications for failing to provide pricing for all items as required.

N/AN/AService - Fee

N/AN/AService - Fee

N/AN/AService - Fee

N/AN/AService - Fee

FEES FOR GARMENT CUSTOMIZATION SERVICES NOT LISTED



Item Description Qty Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

 Promo Solutions
Frisco, TX
HUB - Yes 

 Impact Promotional Services 
LLC d/b/a Got You Covered 

Work Wear & Uniforms
Fort Worth, TX

HUB - No 

Unit Price

RFB 2023-148 Annual Contract for Work Uniforms

* Anchorage Medical, Promotional Designs Inc., and Promo Solutions did not meet specifications for failing to provide pricing for all items as required.

Service - Fee Waist (In or Out) - $15.00/prN/A

Service - Fee Taper Pant (Below Knee) - 
$16.00/prN/A

Service - Fee Taper Pant (Above Knee) - 
$24.00/prN/A

Service - Fee Taper Shirt (Body and Sleeves) 
- $24.00/prN/A

FEES FOR GARMENT CUSTOMIZATION SERVICES NOT LISTED
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