0 ,, TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
"% 100 E. Weatherford St. #303 * Fort Worth, TX 76196 * (817) 884-1414 * (817) 884-2629 (Fax)

)@} Melissa Lee, C.P.M., AP.P, Chris Lax, CPSM, CPSD, CPCP
. Purchasing Agent Assistant Purchasing Agent
June 7, 2023

EAN Holdings LLC

Enterprise Rent A Car

4201 North State Hwy 161

Irving, TX. 75038

Contact Name: Glen Vanblarcum
Phone Number: 469-525-2714
E-mail: glen.w.vanblarcum@ehi.com
Vendor # 7009560

Re: BID NO. 2022-179 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR RENTAL OF BOBTAIL TRUCKS

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with two (2) options to renew for additional twelve (12) months
each. The original contract was for the period of September 4, 2022 through September 3, 2023. The
effective dates for the first renewal option will run from September 4, 2023 through September 3, 2024.

l!( Yes, EAN Holdings LLC Enterprise Rent A Car, will accept the offer to extend the same contract
pricing and discounts through the renewal period. Please include a current 1295 Form with your

response.

0 No, EAN Holdings LLC Enterprise Rent A Car, Inc. will NOT accept the offer to extend the same
contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract?,[‘JYes 0 No
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

V/’:( \;@. }\-\'L(-»L"L,c‘ S

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer Christian Kaas, Regional Vice President
(P) 817.884.1133 (P) 972.536.9120
(F) 817.884.1133 (F) 855.644.2024

(E) jmnichols@tarrantcountytx.gov (E) Christian.O.Kaas@ehi.com



Memorandum

To: Troy Havard

Dept.: Elections

From: Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department

Date: May 24, 2023

Re: BID 2022-179 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR RENTAL OF BOBTAIL TRUCKS

The above referenced contract will expire on 09/3/2023. This contract included options to
renew with the vendor for two (2) additional twelve {12) month terms. The first renewal term
will commence September 4, 2023 and would expire September 3, 2024.

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed
below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form
back to me on or before Wednesday, May 31, 2023.

EAN Holdings LLC
Enterprise Rent A Car

‘/ Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for
the first and final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be
provided below.

576141/ 10000-2023 / 1420000000 /

(GL acct) [ _(Fund #) /_(Cost Center) /_(Grant # or NRG) _

D No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

. /o
SIGNATURE: e R e DATE; 05/24/2023




RFB 2022-179 Annual Contract for Rental of Bobtail Trucks

Award
EAN Holdings, LLC -
Dallas Fort Worth dba
Enterprise Rent-A-Car
Irving, TX 75038
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Ext
Section 1: 14' Bobtail Truck, Automatic Transmission
Truck Rental - Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance — Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Rental Collision Insurance - Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Truck Rental - Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance — Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Rental Collision Insurance — Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Truck Rental ~Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance — Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Rental Collision Insurance — Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Mileage Charge, per Mile 1 No Bid No Bid
Section Total No Bid
Liftgate No Bid
Truck Make/Model No Bid
Delivery Service No Bid
Section 2: 15' Bobtail Truck, Automatic Transmission
Truck Rental — Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance — Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Rental Collision Insurance — Daily Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Truck Rental — Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance — Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Rental Collision Insurance — Weekly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Truck Rental -Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Liability Insurance — Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Rental Collision Insurance —- Monthly Rental 1 No Bid No Bid
Mileage Charge, per Mile 1 No Bid No Bid
Section Total No Bid
Liftgate No Bid
Truck Make/Model No Bid
Delivery Service No Bid




RFB 2022-179 Annual Contract for Rental of Bobtail Trucks

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC -
Dallas Fort Worth dba

Enterprise Rent-A-Car
Irving, TX 75038
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Ext
Section 3: 16" Bobtail Truck, Automatic Transmission
Truck Rental — Daily Rental 24 |$ 11500 (% 2,760.00
Liability Insurance - Daily Rental 24 | Included Included
Rental Collision Insurance - Daily Rental 24 | Included included
Truck Rental - Weekly Rental 111 | $ 690.00 | $ 76,590.00
Liability Insurance —~ Weekly Rentall 111 | Included Included
Rental Collision Insurance ~ Weekly Rental 111 | Included Included
Truck Rental ~Monthly Rental 21 | $ 2,760.00 | $ 57,960.00
Liability Insurance — Monthly Rental 21 Included Included
Rental Collision Insurance ~ Monthly Rental 21 included Included
Mileage Charge, per Mile 29,104 $ 014 | $ 4,074.56
Section Total $ 3,565.14
Liftgate Yes
Truck Make/Model Isuzu NPR 2017-2022
Delivery Service No
Section 4: 20-25' Bobtail Truck, Automatic Transmission
Truck Rental — Daily Rental 1 $ 145.00| % 145.00
Liability Insurance - Daily Rental 1 Included Included
Rental Collision Insurance - Daily Rental 1 Included Included
Truck Rental - Weekly Rental 1 $ 870.00($ 870.00
Liability Insurance — Weekly Rental 1 Included Included
Rental Collision Insurance - Weekly Rental 1 Included Included
Truck Rental -Monthly Rental 1 $ 3,480.00{ % 3,480.00
Liability Insurance — Monthly Rental 1 Included Included
Rental Collision Insurance — Monthly Rental 1 Included Included
Mileage Charge, per Mile 1 $ 14.00 | $ 14.00
Section Total $ 4,509.00
Liftgate Yes

Truck Make/Model

Hino, International,

Delivery Service

No






