

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Primary			Primary			Primary		
Item	Description	Qty	Dennis Services Grapevine, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Fort Worth Electric, LP Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Lone Star Electric Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
			Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price
1	Licensed Journeyman - Hourly Rate - Normal Business Hours, Monday - Friday 8:00am - 5:00pm	700	\$ 62.50	\$ 43,750.00	\$ 74.00	\$ 51,800.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 52,500.00
2	Helper - Hourly Rate - Normal Business Hours, Monday - Friday 8:00am - 5:00pm	500	\$ 40.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 21,500.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 21,000.00
3	Licensed Journeyman - Hourly Rate - After Hours, Monday - Friday 5:01pm - 7:59am and Weekends	1	\$ 78.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 109.00	\$ 109.00
4	Helper - Hourly Rate - After Hours, Monday - Friday 5:01pm - 7:59am and Weekends	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 62.00	\$ 62.00
5	Licensed Journeyman - Hourly Rate - Holidays, Contractor Recognized Holidays	1	\$ 78.00	\$ 78.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 160.00	\$ 143.00	\$ 143.00
6	Helper - Hourly Rate - Holidays, Contractor Recognized Holidays	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 82.00	\$ 82.00
Bid Total			\$	64,006.00	\$	73,740.00	\$	73,896.00

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Primary

Item	Description	Qty	Cable Electric Inc North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		308 Construction, LLC DBA 308 Solutions Group Argyle, TX HUB - No		CEC Facilities Group Irving, TX HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price
1	Licensed Journeyman - Hourly Rate - Normal Business Hours, Monday - Friday 8:00am - 5:00pm	700	\$ 70.00	\$ 49,000.00	\$ 100.00	\$ 70,000.00	\$ 99.00	\$ 69,300.00
2	Helper - Hourly Rate - Normal Business Hours, Monday - Friday 8:00am - 5:00pm	500	\$ 50.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 40.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 59.00	\$ 29,500.00
3	Licensed Journeyman - Hourly Rate - After Hours, Monday - Friday 5:01pm - 7:59am and Weekends	1	\$ 105.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 148.50	\$ 148.50
4	Helper - Hourly Rate - After Hours, Monday - Friday 5:01pm - 7:59am and Weekends	1	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 88.50	\$ 88.50
5	Licensed Journeyman - Hourly Rate - Holidays, Contractor Recognized Holidays	1	\$ 105.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 200.00	\$ 198.00	\$ 198.00
6	Helper - Hourly Rate - Holidays, Contractor Recognized Holidays	1	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 118.00	\$ 118.00
Bid Total			\$	74,360.00	\$	90,490.00	\$	99,353.00

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Item	Description	Qty	Humphrey & Associates, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - No		SDB, Inc dba Southwest Commercial Electric Inc Dallas, TX HUB - No	
			Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price
1	Licensed Journeyman - Hourly Rate - Normal Business Hours, Monday - Friday 8:00am - 5:00pm	700	\$ 89.00	\$ 62,300.00	\$ 95.00	\$ 66,500.00
2	Helper - Hourly Rate - Normal Business Hours, Monday - Friday 8:00am - 5:00pm	500	\$ 57.00	\$ 28,500.00	\$ 70.00	\$ 35,000.00
3	Licensed Journeyman - Hourly Rate - After Hours, Monday - Friday 5:01pm - 7:59am and Weekends	1	\$ 133.50	\$ 133.50	\$ 142.50	\$ 142.50
4	Helper - Hourly Rate - After Hours, Monday - Friday 5:01pm - 7:59am and Weekends	1	\$ 85.50	\$ 85.50	\$ 105.00	\$ 105.00
5	Licensed Journeyman - Hourly Rate - Holidays, Contractor Recognized Holidays	1	\$ 178.00	\$ 178.00	\$ 142.50	\$ 142.50
6	Helper - Hourly Rate - Holidays, Contractor Recognized Holidays	1	\$ 114.00	\$ 114.00	\$ 105.00	\$ 105.00
Bid Total			\$	91,311.00	\$	101,995.00

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Primary			Primary			Primary		
			Dennis Services Grapevine, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Fort Worth Electric, LP Fort Worth, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Lone Star Electric Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
			Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price
Percent Mark Up for Parts Used During Repairs			25.00%		20.00%		20.00%	
Standard Response Time			3 Hours		48 Hours		1 Hour	
Emergency Response Time			2 Hours		4 Hours		2-4 Hours	
Emergency Response Call Fee			Hourly Rate		\$ 250.00		\$ -	
Minimum Number of Hours per Service Call			1 Hour		2 Hours		2 Hours	

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Primary

Item		Description	Qty	Cable Electric Inc North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		308 Construction, LLC DBA 308 Solutions Group Argyle, TX HUB - No		CEC Facilities Group Irving, TX HUB - No	
				Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price
Percent Mark Up for Parts Used During Repairs					25.00%		25.00%		25.00%
Standard Response Time				1 Hour		4 Hours		24 Hours	
Emergency Response Time				2 Hours		1 Hour		2 - 4 Hours	
Emergency Response Call Fee				\$	130.00	\$	150.00	\$	99.00
Minimum Number of Hours per Service Call				1 Hour		1 Hour		1 Hour	

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Item		Description	Qty	Humphrey & Associates, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - No		SDB, Inc dba Southwest Commercial Electric Inc Dallas, TX HUB - No	
				Unit Price	Ext Price	Unit Price	Ext Price
Percent Mark Up for Parts Used During Repairs					20.00%		10.00%
Standard Response Time				2 Hours		1 Hour	
Emergency Response Time				2 Hours		1 Hour	
Emergency Response Call Fee				\$	-	\$	250.00
Minimum Number of Hours per Service Call				2 Hours		4 Hours	

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

			Primary			Primary			Primary		
Item	Description of Equipment		Hourly Rate	Daily Rate		Hourly Rate	Daily Rate		Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	
OWNER/RENTED EQUIPMENT LIST											
1	Lift		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
2	Bucket Truck		\$ 105.00	\$ 630.00		\$ 185.00	\$ 1,480.00		\$ 75.00	\$ 600.00	
3	Aerial Platform Lift		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Lift 30 Foot		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
5	Lift 60 Foot		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
6	Mini Excavator		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
7	A Frame Ladder		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
8	Drive Trencher		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
9	Portable 5000 Watt Generator		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Primary

		Cable Electric Inc North Richland Hills, TX HUB - NO CO-OP - YES		308 Construction, LLC DBA 308 Solutions Group Argyle, TX HUB - NO		CEC Facilities Group Irving, TX HUB - NO	
Item	Description of Equipment	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate
OWNER/RENTED EQUIPMENT LIST							
1	Lift	No Bid	\$ 95.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Bucket Truck	\$ 150.00	\$ 800.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,000.00
3	Aerial Platform Lift	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Lift 30 Foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Lift 60 Foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Mini Excavator	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 150.00	\$ 600.00	No Bid	No Bid
7	A Frame Ladder	No Bid	\$ 40.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Drive Trencher	No Bid	\$ 550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Portable 5000 Watt Generator	No Bid	\$ 60.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Item	Description of Equipment	Humphrey & Associates, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - NO			SDB, Inc dba Southwest Commercial Electric Inc Dallas, TX HUB - NO		
		Hourly Rate	Daily Rate		Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	
OWNER/RENTED EQUIPMENT LIST							
1	Lift	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
2	Bucket Truck	\$ 135.00	\$ 1,080.00		No Bid	No Bid	
3	Aerial Platform Lift	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
4	Lift 30 Foot	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
5	Lift 60 Foot	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
6	Mini Excavator	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
7	A Frame Ladder	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
8	Drive Trencher	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
9	Portable 5000 Watt Generator	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

[illegible]

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Primary

		Cable Electric Inc North Richland Hills, TX HUB - NO CO-OP - YES		308 Construction, LLC DBA 308 Solutions Group Argyle, TX HUB - NO		CEC Facilities Group Irving, TX HUB - NO	
Item	Description of Equipment	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate
OWNER/RENTED EQUIPMENT LIST							
10	Wire Tugger & Rope	No Bid	\$ 300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Scissor Lift 60 foot	No Bid	\$ 95.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Scissor Lift 26 Foot	No Bid	\$ 125.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Aerial Platform Lift w/ Straight Boom 40-45 Foot	No Bid	\$ 620.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Aerial Platform Lift w/ Straight Boom 60-65 Foot	No Bid	\$ 745.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Aerial Platform Lift w/ Straight Boom 80-85 Foot	No Bid	\$ 1,055.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	180 kW Mobile Generator	No Bid	\$ 800.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Power Analyzer	No Bid	\$ 60.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Phase/Rotation Tester	No Bid	\$ 25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

		Humphrey & Associates, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - NO		SDB, Inc dba Southwest Commercial Electric Inc Dallas, TX HUB - NO	
Item	Description of Equipment	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate
OWNER/RENTED EQUIPMENT LIST					
10	Wire Tugger & Rope	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Scissor Lift 60 foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Scissor Lift 26 Foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Aerial Platform Lift w/ Straight Boom 40-45 Foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Aerial Platform Lift w/ Straight Boom 60-65 Foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Aerial Platform Lift w/ Straight Boom 80-85 Foot	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	180 kW Mobile Generator	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Power Analyzer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Phase/Rotation Tester	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Primary				Primary				Primary			
Dennis Services LLC Grapevine, TX HUB - YES CO-OP - YES				Fort Worth Electric, LP Fort Worth, TX HUB - YES CO-OP - YES				Lone Star Electric Fort Worth, TX HUB - NO CO-OP - YES			
Item	Description of Equipment	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate
OWNER/RENTED EQUIPMENT LIST											
19	Underground Circuit Tracer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	Ground Ohm/Resistance Tester	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Infrared Camera	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22	Hydraulic 0.5 - 2 Inch Conduit Bender	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Jack Hammer/Chip Hammer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Hole Hog	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25	PPE Equipment	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26	Trailer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	3700 Ditch Witch	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 50.00	\$ 400.00		

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

Primary

		Cable Electric Inc North Richland Hills, TX HUB - NO CO-OP - YES		308 Construction, LLC DBA 308 Solutions Group Argyle, TX HUB - NO		CEC Facilities Group Irving, TX HUB - NO	
Item	Description of Equipment	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate
OWNER/RENTED EQUIPMENT LIST							
19	Underground Circuit Tracer	No Bid	\$ 45.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20	Ground Ohm/Resistance Tester	No Bid	\$ 25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	Infrared Camera	No Bid	\$ 80.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22	Hydraulic 0.5 - 2 Inch Conduit Bender	No Bid	\$ 300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23	Jack Hammer/Chip Hammer	No Bid	\$ 75.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Hole Hog	No Bid	\$ 25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25	PPE Equipment	\$ 25.00	\$ 100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26	Trailer	No Bid	\$ 50.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27	3700 Ditch Witch	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

RFB 2023-074 Annual Contract for Electrical Services

			Humphrey & Associates, Inc. Fort Worth, TX HUB - NO		SDB, Inc dba Southwest Commercial Electric Inc Dallas, TX HUB - NO	
Item	Description of Equipment	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	Hourly Rate	Daily Rate	
OWNER/RENTED EQUIPMENT LIST						
19	Underground Circuit Tracer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
20	Ground Ohm/Resistance Tester	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
21	Infrared Camera	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
22	Hydraulic 0.5 - 2 Inch Conduit Bender	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
23	Jack Hammer/Chip Hammer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
24	Hole Hog	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
25	PPE Equipment	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
26	Trailer	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
27	3700 Ditch Witch	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	