



TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

100 E. Weatherford St. #303 • Fort Worth, TX 76196 • (817) 884-1414 • (817) 884-2629 (Fax)

Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.
Purchasing Agent

Chris Lax, CPSM
Assistant Purchasing Agent

November 7, 2022

Plano Office Supply Co.
Attn: Tom Lowe
1405 E. Plano Pkwy
Plano, Texas 75074

Re: RFB NO. 2022-051
Annual Contract for Modular Furniture and Movable/Demountable Walls

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with two (2) options to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of February 26, 2022, through February 25, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from 2/26/2023 through 02/25/2024.

☒ Yes, 2022-051 will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

☐ No, 2022-051 will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? ☐ Yes ☐ No
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

Kaleisa Jackson

Kaleisa Jackson
Senior Contract Administrator
(P) 817.844.1852
(F) 817.884.2629
(E) knjackson@tarrantcountytx.gov

A handwritten signature in black ink, appearing to read "Tom Lowe", written over a horizontal line.

Name: Tom Lowe
Plano Office Supply
(P) 214 704 0401
(F) _____
(E) TomLaPlanoOfficeSupply.com



TARRANT COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

100 E. Weatherford St. #303 • Fort Worth, TX 76196 • (817) 884-1414 • (817) 884-2629 (Fax)

Melissa Lee, C.P.M., A.P.P.
Purchasing Agent

Chris Lax, CPSM
Assistant Purchasing Agent

November 7, 2022

Interior Resource Group
Attn: Doug Maddox
1444 Oak Lawn Ave Suite 301
Dallas, Texas 75207

Re: RFB NO. 2022-051
Annual Contract for Modular Furniture and Movable/Demountable Walls

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with two (2) option to renew for additional twelve (12) months each. The original contract was for the period of February 26, 2022, through February 25, 2023. The effective dates for the first renewal option will run from 2/26/2023 through 02/25/2024.

☒ Yes, 2022-051 will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

☐ No, 2022-051 will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing and discounts through the renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? ☐ Yes ☒ No

If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

Kaleisa Jackson

Kaleisa Jackson
Senior Contract Administrator
(P) 817.844.1852
(F) 817.884.2629
(E) knjackson@tarrantcountytx.gov

Martha Blue

Name: Martha Blue
Interior Resource Group
(P) 972-619-7400
(F) 972-619-7401
(E) martha@irgroupdfw.com

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX	Plano Office Supply Plano, TX
		HUB - No	HUB - No
		Coop- Yes	Coop-Yes
		Price	Price
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION		
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM I - Haworth			
Section A: Discount for Haworth Premise Projects valued \$3,000 - \$6,000			
Discount from Published List Price		No Bid	No Bid
Warranty:		No Bid	No Bid
Product Line Bidding:		No Bid	No Bid
Section B: Discount for Haworth Premise Projects valued \$6,001 - \$10,000			
Discount from Published List Price		No Bid	No Bid
Warranty:		No Bid	No Bid
Product Line Bidding:		No Bid	No Bid
Section C: Discount for Haworth Premise Projects valued \$10,001+			
Discount from Published List Price		No Bid	No Bid
Warranty:		No Bid	No Bid
Product Line Bidding:		No Bid	No Bid
Other product lines included in this discount:		No Bid	No Bid
Are Offered Product Lines Greenguard Certified?		No Bid	No Bid
Section D: Individual Line Items			
1	Standard Acoustical Panel, "p" Top Cap, 64" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid
2	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, 64" high x 24" wide, Grade III Fabric	Net Price	No Bid
		Make /Model	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
ITEM NO		Price		Price	
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM I - Haworth					
Section D: Individual Line Items					
3	Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "p" , 80" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Glazed Panel, "p", 64" high x 24" wide	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
HUB - No		HUB - No	
Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
Price		Price	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION		
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM I - Haworth			
Section D: Individual Line Items			
9	Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid
10	Open Bookshelf, Half Height, 30" wide x 13- 3/4" deep	Make /Model	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid
11	Task Light For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage	Make /Model	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid
12	Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide	Make /Model	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid
13	Rotates from Side-to-Side 360, Accommodates Keyboards up to 18" wide x 9" deep	Make /Model	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid
14	Rotates from Side-to-Side 360. Accommodates Keyboards up to 21-1/2" wide x 10-1/2" deep	Make /Model	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop- Yes	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION		Price	Price	
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM I - Haworth					
Section D: Individual Line Items					
15	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 18" high, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid	
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid	
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid	
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid	
Bid Total Category A, System I - Haworth:					
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM II - HON					
Section A: Discount for HON Accelerate Projects valued \$3,000 - \$6,000					
Discount from Published List Price			No Bid	65.10%	
Warranty:			No Bid	Written Limited Lifetime	
Product Line Bidding:			No Bid	HON Accelerate	
Section B: Discount for HON Accelerate Projects valued \$6,001 - \$10,000					
Discount from Published List Price			No Bid	65.10%	
Warranty:			No Bid	Written Limited Lifetime	
Product Line Bidding:			No Bid	HON Accelerate	
Section C: Discount for HON Accelerate Projects valued \$10,001+					
Discount from Published List Price			No Bid	65.10%	
Warranty:			No Bid	Written Limited Lifetime	
Product Line Bidding:			No Bid	HON Accelerate	
Section C: Discount for HON Accelerate Projects valued \$10,001+					
Discount from Published List Price			No Bid	65.10%	
Warranty:			No Bid	Written Limited Lifetime	
Product Line Bidding:			No Bid	HON Accelerate	
Other product lines included in this discount:			No Bid	None	
Are Offered Product Lines Greenguard Certified?			No Bid	No	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX		
HUB - No		HUB - No		
Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes		
Price		Price		
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION			
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM II - HON				
Section D: Individual Line Items				
1	Standard Acoustical Panel, "P" Top Cap, 69" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate HETP6524P
		List Price	No Bid	\$530.00
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%
		Net Price	No Bid	\$184.97
2	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, Ports 1 Side, 69" high x 24" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid
3	Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "P", 82" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric,	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid
5	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate HWR23436PN
		List Price	No Bid	\$407.00
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%
		Net Price	No Bid	\$142.04
6	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate HWR3072PN
		List Price	No Bid	\$696.00
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%
		Net Price	No Bid	\$242.90
7	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate WHC2430P
		List Price	No Bid	\$770.00
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%
		Net Price	No Bid	\$268.73

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
ITEM NO		DESCRIPTION		Price	
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM II - HON					
Section D: Individual Line Items					
8	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate HWP3066P	
		List Price	No Bid	\$811.00	
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$283.04	
9	Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate HEOHRTA1542FP	
		List Price	No Bid	\$571.00	
		Discount	No Bid	65.01%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$199.28	
10	Open Bookshelf, Half Height, 30" wide x 13- 3/4" deep	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate HESHRT30	
		List Price	No Bid	\$258.00	
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$90.04	
11	Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate HH870930	
		List Price	No Bid	\$271.00	
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$94.58	
12	Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate H14917R	
		List Price	No Bid	\$658.00	
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$229.64	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
		Price		Price	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM II - HON					
Section D: Individual Line Items					
13	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360, Accommodates Keyboards up to 18" wide x 9" deep	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate HRTMID	
		List Price	No Bid	\$607.00	
		Discount	No Bid	Accelerate 65.1%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$211.84	
14	Articulating Keyboard Platform w/Mouse Tray. Rotates 360. Accommodates Keyboards up to 21-1/2" wide x 10-1/2" deep	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate HRTMID	
		List Price	No Bid	\$607.00	
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$211.84	
15	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 18" high, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	No Bid	Accelerate H90031	
		List Price	No Bid	\$331.00	
		Discount	No Bid	65.10%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$115.52	
Bid Total Category A, System II - HON:			No Bid	\$2,274.42	
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM III - Kimball					
Section A: Discount for Kimball XSITE Projects valued \$3,000 - \$6,000					
Discount from Published List Price			Lifetime	No Bid	
Warranty:			Kimball Xsite	No Bid	
Product Line Bidding:			70%	No Bid	
Section B: Discount for Kimball XSITE Projects valued \$6,001 - \$10,000					
Discount from Published List Price			Lifetime	No Bid	
Warranty:			Kimball Xsite	No Bid	
Product Line Bidding:			70%	No Bid	
Section C: Discount for Kimball XSITE Projects valued \$10,001+					
Discount from Published List Price			Lifetime	No Bid	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX	Plano Office Supply Plano, TX
		HUB - No	HUB - No
		Coop- Yes	Coop-Yes
		Price	Price
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION		
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM III - Kimball			
Section C: Discount for Kimball XSITE Projects valued \$10,001+			
Warranty:		Kimball Xsite	No Bid
Product Line Bidding:		73%	No Bid
Other product lines included in this discount:		Kimball Perks	No Bid
Are Offered Product Lines Greenguard Certified?		Yes	No Bid
Section D: Individual Line Items			
1	Standard Acoustical Panel, "P" Top Cap, 69" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	Xsite 96P425FNITASC
		List Price	\$1,375.00
		Discount	70%
		Net Price	\$412.50
2	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, Ports 1 Side, 69" high x 24" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	Xsite 96P245FNITASC
		List Price	\$926.00
		Discount	70%
		Net Price	\$277.80
3	Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "P", 82" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric,	Make /Model	Xsite 96P305FNITASC
		List Price	\$1,506.00
		Discount	70%
		Net Price	\$451.80
4	Glazed Panel, "P", 69" high x 30" wide	Make /Model	Xsite 96P245FNITGAP
		List Price	\$1,793.00
		Discount	70%
		Net Price	\$537.90

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
ITEM NO		DESCRIPTION		Price	
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM III - Kimball					
Section D: Individual Line Items					
5	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide	Make /Model	Footprint SS2436WSSL3	No Bid	
		List Price	\$324.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$97.20	No Bid	
6	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide	Make /Model	Footprint SS3072WSSL3	No Bid	
		List Price	\$625.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$187.50	No Bid	
7	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model	Footprint SS30424230WSCCL3	No Bid	
		List Price	\$702.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$210.60	No Bid	
8	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model	Footprint SS3660WSUCL3	No Bid	
		List Price	\$1,052.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$315.60	No Bid	
9	Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model	Footprint IS144216RP	No Bid	
		List Price	\$737.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$221.10	No Bid	
10	Open Bookshelf, Half Height, 30" wide x 13- 3/4" deep	Make /Model	Footprint IS143016OS	No Bid	
		List Price	\$486.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$145.80	No Bid	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
HUB - No		HUB - No	
Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
Price		Price	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION		
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM III - Kimball			
Section D: Individual Line Items			
11	Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage	Make /Model	Perks 99K17TLS
		List Price	\$302.00
		Discount	56%
		Net Price	\$132.88
12	Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide	Make /Model	Footprint 12S2416PUBFM
		List Price	\$550.00
		Discount	70%
		Net Price	\$165.00
13	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360, Accommodates Keyboards up to 18" wide x 9" deep	Make /Model	Perks 99K1706KK1
		List Price	\$756.00
		Discount	56%
		Net Price	\$332.64
14	Articulating Keyboard Platform w/Mouse Tray. Rotates from 360. Accommodates Keyboards up to 21-1/2" wide x 10-1/2" deep	Make /Model	Perks 99K1424KT
		List Price	\$161.00
		Discount	56%
		Net Price	\$70.84
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM III - Kimball			
Section D: Individual Line Items			
15	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 18" high, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	Perks 99K3620TBW
		List Price	\$252.00
		Discount	56%
		Net Price	\$110.88
Bid Total Category A, System III - Kimball:			\$3,670.04
			No Bid
			No Bid
			No Bid
			No Bid

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

ITEM NO		DESCRIPTION	TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX	Plano Office Supply Plano, TX
			HUB - No	HUB - No
			Coop- Yes	Coop-Yes
			Price	Price
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM IV - Allsteel				
Section A: Discount for Allsteel CONCENSYS Projects valued \$3,000 - \$6,000				
		Discount from Published List Price	No Bid	69.90%
		Warranty:	No Bid	Written Lifetime Warranty
		Product Line Bidding:	No Bid	Optimize
Section B: Discount for Allsteel CONCENSYS Projects valued \$6,001 - \$10,000				
		Discount from Published List Price	No Bid	69.90%
		Warranty:	No Bid	Written Lifetime Warranty
		Product Line Bidding:	No Bid	Optimize
Section C: Discount for Allsteel CONCENSYS Projects valued \$10,001+				
		Discount from Published List Price	No Bid	69.90%
		Warranty:	No Bid	Written Lifetime Warranty
		Product Line Bidding:	No Bid	Optimize
		Other product lines included in this discount:	No Bid	None
		Are Offered Product Lines Greenguard Certified?	No Bid	Yes
Section D: Individual Line Items				
1	Standard Acoustical Panel, "p" Top Cap, 69" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid
2	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, Ports 1 Side, 69" high x 24" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
ITEM NO		DESCRIPTION		Price	
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM IV - Allsteel					
Section D: Individual Line Items					
3	Standard Tackable Acoustical Panel, "p", 80" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric,	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid	
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid	
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid	
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid	
4	Glazed Panel, "p", 69" high x 24" wide	Make /Model	No Bid	No Bid	
		List Price	No Bid	No Bid	
		Discount	No Bid	No Bid	
		Net Price	No Bid	No Bid	
5	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide	Make /Model	No Bid	Worksurface T52436SN	
		List Price	No Bid	\$440.00	
		Discount	No Bid	69.90%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$132.44	
6	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide	Make /Model	No Bid	Worksurface T53072SN	
		List Price	No Bid	\$840.00	
		Discount	No Bid	69.90%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$252.84	
7	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model	No Bid	Worksurface T52430CRN	
		List Price	No Bid	\$955.00	
		Discount	No Bid	69.90%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$287.46	
8	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model	No Bid	Worksurface T53660BN	
		List Price	No Bid	\$1,183.00	
		Discount	No Bid	69.90%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$356.08	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

ITEM NO		DESCRIPTION	TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX
			HUB - No	HUB - No	
			Coop- Yes	Coop- Yes	
			Price	Price	
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM IV - Allsteel					
Section D: Individual Line Items					
9		Overhead Storage Cabinet, w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model	No Bid	Optimize OH1542FD
			List Price	No Bid	\$974.00
			Discount	No Bid	69.90%
10		Open Bookshelf, Half Height, 30" wide x 13- 3/4" deep	Net Price	No Bid	\$293.17
			Make /Model	No Bid	Optimize ZS30
			List Price	No Bid	\$401.00
11		Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage	Discount	No Bid	69.90%
			Net Price	No Bid	\$120.70
			Make /Model	No Bid	Optimize A870830
12		Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide	List Price	No Bid	\$372.00
			Discount	No Bid	69.90%
			Net Price	No Bid	\$111.97
13		Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from 360, Accommodates Keyboards up to 18" wide x 9" deep	Make /Model	No Bid	Essentials PH149182B
			List Price	No Bid	\$880.00
			Discount	No Bid	69.96%
14		Articulating Keyboard Platform w/Mouse Tray. Rotates from 360. Accommodates Keyboards up to 21-1/2" wide x 10-1/2" deep	Net Price	No Bid	\$264.88
			Make /Model	No Bid	Optimize ARTMID
			List Price	No Bid	\$530.00
			Discount	No Bid	69.90%
			Net Price	No Bid	\$159.53
			Make /Model	No Bid	Optimize ARTMID
			List Price	No Bid	\$530.00
			Discount	No Bid	69.90%
			Net Price	No Bid	\$159.53

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
		Price		Price	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION				
CATEGORY A, SYSTEM IV - Allsteel					
Section D: Individual Line Items					
15	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 18" high, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	No Bid	Optimize UHTB36	
		List Price	No Bid	\$536.00	
		Discount	No Bid	69.90%	
		Net Price	No Bid	\$161.34	
		Bid Total Category A, System IV - Allsteel:		\$2,299.94	
CATEGORY B - Moveable & Demountable Wall System					
B-1: Modular Furniture System with Accessories, 3" Panel, Project Discount					
Discount from Published List Price			70%	No Bid	
Warranty:			Lifetime	No Bid	
Product Line Bidding:			Kimball Narrate	No Bid	
B-1: Modular Furniture with Moveable/Demountable Walls and Accessories, Project Discount					
Discount from Published List Price			45.50%	No Bid	
Warranty:			5 Years	No Bid	
Product Line Bidding:			Muraflex Mimo	No Bid	
Other product lines included in this discount:			None	No Bid	
Are Offered Product Lines Greenguard Certified?			Yes	No Bid	
Individual Line Items					
1	Standard Acoustical Panel, 66" high x 42" wide Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	93P425FNITTTA	No Bid	
		List Price	\$1,207.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$362.10	No Bid	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX		
HUB - No		HUB - No		
Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes		
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	Price	Price	
CATEGORY B - Moveable & Demountable Wall System				
Individual Line Items				
2	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, 66" high x 12" wide, Grade III Fabric.	Make /Model	93P245FNITTTA	No Bid
		List Price	\$809.00	No Bid
		Discount	70%	No Bid
		Net Price	\$242.70	No Bid
3	Standard Acoustical Panel, 78" high x 12" wide	Make /Model	93P245FNITTTA	No Bid
		List Price	\$1,032.00	No Bid
		Discount	70%	No Bid
		Net Price	\$309.60	No Bid
4	Glazed Panel, 66" high x 30"	Make /Model	93P305FNITTTGAP	No Bid
		List Price	\$1,410.00	No Bid
		Discount	70%	No Bid
		Net Price	\$423.00	No Bid
5	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide	Make /Model	SS2436WSSL	No Bid
		List Price	\$324.00	No Bid
		Discount	70%	No Bid
		Net Price	\$97.20	No Bid
6	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide	Make /Model	SS3072WSSL3	No Bid
		List Price	\$625.00	No Bid
		Discount	70%	No Bid
		Net Price	\$187.50	No Bid
7	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model	SS30424230WSCCL3	No Bid
		List Price	\$702.00	No Bid
		Discount	70%	No Bid
		Net Price	\$210.60	No Bid

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
ITEM NO		Price		Price	
CATEGORY B - Moveable & Demountable Wall System					
Individual Line Items					
8	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model	SS3660WSUCL3	No Bid	
		List Price	\$1,052.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$315.60	No Bid	
9	Overhead Storage Cabinet w/Door & Lock, 42" wide x 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model	IS144216RP	No Bid	
		List Price	\$737.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$221.10	No Bid	
10	Open Bookshelf, Full Height, 30" wide x 13- 3/4" deep	Make /Model	IS143016OS	No Bid	
		List Price	\$486.00	No Bid	
		Discount	70%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$145.80	No Bid	
11	Task Light. For use under 30" wide Overhead Storage	Make /Model	99K17TLS	No Bid	
		List Price	\$302.00	No Bid	
		Discount	56%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$132.88	No Bid	
12	Hanging Pedestal, Box/File Drawers, 19" high x 22-7/8" deep x 15" wide	Make /Model	1252416PUBFM	No Bid	
		List Price	\$550.00	No Bid	
		Discount	56%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$165.00	No Bid	
13	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates from Side-to-Side 360, Accommodates Keyboards up to 20" wide x 8" deep	Make /Model	99K1706KK1	No Bid	
		List Price	\$756.00	No Bid	
		Discount	56%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$332.64	No Bid	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
ITEM NO		DESCRIPTION		Price	
CATEGORY B - Moveable & Demountable Wall System					
Individual Line Items					
14	Slide Away Keyboard Platform. 21-1/2" wide x 10" deep	Make /Model	99K1424KT	No Bid	
		List Price	\$161.00	No Bid	
		Discount	56%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$70.84	No Bid	
15	Fabric Tackboard, 36" wide x 16" high, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	99K3620TBW	No Bid	
		List Price	\$252.00	No Bid	
		Discount	56%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$110.88	No Bid	
16	Moveable Walls, 9 ft. high x 4 ft. wide	Make /Model	Mimo	No Bid	
		List Price	\$3,454.00	No Bid	
		Discount	45.50%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$1,882.43	No Bid	
17	Demountable Walls, 9 ft. high x 4 ft. wide	Make /Model	Mimo	No Bid	
		List Price	\$3,454.00	No Bid	
		Discount	45.50%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$1,882.43	No Bid	
18	Glass Panels, Full Height, 9 ft. high x 4 ft. wide	Make /Model	Mimo	No Bid	
		List Price	\$2,519.00	No Bid	
		Discount	45.50%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$1,372.86	No Bid	
19	Door Units, 9 ft. high x 3 ft. wide	Make /Model	Mimo	No Bid	
		List Price	\$3,701.00	No Bid	
		Discount	45.50%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$2,017.05	No Bid	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	Price		Price	
CATEGORY B - Moveable & Demountable Wall System					
Individual Line Items					
20	Hinges	Make /Model	Mimo	No Bid	
		List Price	Included in Door Unit	No Bid	
		Discount	Included in Door Unit	No Bid	
		Net Price	Included in Door Unit	No Bid	
21	Lock Sets	Make /Model	Mimo	No Bid	
		List Price	\$1,479.00	No Bid	
		Discount	45.50%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$806.06	No Bid	
Bid Total Category B - Moveable & Demountable Wall System:		\$11,288.27		No Bid	
CATEGORY C - Modular Furniture System					
C-1: Modular Furniture System with Accessories, 3" Panel, Project Discount					
Discount from Published List Price		73%		65%	
Warranty:		Lifetime		Written Limited Lifetime	
Product Line Bidding:		Kimball Narrate		HON Abound	
Other product lines included in this discount:		Kimball Perks		None	
Are Offered Product Lines Greenguard Certified?		Yes		Yes	
Individual Line Items					
1	Standard Acoustical Panel, 62" high x 42" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	93P425FNITTTA	No Bid	
		List Price	\$1,207.00	No Bid	
		Discount	73%	No Bid	
		Net Price	\$325.89	No Bid	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX		
HUB - No		HUB - No		
Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes		
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	Price	Price	
CATEGORY C - Modular Furniture System				
Individual Line Items				
2	Wire Management Acoustical Panel, 62" high x 12" wide Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	93P254FNITTTA	No Bid
		List Price	\$809.00	No Bid
		Discount	73%	No Bid
		Net Price	\$218.43	No Bid
3	Standard Acoustical Panel, 80" high x 30" wide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	93P306FNITTTA	No Bid
		List Price	\$1,195.00	No Bid
		Discount	73%	No Bid
		Net Price	\$322.65	No Bid
4	Glazed Panel, 62" high x 30" wide	Make /Model	93P305FNITTTGAP	No Bid
		List Price	\$1,410.00	No Bid
		Discount	73%	No Bid
		Net Price	\$380.70	No Bid
5	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 24" deep x 36" wide	Make /Model	SS2436WSSL3	HWR2436PN
		List Price	\$324.00	\$407.00
		Discount	73%	65.10%
		Net Price	\$87.48	\$142.04
6	Standard T-Mold Edge Work surface, 30" deep x 72" wide	Make /Model	SS3072WSSL3	HWR3072PN
		List Price	\$625.00	\$696.00
		Discount	73%	65.10%
		Net Price	\$168.75	\$242.90
7	Standard Corner Work surface, 42" wide x 30" deep	Make /Model	SS3042423OWSCCL3	HWC2430P
		List Price	\$702.00	\$770.00
		Discount	73%	65.10%
		Net Price	\$189.54	\$268.73

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION	Price		Price	
CATEGORY C - Modular Furniture System					
Individual Line Items					
8	Peninsula Work surface, 36" wide x 60" long	Make /Model	SS3660WSUCL3	HWP3066P	
		List Price	\$1,052.00	\$811.00	
		Discount	73%	65.10%	
		Net Price	\$284.04	\$283.04	
9	Overhead Storage Cabinet w/Door & Lock, 42" wide X 14-1/4" deep	Make /Model	IS144216RP	HRVOH42FM	
		List Price	\$737.00	\$730.00	
		Discount	73%	65.10%	
		Net Price	\$198.99	\$254.77	
10	Open Bookshelf, Full Height, 30" wide x 13- 3/4" deep	Make /Model	IS143016OS	HRV5H30	
		List Price	\$486.00	\$306.00	
		Discount	73%	65.10%	
		Net Price	\$131.22	\$106.79	
11	Task Lighting, For use under 30" wide overhead storage	Make /Model	99K17TLS	HH870930	
		List Price	\$302.00	\$271.00	
		Discount	56%	65.10%	
		Net Price	\$132.88	\$94.58	
12	Honing Pedestal, Bloc/File Drawers, 19" high X 22-7/8" deep X 15" wide	Make /Model	12S2415PUBFM	HI4917R	
		List Price	\$550.00	\$358.00	
		Discount	73%	65.10%	
		Net Price	\$148.50	\$229.04	
13	Articulating Keyboard Platform. Rotates 360 , Accommodated Keyboards up to 20"wide X 16" deep	Make /Model	99K1706KK1	HRTMID	
		List Price	\$756.00	\$607.00	
		Discount	56%	65.10%	
		Net Price	\$332.64	\$211.84	

Bid 2022-051 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR MODULAR FURNITURE AND MOVEABEL/DEMOUNTABLE WALLS

		TX Interior Resources, LLC DBA Interior Resources Dallas, TX		Plano Office Supply Plano, TX	
		HUB - No		HUB - No	
		Coop- Yes		Coop-Yes	
ITEM NO		DESCRIPTION		Price	
CATEGORY C - Modular Furniture System					
Individual Line Items					
14	Slide Away Keyboard Platform 21-1/2" wide X 16" deep	Make /Model	99K1424KT	HRTMID	
		List Price	\$161.00	\$607.00	
		Discount	56%	65.10%	
		Net Price	\$70.84	\$211.84	
15	Fabric Tackboard 36" wide x 16" hide, Grade III Fabric	Make /Model	99K3620TBW	H90031	
		List Price	\$252.00	\$331.00	
		Discount	56%	65.10%	
		Net Price	\$110.88	\$115.52	
		Bid Total Category C - Modular Furniture System:		\$3,103.43	
				\$2,267.88	

Notes: Category A, System II Items 2 & 3 and Category A, System IV Items 1-4 are removed from this bid as they are no longer available. Plano Office Supply response for Category C does not meet specifications for failing to bid on all items as required. One no-bid was received from Quill.com