

## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

**P - Primary**

**S - Secondary**

Line #	Description	QTY	All In Safety Corp New Windsor, NY HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Centerline Supply, Inc. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Buyers Barricades Inc. Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
			Price		Price		Price	
	SECTION 1: TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES AND SAFETY EQUIPMENT ALL QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED AMOUNTS. MUST QUOTE EXACT ITEM REQUESTED.							
2	Barricade - Type One; 8' plastic composition; complete with two A-Frame legs (42" H) and retro-reflective striping; orange and white on both sides. SIZE: 8'	25	No Bid		\$ 82.60	S	\$ 80.75	
3	Barricade - Type One; 24" plastic folding with 24" x 12" retro-reflective striping; orange and white on both sides. 42.6" H. SIZE: 24"	25	No Bid		\$ 55.75	P	\$ 42.00	
4	Barricade - Type One; 24" plastic folding with 24" x 8" retro-reflective striping; orange and white on both sides. 42.6" H. SIZE: 24"	25	No Bid		\$ 52.60	P	\$ 42.00	
5	Barricade - A-Frame Barricade, leg only; 30" w x 42"; plastic for use with barricade, item 1. SIZE: 30"	25	No Bid		\$ 19.41	P	\$ 49.00	
6	Barricade - Type Three; 8' with 3 plastic boards striped with high intensity reflective sheeting on both sides; plastic supports with steel tubing legs. SIZE: 8'	25	No Bid		\$ 205.88	P	\$ 205.00	
7	Barricade Plastic Board - A-Frame Barricade, board only, 2" x 8" x 8'; striped with high intensity reflective sheeting on both sides. SIZE: 2" x 8" x 8'	10	No Bid		No Bid	S	\$ 61.00	
8	Barricade Plastic Board - 1" x 8" x 8'; with high intensity reflective sheeting on both sides. SIZE: 1" x 8" x 8'	10	No Bid		\$ 35.29	P	\$ 61.00	
9	Channelizer - 42" with 30 lb. base and high intensity band with loop handle; pre-molded hole for lights. SIZE: 2" x 8" x 6'	25	No Bid		\$ 34.12	P	\$ 44.00	
10	Vertical Panel - 44.5" with 30 lb. base and high intensity orange and white reflective sheeting; molded hand and light mounts; variety of sheeting options. SIZE: 44.5"	50	No Bid		\$ 44.71	P	\$ 44.00	

## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Line #	Description	QTY	Safety Zone Holdings, Inc. d/b/a Safety Zone Specialists Lakeland, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Striping Service and Supply Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Pathmark Traffic Equipment, LLC San Marcos, TX HUB - No CO-OP - No		
			Price			Price			Price		
	SECTION 1: TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES AND SAFETY EQUIPMENTALL QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED AMOUNTS.MUST QUOTE EXACT ITEM REQUESTED.										
2	Barricade - Type One; 8' plastic composition; complete with two A-Frame legs (42" H) and retro-reflective striping; orange and white on both sides. SIZE: 8'	25				P		\$ 122.95		\$ 54.96	\$ 125.00
3	Barricade – Type One; 24" plastic folding with 24" x 12" retro-reflective striping; orange and white on both sides. 42.6" H. SIZE: 24"	25				S		\$ 83.95		\$ 52.44	\$ 89.00
4	Barricade – Type One; 24" plastic folding with 24" x 8" retro-reflective striping; orange and white on both sides. 42.6" H. SIZE: 24"	25				S		\$ 80.35		\$ 45.48	\$ 79.00
5	Barricade – A-Frame Barricade, leg only; 30" w x 42"; plastic for use with barricade, item 1. SIZE: 30"	25	S					\$ 25.60		\$ 25.92	\$ 39.00
6	Barricade – Type Three; 8' with 3 plastic boards striped with high intensity reflective sheeting on both sides; plastic supports with steel tubing legs. SIZE: 8'	25						\$ 316.30		\$ 237.12	\$ 249.00
7	Barricade Plastic Board – A-Frame Barricade, board only, 2" x 8" x 8'; striped with high intensity reflective sheeting on both sides. SIZE: 2" x 8" x 8'	10						\$ 66.50	P	\$ 120.75	\$ 59.00
8	Barricade Plastic Board – 1" x 8" x 8'; with high intensity reflective sheeting on both sides. SIZE: 1" x 8" x 8'	10						\$ 66.90	S	\$ 52.56	\$ 46.00
9	Channelizer – 42" with 30 lb. base and high intensity band with loop handle; pre-molded hole for lights. SIZE: 2" x 8" x 6'	25						\$ 66.50		\$ 44.96	\$ 49.00
10	Vertical Panel - 44.5" with 30 lb. base and high intensity orange and white reflective sheeting; molded hand and light mounts; variety of sheeting options. SIZE: 44.5"	50						\$ 72.10		\$ 60.14	\$ 79.00

## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Line #	Description	QTY	Price		Price		Buyers Barricades Inc. Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
11	Safety Barrel channelizer drum - 36" x 22.94"; orange with two 4" strips of white reflective sheeting and two 4" strips of orange reflective sheeting; carry handle on dome top with two pre-molded light mounts; mounts for flags and tire ring base. SIZE: 36"	5	S	\$ 35.95	P	\$ 32.94	
12	Sandbags, Poly 26" x 14.5"; poly woven; empty with tie/seal. SIZE: 26" x 14.5"	100	S	\$ 0.39	P	\$ 0.24	\$ 0.85
13	Traffic Cones - 28" 7 lbs ; Wide body florescent PVC orange; 6" and 4" reflective collars.	100	P	\$ 11.99	S	\$ 17.02	\$ 25.50
14	Traffic Cones, Stenciling Set-Up Fee	1	P	\$ 55.00	S	\$ 41.18	\$ 55.00
15	Traffic Cones, Stenciling	1	P	\$ 1.25	S	\$ 0.42	\$ 0.45
16	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles – 24" with 12" handle; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange non-reflective; MUST include material description. SIZE: 12" Handle	10		No Bid	S	\$ 28.24	\$ 24.00
17	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles – 24" with 72" staff; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange non-reflective; MUST include material description. SIZE: 72" Staff	10		No Bid	P	\$ 40.14	\$ 55.00
18	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles (Aluminum) – 24" with 72" ABS plastic staff; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange; engineer grade reflective. SIZE: 72" Staff	10		No Bid	S	\$ 65.22	\$ 75.00

## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Line #	Description	QTY	Safety Zone Holdings, Inc. d/b/a Safety Zone Specialists Lakeland, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Striping Service and Supply Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Pathmark Traffic Equipment, LLC San Marcos, TX HUB - No CO-OP - No	
			Price		Price		Price	
11	Safety Barrel channelizer drum - 36" x 22.94"; orange with two 4" strips of white reflective sheeting and two 4" strips of orange reflective sheeting; carry handle on dome top with two pre-molded light mounts; mounts for flags and tire ring base. SIZE: 36"	5		\$ 98.85		\$ 39.67		\$ 65.00
12	Sandbags, Poly 26" x 14.5"; poly woven; empty with tie/seal. SIZE: 26" x 14.5"	100		\$ 0.55		No Bid		\$ 0.65
13	Traffic Cones - 28" 7 lbs ; Wide body florescent PVC orange; 6" and 4" reflective collars.	100		\$ 19.25		\$ 19.43		\$ 24.50
14	Traffic Cones, Stenciling Set-Up Fee	1		\$ 10.00		\$ 43.16		\$ 55.00
15	Traffic Cones, Stenciling	1		\$ 0.40		\$ 1.50		\$ 2.50
16	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles - 24" with 12" handle; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange non-reflective; MUST include material description. SIZE: 12" Handle	10				No Bid		\$ 49.00
17	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles - 24" with 72" staff; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange non-reflective; MUST include material description. SIZE: 72" Staff	10	S	\$ 50.05		No Bid		\$ 99.00
18	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles (Aluminum) - 24" with 72" ABS plastic staff; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange; engineer grade reflective. SIZE: 72" Staff	10	P	\$ 55.90		No Bid		\$ 109.00



## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

**P - Primary**

**S - Secondary**

Line #	Description	QTY	All In Safety Corp New Windsor, NY HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		Centerline Supply, Inc. Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Buyers Barricades Inc. Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
			Price		Price		Price	
19	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles (Aluminum) – 24" with 72" ABS wooden staff; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange; engineer grade reflective.	10	No Bid		No Bid	S	\$ 75.00	
20	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles (Aluminum) – 24" with 72" ABS plastic handle; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange; high intensity reflective. SIZE: 72" Staff	10	No Bid		\$ 70.39		\$ 94.00	
21	Red or Orange, Cloth or woven Flags - 24" x 24" with staff. SIZE: 24" x 24" w/ staff	10	No Bid		\$ 6.88	P	\$ 7.99	
22	Red or Orange, Vinyl Flags – 24" x 24" with staff. SIZE: 24" x 24" w/ staff	75	P \$ 1.89		\$ 4.36	S	\$ 7.99	
23	Temporary Overlay Markers – 4"; tab without cover; two-way markers; yellow and white. SIZE: 4"	500	No Bid		\$ 0.48	P	\$ 0.75	
24	Chipseal Marker – clear one-way without the cover.	1000	No Bid		\$ 0.52	S	\$ 0.75	
25	Chipseal Marker – yellow, one-way without the cover.	1000	No Bid		\$ 0.38	P	\$ 0.75	
26	Chipseal Marker – clear, two-way with cover.	1000	No Bid		\$ 0.54	S	\$ 0.75	
27	Chipseal Marker – yellow, two-way with cover	1000	No Bid		\$ 0.54	S	\$ 0.75	
28	Buttons – 4" ceramic yellow buttons.	250	No Bid		\$ 0.38	P	\$ 1.50	
29	Reflectors (Concrete Barrier) – 9" square reflectors for concrete barriers, bridge parapets or wooden guardrail posts; pre-drilled holes for quick installation; one- or two-sided reflectivity; yellow or white. Size: 9"	100	No Bid		\$ 1.39	P	\$ 1.50	

## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

**P - Primary**  
**S - Secondary**

Line #	Description	QTY	Safety Zone Holdings, Inc. d/b/a Safety Zone Specialists Lakeland, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Striping Service and Supply Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Pathmark Traffic Equipment, LLC San Marcos, TX HUB - No CO-OP - No	
			P	\$	No Bid	\$	S	\$
19	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles (Aluminum) – 24" with 72" ABS wooden staff; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange; engineer grade reflective.	10	P	\$ 46.15	No Bid	\$ 129.00		
20	Stop/Slow Flagger Paddles (Aluminum) – 24" with 72" ABS plastic handle; double faced (STOP on front, SLOW on back); STOP is white on red; SLOW is black on orange; high intensity reflective. SIZE: 72" Staff	10	P	\$ 59.95	No Bid	\$ 139.00		
21	Red or Orange, Cloth or woven Flags - 24" x 24" with staff. SIZE: 24" x 24" w/ staff	10		\$ 9.90	\$ 7.23	\$ 6.95	S	\$
22	Red or Orange, Vinyl Flags – 24" x 24" with staff. SIZE: 24" x 24" w/ staff	75		\$ 7.55	\$ 5.75	\$ 4.95		\$
23	Temporary Overlay Markers – 4"; tab without cover; two-way markers; yellow and white. SIZE: 4"	500		\$ 1.35	No Bid	\$ 0.59	S	\$
24	Chipseal Marker – clear one-way without the cover.	1000		\$ 1.10	P \$ 0.48	\$ 0.59		\$
25	Chipseal Marker – yellow, one-way without the cover.	1000		\$ 1.10	No Bid	\$ 0.65	S	\$
26	Chipseal Marker – clear, two-way with cover.	1000		\$ 1.20	P \$ 0.48	\$ 0.70		\$
27	Chipseal Marker – yellow, two-way with cover	1000		\$ 1.20	P \$ 0.50	\$ 0.65		\$
28	Buttons – 4" ceramic yellow buttons.	250		\$ 2.75	\$ 105.00	\$ 1.25	S	\$
29	Reflectors (Concrete Barrier) – 9" square reflectors for concrete barriers, bridge parapets or wooden guardrail posts; pre-drilled holes for quick installation; one- or two-sided reflectivity; yellow or white. Size: 9"	100		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.95		\$

## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

**P - Primary**

**S - Secondary**

Line #	Description	QTY	Price		Price		Buyers Barricades Inc. Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
					P	S	
30	Reflectors (Concrete Barrier) – 16" wall markers for low profile concrete barriers; pre-drilled holes for quick installation; one- or two-sided reflectivity; yellow or white. Size: 16"	100	No Bid		\$ 3.93	\$ 4.20	
31	Reflective pavement markers – type AR-D, B, BB, C, G, or H; one- or two-way reflectivity; colors clear, amber, blue or red.	500	No Bid		\$ 1.35	\$ 1.85	
32	Delineators (Shur-Tite) – 60" flat-top drivable. Size: 60"	75	No Bid		\$ 36.80	No Bid	
33	Delineators (Shur-Tite) – 33" flat mount guardrail. Size: 33"	50	No Bid		\$ 13.54	No Bid	
34	Delineator – 27"; guardrail white sheet; 3" x 9" reflective strip. SIZE: 27"	50	No Bid		\$ 5.66	No Bid	
35	ID Locator – 4"; adheres to existing pavement. SIZE: 4"	100	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
36	Barricade Light – type A/C (two-sided visibility); D-cell, 3 volt, 3-way operation; lens color in red and amber. Can be solar powered.	20	No Bid		\$ 15.60	\$ 22.00	
37	Drum/Barrel Reflector.	20	No Bid		\$ 9.71	\$ 8.99	
38	Orange Fencing - 4' x 100'; rugged and reusable safety fence. SIZE: 4' X 100'	10	\$ 33.99	S	\$ 23.71	\$ 35.00	
SECTION 2: ROLL-UP SIGNS & SIGN STANDS							
40	Stop/Slow Paddle (Rollup) - 24" set; telescopic handle and carrying bag. SIZE: 24"	10	No Bid		\$ 88.05	\$ 55.00	
41	Sign (Reflective Vinyl Rollup) – 36" x 36"; fiberglass ribs and clear hard plastic corner pockets with standard legend; TraFix Device, Dicke, or approved equal. SIZE: 36" x 36"	30	No Bid		\$ 78.29	\$ 88.00	

## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

**P - Primary**

**S - Secondary**

Line #	Description	QTY	Safety Zone Holdings, Inc. d/b/a Safety Zone Specialists Lakeland, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Striping Service and Supply Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Pathmark Traffic Equipment, LLC San Marcos, TX HUB - No CO-OP - No	
			Price		Price		Price	
30	Reflectors (Concrete Barrier) – 16" wall markers for low profile concrete barriers; pre-drilled holes for quick installation; one- or two-sided reflectivity; yellow or white. Size: 16"	100		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 9.95
31	Reflective pavement markers – type AR-D, B, BB, C, G, or H; one- or two-way reflectivity; colors clear, amber, blue or red.	500		\$ 3.20		No Bid		\$ 2.75
32	Delineators (Shur-Tite) – 60" flat-top drivable. Size: 60"	75		No Bid		No Bid	S	\$ 99.00
33	Delineators (Shur-Tite) – 33" flat mount guardrail. Size: 33"	50		No Bid		No Bid	S	\$ 75.00
34	Delineator – 27" ; guardrail white sheet; 3" x 9" reflective strip. SIZE: 27"	50		No Bid		No Bid	S	\$ 9.95
35	ID Locator – 4" ; adheres to existing pavement. SIZE: 4"	100		No Bid		No Bid	P	\$ 4.50
36	Barricade Light – type A/C (two-sided visibility); D-cell, 3 volt, 3-way operation; lens color in red and amber. Can be solar powered.	20	S	\$ 19.85		No Bid		\$ 29.90
37	Drum/Barrel Reflector.	20		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 12.50
38	Orange Fencing - 4' x 100'; rugged and reusable safety fence. SIZE: 4' X 100'	10		\$ 94.90		No Bid		\$ 99.00
SECTION 2: ROLL-UP SIGNS & SIGN STANDS								
40	Stop/Slow Paddle (Rollup) - 24" set; telescopic handle and carrying bag. SIZE: 24"	10		\$ 150.35		No Bid		\$ 115.00
41	Sign (Reflective Vinyl Rollup) – 36" x 36"; fiberglass ribs and clear hard plastic corner pockets with standard legend; TraFix Device, Dicke, or approved equal. SIZE: 36" x 36"	30		\$ 103.60	P	\$ 71.30		\$ 79.00



## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

P - Primary

S - Secondary

Line #	Description	QTY	Price		Price		Buyers Barricades Inc. Richland Hills, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes
42	Sign (Reflective Vinyl Rollup) – 48" x 48"; fiberglass ribs and clear hard plastic corner pockets with standard legend; TraFix Device, Dicke, or approved equal. SIZE: 48" x 48"	30	No Bid	P	\$ 96.41	S	
43	Sign Bag (for roll-up sign) – 36"; TraFix Device or approved equal.SIZE: 36"	10	No Bid	P	\$ 8.99		\$ 55.00
44	Sign Bag (for roll-up sign) – 48"; TraFix Device or approved equal. SIZE: 48"	10	No Bid	P	\$ 10.34		\$ 55.00
45	Sign Stand (Step-N-Drop) – for 36" and 48" signs; TraFix Device or approved equal. SIZE: 36" and 48"	10	No Bid	P	\$ 84.65		\$ 124.95
46	Sign Stand (X-500 Interstate Series – Aluminum) – for rigid and roll-up signs, 30", 36", and 48", withstands winds up to 70 MPH; Eastern Metal USA Sign or approved equal. SIZE: 30", 36", 48"	10	No Bid	S	\$ 186.95		\$ 219.00
47	Sign Stand – 4" x 17.5" x 28" and 38 lbs.; rubber base with steel plate; two Carrying handles; made by Zephyr. SIZE: 4" x 17.5" x 28"	50	No Bid	P	\$ 86.87		\$ 119.00
48	MINIMUM PERCENT DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE FOR SIMILAR ITEMS NOT SPECIFIED.	1	25.0%		10.0%		10.0%
49	DELIVERY TIME	1	5-7 Days		3-14 Days		0-10 Days

**Notes:** Pathmark Traffic Equipment, LLC elected not to have Secondary award designation.

There is no Secondary award for Section 1, Line #35, because only one (1) bid was received.

## F2024041 Annual Contract for Traffic Control Equipment

**P - Primary**

**S - Secondary**

Line #	Description	QTY	Safety Zone Holdings, Inc. d/b/a Safety Zone Specialists Lakeland, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Striping Service and Supply Grand Prairie, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Pathmark Traffic Equipment, LLC San Marcos, TX HUB - No CO-OP - No	
			Price		Price		Price	
42	Sign (Reflective Vinyl Rollup) – 48" x 48"; fiberglass ribs and clear hard plastic corner pockets with standard legend; TraFix Device, Dicke, or approved equal. SIZE: 48" x 48"	30	\$ 144.75		\$ 100.05		\$ 119.00	
43	Sign Bag (for roll-up sign) – 36"; TraFix Device or approved equal.SIZE: 36"	10	\$ 17.95	S	\$ 16.10		\$ 45.00	
44	Sign Bag (for roll-up sign) – 48"; TraFix Device or approved equal. SIZE: 48"	10	\$ 19.40	S	\$ 21.00		\$ 49.00	
45	Sign Stand (Step-N-Drop) – for 36" and 48" signs; TraFix Device or approved equal. SIZE: 36" and 48"	10	\$ 85.50	S	\$ 92.80		\$ 139.00	
46	Sign Stand (X-500 Interstate Series – Aluminum) – for rigid and roll-up signs, 30", 36", and 48", withstands winds up to 70 MPH; Eastern Metal USA Sign or approved equal. SIZE: 30" , 36" , 48"	10			<b>P</b>		\$ 299.00	
47	Sign Stand – 4" x 17.5" x 28" and 38 lbs.; rubber base with steel plate; two Carrying handles; made by Zephyr. SIZE: 4" x 17.5" x 28"	50	\$ 152.50		\$ 171.00	S	\$ 109.00	
48	MINIMUM PERCENT DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE FOR SIMILAR ITEMS NOT SPECIFIED.	1					5.0%	
49	DELIVERY TIME	1					14-21 Days	21-30 Days

**Notes:** Pathmark Traffic Equipment, LLC elected not to have Secondary award designation.

There is no Secondary award for Section 1, Line #35, because only one (1) bid was received.