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April 18, 2024

EAN Holdings LLC

Enterprise Rent A Car

4201 North State Hwy 161

frving, TX. 75038

Current Contact name: James Tex
E-mail: iames b texdbeh com
Phone number: 314-512-3328
Vendor Number: 70095680

Re: BID 2022-209 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM RENTAL OF CARS, TRUCKS,
AND VANS

Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with two (2) options to renew for additional twelve (12)
months each. The original contract term was September 27, 2022 through September 26,
2023. The first renewal term commenced September 27, 2023 through September 26, 2024.
The final renewal term will be September 27, 2024 through September 26, 2025.

)ﬁYes, EAN Holdings LLC will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing through the renewal
period. Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.

{7 No, EAN Holdings LLC will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing through the
renewal period.

T—

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? [1Yes i No
If yes, please retum a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,
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Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer ame:
(P) 817.884.1133 James Tex
(F) 817.884.1133 (P)_2uy-770-Fu?
(E} jmnichols@itarrantcountytx.gov F

(B) _ Tamus v Tex (& ¢m. com
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Memorandum

To: Troy Havard

Dept.: Elections

From: Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department

Date:  April 10, 2024

Re: BID 2022-209 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM RENTAL OF CARS,
TRUCKS, AND VANS

The above referenced contract will expire on 09/26/2024. This contract included options to
renew with the vendor for two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms. The original contract
term was September 27, 2022 through September 26, 2023. The first renewal term
commenced September 27, 2023 through September 26, 2024. The final renewal term will be
September 27, 2024 through September 26, 2025.

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed
below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form
back to me on or before Friday, April 12, 2024.

EAN Holdings LLC
Enterprise Rent A Car

ﬂ Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for

the first and final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be
provided below.

576141 ; 10000 ) 2024 ; 1420000000
(GL acct) ! _(Fund #) / _(Cost Center) /_(Grant# or NRG) _
D No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned

vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

SIGNATURE: P DATE: 4/10/2024




Memorandum

To: Antonio Anguiano

Dept; Public Health

From: Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department

Date:  April 12, 2024

Re: BID 2022-209 ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SHORT-TERM RENTAL OF CARS,
TRUCKS, AND VANS

The above referenced contract will expire on 09/26/2024. This contract included options to
renew with the vendor for two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms. The original contract
term was September 27, 2022 through September 26, 2023. The first renewal term
commenced September 27, 2023 through September 26, 2024. The final renewal term will be
September 27, 2024 through September 26, 2025.

If you wish to exercise this option o renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed
below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form
back to me on or before Friday, April 12, 2024.

EAN Holdings LLC
Enterprise Rent A Car

E/ Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for
the first and final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be
provided below.

57616 ; Grant-2004 ; 5100703000 ; F0100-2024
(GL acct) !/ _(Fund #) ! _(Cost Center) /_(Grant# or NRG) _
D No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned

vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

/(]

/)
SIGNATURE: C /M M’(}\, pate: A-11-7Y




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price
Section 1: Mini Van, 7-Passenger with Stow
Away Seats or Seats Removed
Daily Rental 121$ 75.00 | $ 900.00
Daily Liability Insurance 12 {included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 12 lincluded Included
Weekly Rental 11$ 450.00 | $ 450.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Monthly Rental 201 % 1,800.00 | $ 36,000.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 20 |Included Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 20 |Included Included
Section Total $ 37,350.00
Make/Model Offered Dodge Grand Caravan
Section 2; Mini Van, 7-Passenger with Rear
Seats
Daily Rental 118% 75.00 | $ 75.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 [Included Included
Weekly Rental 218 450.00 | $ 909.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 2 |included Included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 2 |Included Included
Monthly Rental 11% 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included included
Section Total $ 2,775.00

Make/Model Offered

Dodge Grand Caravan




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price

Section 3: Full Size Van, 8-Passenger
Daily Rental 1 | No Bid No Bid
Daily Liability Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Weekly Rental 1 | No Bid No Bid
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Monthly Rental 1 | No Bid No Bid
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Section Total No Bid
Make/Model Offered No Bid
Section 4: Standard Van, 12-Passenger
Daily Rental 11% 125.00 | $ 125.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 |included Included
Daily COW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly Rental 11$% 750.00 | $ 750.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 {included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly Rental 11$% 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 |included Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Section Total $ 3,875.00

Make/Model Offered

Ford Transit, Chevrolet Express
Passenger Van




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
Item Qty Unit Price Ext Price
Section 5: Full Size Van, 15-Passenger
Daily Rental 118% 125.00 | $ 125.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Weekly Rental 11$ 750.00 | $ 750.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 {included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {included Included
Monthly Rental 11% 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 jincluded Included
Section Total $ 3,875.00
Make/Model Offered Ford Transit, Chevrolet Express
Passenger Van
Section 6: Mini Cargo Van
Daily Rental 11% 46.00 | $ 46.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Daily COW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly Rental 118% 275.00 | $ 275.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 {included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included included
Monthly Rental 11$ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included
Section Total $ 1,421.00
Make/Model Offered Nissan NV200




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price

Section 7: 1/2 Ton Cargo Van
Daily Rental 118 55.00 | $ 55.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 |included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |included included
Weekly Rental 11% 330.00 | $ 330.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 Jincluded Included
Monthly Rental 11% 1,300.00 | $ 1,300.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {included Included
Section Total $ 1,685.00

Make/Model Offered

Ford Transit Cargo, Ram Promaster

Section 8: 3/4 Ton Cargo Van

Daily Rental 11% 82.00 | $ 82.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Weekly Rental 11% 370.00 | $ 370.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Monthly Rental 11$% 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included
Section Total $ 1,952.00

Make/Mode! Offered

Ford Transit Cargo, Ram Promaster




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

lrving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price
Section 9: 3/4 Ton Cargo Van, Extended
Daily Rental 11% 65.00 | $ 65.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 Jincluded Included
Weekly Rental 118$ 390.00 | $ 390.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Monthly Rental 118% 1,5650.00 | $ 1,650.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Section Total $ 2,005.00
Make/Model Offered Chevrolet Express Extended Cargo
Section 10: Intermediate SUV
Daily Rental 11% 67.00 | $ 67.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 |Included : Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly Rental 11% 400.00 | $ 400.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 |included included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Monthly Rental 11$% 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Section Total $ 2,067.00

MakeIMode! Offered

Nissan Rogue, Jeep Cherokee




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
tem Qty Unit Price Ext Price

Section 11; Standard SUV
Daily Rental 11$ 75.00 | $ 75.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Daily COW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Weekly Rental 11% 450.00 | $ 450.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Monthly Rental 118 1,800.00 [ $ 1,800.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included
Section Total $ 2,325.00

Make/Model Offered

Ford Explorer, Chevrolet Equinox

Section 12: Large SUV

Daily Rental 119$ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Weekly Rental 11% 660.00 | $ 660.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included , Included
Monthly Rental 11% 2,640.00 | $ 2,640.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Section Total $ 4,400.00

Make/Model Offered

Chevrolet Tahoe, Ford Expedition, Nissan
Armada




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP -Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price

Section 13: Full Size Sedan, 4-Door
Daily Rental 118% 50.00 | $ 50.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 iIncluded Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Weekly Rental 11$ 300.00 | $ 300.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 |included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Monthly Rental 11$ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 |included Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Section Total $ 1,550.00

Make/Model Offered

Toyota Camry, Chevrolet Malibu, Nissan
Altima

Section 14: Standard Sedan, 4-Door

Daily Rental 11% 46,00 | $ 46.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 lIncluded Included

Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included

Weekly Rental 119 275.00 | § 275.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included

Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included

Monthly Rental 118% 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included

Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included

Section Total $ 1,421.00

Make/Model Offered

Volkswagen Jetta




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price
Section 15: Standard Hybrid Sedan, 4-Door
Daily Rental 118% 50.00 | $ 50.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 lIncluded Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included
Weekly Rental 119 300.00 | $ 300.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 jIncluded Included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Monthly Rental 11% 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 jincluded Included
Section Total $ 1,550.00
Make/Model Offered Hyundai Sonata Hybrid
Section 16: Intermediate Sedan, 4-Door
Daily Rental 118 46.00 | $ 46.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly Rental 11% 275.00 | $ 275.00
Weekly Liahility Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Monthly Rental 119 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly COW/LDW insurance 1 |Included Included
Section Total $ 1,421.00

Make/Model Offered

Toyota Corolla, Nissan Sentra




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans
Award
EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car
Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price
Section 17: Small Pickup Truck, Regular Cab, 2
WD
Daily Rental 118 55.00 | $ 55.00
Daily Liability insurance 1 |Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Weekly Rental 11% 330.00 | § 330.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Iincluded Included
Monthly Rental 11% 1,300.00 | $ 1,300.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded included
Section Total $ 1,685.00

Make/Model Offered

Nissan Frontier, Chevrolet Colorado, Ford
Ranger

Section 18: Small Pickup Truck, Extended Cab,

2WD

Daily Rental 119 55.00 | $ 55.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 [Included Included

Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included

Weekly Rental 11% 330.00 | $ 330.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included

Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included

Monthly Rental 119 1,300.00 | $ 1,300.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included '
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded Included

Section Total $ 1,685.00

Make/Model Offered

Nissan Frontier, Chevrolet Colorado, Ford
Ranger




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price

Section 19: Small Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, 2
WD, with Tow Hitch and 7-pin Trailer Connector
Daily Renial 1 | NoBid No Bid
Daily Liability Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Weekly Rental 1 | No Bid No Bid
Woeekly Liability Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Monthly Rental 1 | No Bid No Bid
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 | No Bid No Bid
Section Total No Bid
Make/Model Offered No Bid
Section 20: 1/2 Ton Pickup Truck, Regular Cab,
2WD
Daily Rental 11% 58.00 | $ : 58.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 |included Included
Daily COW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Weekly Rental B 350.00 | $ ~ 350.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 lincluded included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {included Included ,
Monthly Rental 118% 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 jincluded Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 }included Included
Section Total $ 1,808.00

Make/Model Offered

Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150, Dodge
Ram 1500




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price

Section 21: 1/2 Ton Pickup, Extended Cab, 2
WD
Daily Rental 118 58.00 | $ 58.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 {included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly Rental 118% 350.00 | $ 350.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 jIncluded Included
Monthly Rental 11$% 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 |included Included
Monthly COW/LDW Insurance 1 |included included
Section Total $ 1,808.00

Make/Model Offered

Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150,
Dodge Ram 1500

Section 22: 1/2 Ton Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, 2

WD, with Tow Hitch and 7-pin Trailer Connector

Daily Rental 118% 58.00 | $ 58.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 |included Included

Daily COW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included

Weekly Rental 118% 350.00 | $ : 350.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 |Included Include

Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included included

Monthly Rental 11% 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included

Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included

Section Total $ 1,808.00

Make/Model Offered

Chevrolet Silverado 1500, Ford F150,
Dodge Ram 1500




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans
Award
EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car
Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price
Section 23: 3/4 Ton Pickup Truck, Regular Cab,
2WD
Daily Rental 11% 63.00 | $ 63.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Weekly Rental 118% 378.00 | $ 378.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Monthly Rental 118% 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Section Total $ 1,941.00

Make/Model Offered

Ford F-250, Dodge Ram 2500

Section 24: 3/4 Ton Pickup Truck, Extended
Cab, 2 WD

Daily Rental 118 63.00 | $ 63.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 lincluded ' Included
Daily COW/LDW Insurance 1 jincluded Included
Weekly Rental 11% 378.00 | § 378.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 lIncluded Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly Rental 11% 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
Monthly Liability insurance 1 |included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {included Included
Section Total $ 1,941.00

Make/Model Offered

Ford F-250, Dodge Ram 2500




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price

Section 25: 3/4 Ton Pickup Truck, Crew Cab, 2
WD
Daily Rental 118 63.00 | § 63.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 jincluded Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 jincluded Included
Weekly Rental 118% 378.00 | $ 378.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Monthly Rental 118 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 iincluded Included
Section Total $ 1,941.00

Make/Model Offered

Ford F-250, Dodge Ram 2500

Section 26: One (1) Ton Pickup Truck, Extended

Cab, 2 WD

Daily Rental 118 75.00 | $ 75.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 {included Included

Daily COW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included

Weekly Rental 11% 450.00 | $ 450.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 |included included

Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included

Monthly Rental 11$ 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included

Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included

Section Total $ 2,325.00

Make/Model Offered

Ford F-350, Dodge Ram 3500




RFB 2022-209 Annual Contract for Short-Term Rental of Cars, Trucks, and

Vans

Award

EAN Holdings, LLC - Dallas Fort Worth
dba Enterprise Rent-A-Car

Irving, TX
HUB - No
CO-OP - Yes
ltem Qty Unit Price Ext Price
Section 27: One (1) Ton Pickup Truck, Crew
Cab, 2 WD
Daily Rental 11% 75.00 | $ 75.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 |Included Included
Daily CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included
Weekly Rental 118 450.00 | $ 450.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 |included Included
Weekly COW/LDW Insurance 1 }lIncluded included
Monthly Renta! 11% 1,800.00 | $ 1,800.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Section Total $ 2,325.00
Make/Mode! Offered Ford F-350, Dodge Ram 3500
Section 28: Other Vehicles Offered by Bidder
Daily Rental 11% 125.00 | $ 125.00
Daily Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Daily COW/LDW Insurance 1 |included Included
Weekly Rental 11$ 750.00 | $ 750.00
Weekly Liability Insurance 1 {Included Included
Weekly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 {Included Included
Monthly Rental 11% 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
Monthly Liability Insurance 1 lincluded Included
Monthly CDW/LDW Insurance 1 |Included Included
Section Total $ 3,875.00

Make/Model Offered

Premium SUV Chevrolet Suburban/GMC
Yukon XL, Ford Expedition EL

Vehicle Pick-Up Location

Car Rental Truck Rental
2832 W Tth 2554 NE 28th St
Fort Worth, TX Fort Worth, TX

were received.

Notes: No bid received ffom Holt Cat. There is no award for Sections 3 and 19 because no bids






