

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price	
	SECTION 1: PESTICIDES										
3	Deltamethrin 2.00%, 2 x 2.5 gallons/case. DeltaGard or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	DeltaGard & Imperium
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		511662 (DeltaGard) and 500646 (Imperium)
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		Per 2 x 2.5 Gallon Case
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 1,387.50
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 2.18
4	Deltamethrin 2.00%, 30 gallon drum. DeltaGard or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	DeltaGard & Imperium
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		511663 (DeltaGard) and 500647 (Imperium)
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		Per 30 Gallon Drum
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 8,115.00
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 2.12
5	Permethrin 4.6%, Piperonyl Butoxide 4.6%, 2.5 gallon jug. Pursuit RTU 4-4 or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	P	Kontrol 4-4		No Bid		No Bid	S	Perm-X UL 4-4
			Vendor Item #		802405		No Bid		No Bid		501382
			Orderable Unit of Measure		per 2.5 gal jug		No Bid		No Bid		Per 2.5 Gallon Jug
			Price Per Orderable Unit		\$ 64.96		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 98.00
			Price Per Acre		\$ 0.54		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 0.97

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price
6	Permethrin 4.6%, Piperonyl Butoxide 4.6%, 2 x 2.5 gallons/case. Pursuit RTU 4-4 or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	P	Kontrol 4-4	S	PermaSease 4-4 (Permethrin 4.6%)			A
			Vendor Item #		802405		SEASE44-2x2.5			
			Orderable Unit of Measure		per case = 2 x 2.5 gal jug		2x2.5 Gallon Case			
			Price Per Orderable Unit		\$ 129.92		\$ 171.40			
			Price Per Acre		\$ 0.54		\$ 0.72			
7	Permethrin 4.6%, Piperonyl Butoxide 4.6%, 30 gallon drum. Pursuit RTU 4-4 or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	A	Kontrol 4-4	S	PermaSease 4-4 (Permethrin 4.6%)			P
			Vendor Item #		841391		SEASE44-55			
			Orderable Unit of Measure		30 gallon drum		55 Gallon Drum			
			Price Per Orderable Unit		\$ 779.52		\$ 1,885.40			
			Price Per Acre		\$ 3.14		\$ 0.72			
8	Sumithrin 2.00%, 2 x 2.5 gallons/case. Anvil 2+2 or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	Anvil 2+2	
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		11599-2.5	
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		2.5 gallon jug	
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 277.65	
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 2.78	

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price
9	Sumithrin 2.00%, 30 gallon drum. Anvil 2+2 or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid			P	Anvil 2+2	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid				11601	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid				30 gallon drum	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid				\$ 3,251.10	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid				\$ 2.72	No Bid
10	Sumithrin 2.00%, 55 gallon drum. Anvil 2+2 or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid			P	Anvil 2+2	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid				11602	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid				55 gallon drum	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid				\$ 5,870.15	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid				\$ 2.66	No Bid
11	Sumithrin 5.00%, Prallethrin 1% 2 x 2.5 gallons/case. Duet or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid			P	Duet	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid				11780-2.5	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid				2.5 gallon jug	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid				\$ 655.33	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid				\$ 2.62	No Bid

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price
12	Sumithrin 5.00%, Prallethrin 1%,30 gallon drum. Duet or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	Duet	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		11781	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		30 gallon drum	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 7,678.80	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 2.56	No Bid
13	Sumithrin 5.00%, Prallethrin 1%,55 gallon drum. Duet or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	Duet	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		11782	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		55 gallon drum	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 13,475.55	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 2.44	No Bid
14	Naled 87.40%, 30 gallon drum. Dibrom or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid	P	Dibrom Concentrate		No Bid	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		DIB-30		No Bid	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		30 Gallon Drum		No Bid	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		\$ 8,446.50		No Bid	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		\$ 2.19		No Bid	No Bid

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price
15	Malathion 96.50%, 5 gallon pail. Fyfanon ULV Mosquito or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	P	^Fyfanon ULV	S	^Fyfanon ULV			No Bid
			Vendor Item #		846163		FYF-5			No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		Per 2x2.5 gal jug		2x2.5 Gallon Case			No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		\$	409.24	\$	460.60		No Bid
			Price Per Acre		\$	0.51	\$	\$0.51		No Bid
16	Malathion 96.50%, 55 gallon drum. Fyfanon ULV Mosquito or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid	P	Fyfanon ULV Mosquito Insecticide			No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		FYF-55			No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		55 Gallon Drum			No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		\$	4,823.50		No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		\$	0.49		No Bid
17	Bti-5.71%, 40 lb. bag. Sustain MGB or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid		P	Aquabac 400G
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid			509830
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid			Per 40 Pound Bag
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid			\$ 160.00
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid			\$ 32.00

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate		Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price	
18	Bti-7.00%, 200 ct./case, 45-day. FourStar BTI Briquets or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		P	Fourstar 45-day Microbial Briquets	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid			100514285	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid			200 count case	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid			\$ 320.00	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid			\$ 696.00	No Bid
19	Bti-7.00%, 200 ct./case, 150-day. FourStar BTI Briquets or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		P	Fourstar 180-day Microbial Briquet - (150- day no longer available)	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid			100514297	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid			200 count case	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid			\$ 828.00	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid			\$ 1,800.90	No Bid
20	Bti-10.00%, 35 lb. bag. FourStar BTI Multi- Brood CRG or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		P	Fourstar BTI CRG	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid			100515259	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid			35 pound bag	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid			\$ 487.20	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid			\$ 278.40	No Bid

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price
21	Bti-10.31%, One case of 12 cards, individually packaged with 2/cards. Summit B.t.i. briquets or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid		P	Summit Mosquito Dunks
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid			505893
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid			Per Case = 12 x 2-packs (total of 24 briquets)
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid			\$ 52.64
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid			\$ 955.42
22	Bti-10.31%, 72 ct., briquets. Summit B.t.i. Briquets or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	S	MOSQUITO DUNKS 6/PK 12PKS/CS		No Bid		P	Summit Mosquito Dunks
			Vendor Item #		688009		No Bid			511184
			Orderable Unit of Measure		Per case = 12 pks of 6 /cs		No Bid			Per Case = 12 x 6-packs (total of 72 briquets)
			Price Per Orderable Unit		\$ 103.39		No Bid			\$ 94.42
			Price Per Acre		\$ 625.08		No Bid			\$ 571.24
23	Bti-10.31%, 100 ct., briquets. Summit B.t.i. Briquets or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	P	MOSQUITO DUNKS 20/PK 5PKS/CS		No Bid	A	S	Summit Bti Briquets
			Vendor Item #		653683		No Bid			502908
			Orderable Unit of Measure		Per case=20/PK 5PKS/CS		No Bid			Per Case= 5 x 20-packs (total of 100 briquets)
			Price Per Orderable Unit		\$ 97.66		No Bid			\$ 98.75
			Price Per Acre		\$ 425.41		No Bid			\$ 430.16

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price	
24	Bti-37.40%, 25 lb. drum. VectoBac WDG or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid	P	Vectobac WDG		No Bid		*Fallout WDG
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		VECWGDG-25		No Bid		514822
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		25 lb Drum		No Bid		Per 25 Pound Drum
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		\$ 1,128.00		No Bid		\$ 700.00
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		\$ 39.48		No Bid		\$ 24.50
25	Spinosad, 7.48%, 600 ct., tablets. Natular DT or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	Natular DT		No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		11860R		No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		600 count case		No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 361.00		No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 1,045.20		No Bid
26	Spinosad, 7.48%, 2500 ct., tablets. Natular DT or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	Natular DT		No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		11860PK50		No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		2500 count case		No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 1,447.00		No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 1,010.36		No Bid

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate				Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price	
27	Spinosad, 6.25%, 220 ct., briquets. Natular XRT or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	Natular XRT		No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		11850		No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		220 count case		No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 1,210.00		No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 2,398.00		No Bid
			Chemical Bid		No Bid	P	VectoMax WSP		*Natular G30 WSP		No Bid
28	Bti-3%, Bs-3%, 800 pouches/case. FourStar BtiWSP or approved equivalent.	1	Vendor Item #		No Bid		VMXWSP-800		11820WSP		No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		800 WSP/Case		500 count case		No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		\$ 1,656.00		\$ 557.00		No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		\$ 1,803.38		\$ 483.96		No Bid
			Chemical Bid		No Bid	P			*Censor - Fourstar MBG has been discontinued by the manufacturer		No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		Vectomax FG		11900		No Bid
29	Bti-3%, Bs-3%, 40 lb. bag. FourStar Multi-Brood Granule, or approved equivalent.	1	Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		40 lb bag		40 pound bag		No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		\$ 403.20		\$ 154.80		No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		\$ 201.60		\$ 34.83		No Bid
			Chemical Bid		No Bid						
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		VMXFG-40				
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid						

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price
30	Bti-1%, Bs-9%, 35 lb. bag. FourStar Multi-Brood CRC, or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	Fourstar CRG	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		100514311	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		35 pound bag	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 615.65	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 351.80	No Bid
			Chemical Bid	A	^Duplex-G Larvicide (agency/ 2024)	P	VectoPrime FG		^Duplex G	S ^Duplex-G
31	5.35% Bti-1.6%(s) Methoprene, 40 lb. bag. Duplex G or approved equivalent.	1	Vendor Item #		832264		VPRFG-40		100528485	509158
			Orderable Unit of Measure		Per 40 lb bag		40 lb Bag		40 pound bag	Per 40 Pound Bag
			Price Per Orderable Unit		\$ 640.00		\$ 174.80		\$ 640.00	\$ 640.00
			Price Per Acre		\$ 320.00		\$ 87.40		\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00
			Chemical Bid		No Bid	P	D-Fense SC		No Bid	S Suspend Polyzone
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		DFENSESC-12		No Bid	500617
32	Deltamethrin-4.75%, 16 oz. bottle. Suspend Polyzone or approved equivalent.	1	Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		12x1 Pint Case		No Bid	Per 16 Ounce Bottle
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		\$ 549.40		No Bid	\$ 59.19
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		\$ 186.96		No Bid	\$ 241.72

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price
33	Lambda-Cyhalothrin- 9.70%, 32 oz. bottle. Demand CS or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	*D-Fense Sc Insecticide	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	P	Demand CS	
			Vendor Item #	794807	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		506119	
			Orderable Unit of Measure	Per 2 bottles of 16oz = 32oz	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		Per 32 Ounce Bottle (1 Quart)	
			Price Per Orderable Unit	\$ 84.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 138.85	
			Price Per Acre	\$ 3.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 151.21	
34	Lambda-Cyhalothrin- 9.70%, 24 quarts/case. Demand CS or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	P	Demand CS	
			Vendor Item #	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		Demand CS	
			Orderable Unit of Measure	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		Per Case = 24 x 32 Ounce Bottles	
			Price Per Orderable Unit	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 2,328.00	
			Price Per Acre	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 105.63	
35	(S)-Methoprene-2.10%, 40 ct., briquets. Altosid XR Briquets, or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	P	Altosid XR Briquets	
			Vendor Item #	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		510732	
			Orderable Unit of Measure	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		Per Case of 40 Briquets	
			Price Per Orderable Unit	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 203.48	
			Price Per Acre	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		\$ 2,215.90	

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate		Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price	
36	(S)-Methoprene-2.10%, 220 ct., briquets. Altosid XR Briquets, or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	No Bid	P	Metalav XRP (Extended Release Pouch)	A	Altosid XR briquets	S
			Vendor Item #	No Bid		MTLXRP-200		11010-B	
			Orderable Unit of Measure	No Bid		200 WSP Per Case		220 count case	
			Price Per Orderable Unit	No Bid		\$ 490.00		\$ 842.60	
			Price Per Acre	No Bid		\$ 1,067.22		\$ 1,669.88	
									842.60
37	Mineral Oil-97%, 5 gallon pail. BVA2 or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	No Bid	S	BVA 2 Larvicide Oil		No Bid	P
			Vendor Item #	No Bid		BVA2-5		No Bid	
			Orderable Unit of Measure	No Bid		5 Gallon Pail		No Bid	
			Price Per Orderable Unit	No Bid		\$ 92.85		No Bid	
			Price Per Acre	No Bid		\$ 92.85		No Bid	
									87.93
38	Mineral Oil-97%, 55 gallon drum. BVA2 or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid	*MaxPar G260 oil	S	BVA 2 Larvicide Oil		No Bid	P
			Vendor Item #	844373		BVA2-55		No Bid	
			Orderable Unit of Measure	per 55 gal drum		55 Gallon Drum		No Bid	
			Price Per Orderable Unit	\$ 628.29		\$ 1,021.35		No Bid	
			Price Per Acre	\$ 57.18		\$ 92.85		No Bid	
									83.76

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate			Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price
39	Mineral Oil-10%, 2 x 2.5 gallons/case. Cocobear or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
40	Mineral Oil-10%, 30 gallon drum. Cocobear or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	CocoBear	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		11345-2.5	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		2.5 gallon jug-CocoBear is only available in 2.5 gallon jugs and 55 gallon drums	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 166.40	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 332.80	No Bid
41	Mineral Oil-10%, 55 gallon drum. Cocobear or approved equivalent.	1	Chemical Bid		No Bid		No Bid	P	CocoBear	No Bid
			Vendor Item #		No Bid		No Bid		11349	No Bid
			Orderable Unit of Measure		No Bid		No Bid		55 gallon drum	No Bid
			Price Per Orderable Unit		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 2,520.65	No Bid
			Price Per Acre		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 229.15	No Bid

F2024034 Annual Contract for Mosquito Control Pesticides and Other Products

P - Primary S - Secondary A - Alternate				Veseris (ES OPCO USA LLC) Austin, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		ADAPCO, LLC Lake Mary, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Clarke Mosquito Control Products, Inc. St. Charles, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Target Specialty Products Carrollton, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Price		Price		Price		Price	
	SECTION 2: MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS										
43	BG-2 Sentinel Mosquito Trap, 7.5 - 12 Volt,BioQuip 2883, No Substitutions	1	Each	No Bid		No Bid		P	\$ 159.65	No Bid	
44	Replacement Catch Bag for BG-2 Sentinel Trap, BioQuip 2883C, No Substitutions	1	Each	No Bid		No Bid		P	\$ 6.89	No Bid	
45	Replacement 12 Volt Fan for BG-2BioQuip 2883F, No Substitutions	1	Each	No Bid		No Bid		P	\$ 32.45	No Bid	
46	Replacement Intake Funnel w/ Shutter Set for BG-2BioQuip 2883FB, No Substitutions	1	Each	No Bid		No Bid		P	\$ 10.82	No Bid	
47	Replacement Power Supply for BG-2 BioQuip 2883PS, No Substitutions	1	Each	No Bid		No Bid		P	\$ 38.10	No Bid	
48	Battery Charger and Maintainer, 6/12 VDC, ATEC#9003, or approved equivalent.	1	Each	No Bid		No Bid			No Bid	No Bid	

Notes: Award recommendations for Section 1 are based on low bid per Acre, based on Highest Application Rate. Equivalents were determined on the product's active ingredient and comparable equivalent.

*Item bid did not meet specifications because the required active chemical ingredients and percentages were not equivalent to those specified.

^Tie bids received.

There are no awards for Section 1, Item 39 and Section 2, Item 48 because only no-bids were received for these items.

There are no secondary or alternate awards for Section 1, items 3-4, 8-14, 16-21, 25-27, 30, 34-35 and 40-41 because only one bid was received. There are no secondary or alternate awards for Section 2, items 43-47 because only one (1) bid was received.

There are no alternate awards for Section 1, Items 5, 15, 22, 32 and 37 because only two (2) bids were received.