

Bid No. F2024111 Annual Contract for Aftermarket
Automotive Parts

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Award			Award			Award		
				NAPA Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Parts Authority LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
1	Battery Group 65, brand: AC Delco Alternative Part Price	11	EA	Total Price	\$19,967.93		Total Price	\$30,185.32		Total Price	\$24,544.92	
				Unit			Unit			Unit		
					No Bid			No Bid		\$103.26	\$1,135.86	
2	Battery Group 31T, brand: AC Delco Alternative Part Price	12	EA	147.48	\$1,622.28		\$87.06	\$957.66		No Bid		
				East Penn/Battery Group 65			Exide/Battery Group 65			No Bid		
					No Bid			No Bid		\$112.52	\$1,350.24	
3	Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 42488 Alternative Part Price	39	EA	\$155.63	\$1,867.56		\$116.26	\$1,395.12		No Bid		
				East Penn/Battery Group 31T			Exide/Battery Group 31T			No Bid		
				\$14.45	\$563.55			No Bid			No Bid	
4	Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 46935 Alternative Part Price	19	EA	No Bid			\$9.76	\$380.64		\$10.88	\$424.32	
				No Bid			Premium Guard/PA5315			Baldwin/PA4113		
				\$10.00	\$190.00			No Bid			No Bid	
5	Cabin Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 24579 Alternative Part Price	9	EA	No Bid			\$5.89	\$111.91		\$7.93	\$150.67	
				No Bid			Premium Guard/PA2366			Baldwin/PA4321		
				\$8.89	\$80.01			No Bid			No Bid	
6	Cabin Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 24068 Alternative Part Price	6	EA	No Bid			\$9.61	\$86.49		\$7.20	\$64.80	
				No Bid			Premium Guard/PC4579			Baldwin/PA10136		
				\$6.66	\$39.96			No Bid			No Bid	
7	Cabin Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 49082 Alternative Part Price	25	EA	No Bid			\$6.97	\$41.82		\$5.36	\$32.16	
				No Bid			Premium Guard/PC4068			Baldwin/PA4461		
				\$13.13	\$328.25			No Bid			No Bid	
8	Brake Pad, brand: Wagner, part # SX1707 Alternative Part Price	43	EA	No Bid			\$6.31	\$157.75		\$10.65	\$266.25	
				No Bid			Premium Guard/HC49082			Baldwin/PA5359		
					No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	
9	Brake Pad, brand: Wagner, part # SX1363 Alternative Part Price	79	EA	\$32.99	\$1,418.57		\$55.77	\$2,398.11		\$55.89	\$2,403.27	
				NAPA/SG8312X			Centric/307.17070			PowerStop Top Cop/Z37-1707		
					No Bid			No Bid			No Bid	

Bid No. F2024111 Annual Contract for Aftermarket

Automotive Parts

Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Bumper to Bumper Cleburne, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. Fort Worth, TX HUB - No			Custom Trucks Unlimited Of NRH Haltom City, TX HUB - No		
				Total Price	Unit	Extended	Total Price	Unit	Extended	Total Price	Unit	Extended
1	Battery Group 65, brand: AC Delco Alternative Part Price	11	EA		No Bid			No Bid			\$164.96	\$1,814.56
				\$136.20		\$1,498.20	\$115.00		\$1,265.00	No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			Continental/Battery Group 65			Continental/Battery Group 65			No Bid		
2	Battery Group 31T, brand: AC Delco Alternative Part Price	12	EA		No Bid			No Bid		\$164.96		\$1,979.52
				\$143.01		\$1,716.12	\$85.00		\$1,020.00	No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			Continental/Battery Group 31T			FVP/Battery Group 31T			No Bid		
3	Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 42488 Alternative Part Price	39	EA		No Bid			No Bid		\$34.49		\$1,345.11
				\$11.44		\$446.16	\$26.60		\$1,037.40	No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
4	Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 46935 Alternative Part Price	19	EA		No Bid			No Bid		\$26.24		\$498.56
				\$7.93		\$150.67	\$20.99		\$398.81	No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
5	Cabin Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 24579 Alternative Part Price	9	EA		No Bid			No Bid		\$23.24		\$209.16
				\$7.04		\$63.36	\$16.80		\$151.20	No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
6	Cabin Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 24068 Alternative Part Price	6	EA		No Bid			No Bid		\$17.24		\$103.44
				\$5.28		\$31.68	\$13.29		\$79.74	No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
7	Cabin Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 49082 Alternative Part Price	25	EA		No Bid			No Bid		\$34.49		\$862.25
				\$11.91		\$297.75	\$20.21		\$505.25	No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
8	Brake Pad, brand: Wagner, part # SX1707 Alternative Part Price	43	EA		No Bid			No Bid		\$68.99		\$2,966.57
				\$59.84		\$2,573.12	\$57.64		\$2,478.52	No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			Raybestos/SP1707PPH		
9	Brake Pad, brand: Wagner, part # SX1363	79	EA		No Bid			No Bid				
				\$61.64		\$4,869.56	\$51.79		\$4,091.41	No Bid		

Bid No. F20241111 Annual Contract for Aftermarket
Automotive Parts

				O'Reilly Auto Parts Springfield, MO HUB - No		Straus-Frank Enterprises, LLC Raleigh, NC HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Total Price	Extended	Total Price	*\$23,392.97
1	Battery Group 65, brand: AC Delco Alternative Part Price	11	EA	No Bid		No Bid	
	Alternate Make/Part Number			\$85.34	\$938.74	\$150.34	\$1,653.74
2	Battery Group 31T, brand: AC Delco Alternative Part Price	12	EA	No Bid		No Bid	
	Alternate Make/Part Number			\$119.15	\$1,429.80	\$132.84	\$1,594.08
3	Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 42488 Alternative Part Price	39	EA	\$17.15	\$668.85	No Bid	
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid		\$9.28	\$361.92
4	Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 46935 Alternative Part Price	19	EA	\$11.89	\$225.91	No Bid	
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid		\$7.04	\$133.76
5	Cabin Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 24579 Alternative Part Price	9	EA	\$10.57	\$95.13	No Bid	
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid		\$9.28	\$83.52
6	Cabin Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 24068 Alternative Part Price	6	EA	\$7.92	\$47.52	No Bid	
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid		\$7.30	\$43.80
7	Cabin Air Filter, brand: WIX, part # 49082 Alternative Part Price	25	EA	\$15.75	\$393.75	No Bid	
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid		\$12.84	\$321.00
8	Brake Pad, brand: Wagner, part # SX1707 Alternative Part Price	43	EA	\$70.66	\$3,038.38	No Bid	
	Alternate Make/Part Number			Raybestos/SP1707TRH		Carquest/FLD1707	
9	Brake Pad, brand: Wagner, part # SX1363	79	EA	No Bid		No Bid	

Bid No. F2024111 Annual Contract for Aftermarket

Automotive Parts

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	NAPA Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Parts Authority LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Total Price	\$19,967.93	Extended	Total Price	\$30,185.32	Extended	Total Price	\$24,544.92	Extended
10	Brake Rotor,brand: Wagner, part # BD126457E	58	EA	Unit			Unit			Unit		
				\$32.99	\$2,606.21	\$67.22	\$5,310.38	\$61.05	\$4,822.95			
				NAPA/SG8472X			Centric/307.13630			PowerStop Top Cop/Z37-1367		
11	Brake Rotor,brand: Wagner, part # BD180535E	16	EA	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				\$43.00	\$2,494.00	\$75.06	\$4,353.48	\$57.00	\$3,306.00			
				NAPA/48880422			Brembo/09.B534.11			Durago DTS/BR5513301		
12	Brake Rotor,brand: Wagner, part # BD180409E	141	EA	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				\$43.00	\$688.00	\$76.38	\$1,222.08	\$57.00	\$912.00			
				NAPA/48880982			MPA/BR75010G			Durago DTS/BR90115801		
13	Fuel Filter, brand: AC Delco, part #TP1015	10	EA	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				\$43.00	\$6,063.00	\$84.32	\$11,889.12	\$57.00	\$8,037.00			
				NAPA/48880279			Brembo/09.A406.21			Durago DTS/BR5509701		
14	Fuel Filter, brand: WIX, part # WF10255NP	9	EA	\$28.34	\$283.40	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.68	\$226.80	Baldwin/PF46126		
				WIX/600451			No Bid					
				No Bid		\$59.94	\$539.46	No Bid		No Bid		
15	Wiper blade, brand: Trico, part # 14-1HB	10	EA	\$38.98	\$350.82	No Bid	No Bid	\$31.00	\$279.00	Baldwin/PF46108		
				NAPA/600255NP			No Bid					
				No Bid		No Bid		\$5.60	\$56.00			
16	Wiper Blade, brand: ANCO, part # 31-13	20	EA	\$11.12	\$111.20	\$2.96	\$29.60	No Bid		No Bid		
				NAPA/60141			Anco/31-14			No Bid		
				No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		
17	Brake Cleaner, brand: Berrymans, part # 1420	180	EA	\$11.12	\$222.40	\$5.13	\$102.60	\$4.20	\$84.00	Trico/13-1		
				NAPA/60131			Trico/13-1					
				No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
18	Miniature Lamp, brand: Philips, part # 194CP	40	EA	\$4.39	\$790.20	\$2.76	\$496.80	\$3.40	\$612.00	Johnsens/2413		
				CRC Chemical/05089			Johnsens/2417			Johnsens/2413		
				No Bid		\$2.90	\$116.00	\$3.60	\$144.00			
	Alternative Part Price			\$3.27	\$130.80	No Bid		No Bid				

Bid No. F20241111 Annual Contract for Aftermarket
Automotive Parts

Award

Bumper to Bumper Cleburne, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes				Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. Fort Worth, TX HUB - No				Custom Trucks Unlimited Of NRH Haltom City, TX HUB - No				
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Total Price	Extended	Unit	Total Price	Unit	Extended	Total Price	Unit	Extended
	Alternative Part Price			\$32,825.55		No Bid	*\$29,003.92			\$39,347.79		
	Alternate Make/Part Number						No Bid			\$8,649.71		
10	Brake Rotor,brand: Wagner, part # BD126457E	58	EA	\$75.59	\$4,384.22		\$51.51		\$2,987.58	No Bid		
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			No Bid			\$86.24		\$5,001.92
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			Power Stop/AR8658EVC		
11	Brake Rotor,brand: Wagner, part # BD180535E	16	EA	\$94.49	\$1,511.84		\$81.16		\$1,298.56	No Bid		
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			No Bid			\$112.49		\$1,799.84
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			DFC/604-54266		
12	Brake Rotor,brand: Wagner, part # BD180409E	141	EA	\$91.34	\$12,878.94		\$82.24		\$11,595.84	No Bid		
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			No Bid			\$89.99		\$12,688.59
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			Power Stop/AR8654EVC		
13	Fuel Filter, brand: AC Delco, part #TP1015	10	EA	\$30.59	\$305.90		\$36.61		\$366.10	\$58.49		\$584.90
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
14	Fuel Filter, brand: WIX, part # WF10255NP	9	EA	\$36.33	\$326.97		\$63.79		\$574.11	\$93.74		\$843.66
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
15	Wiper blade, brand: Trico, part # 14-1HB	10	EA	\$6.97	\$69.70		\$6.56		\$65.60	No Bid		
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
16	Wiper Blade, brand: ANCO, part # 31-13	20	EA	\$4.37	\$87.40		\$4.67		\$93.40	No Bid		
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
17	Brake Cleaner, brand: Berrymans, part # 1420	180	EA	\$8.54	\$1,537.20		\$5.53		\$995.40	No Bid		
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
18	Miniature Lamp, brand: Philips, part # 194CP	40	EA	\$0.74	\$29.60		No Bid			No Bid		
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		

Bid No. F2024111 Annual Contract for Aftermarket
Automotive Parts

O'Reilly Auto Parts Springfield, MO HUB - No				Straus-Frank Enterprises, LLC Raleigh, NC HUB - No			
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Total Price	Extended	Unit	Extended
	Alternative Part Price			\$53,582.50	\$5,753.57	\$51.86	\$4,096.94
	Alternate Make/Part Number			Raybestos/SP1363TRH			
10	Brake Rotor,brand: Wagner, part # BD126457E	58	EA	No Bid			
	Alternative Part Price			\$115.50	\$6,699.00	\$58.49	\$3,392.42
	Alternate Make/Part Number			Raybestos/580422P			
11	Brake Rotor,brand: Wagner, part # BD180535E	16	EA	No Bid			
	Alternative Part Price			\$143.50	\$2,296.00	No Bid	
	Alternate Make/Part Number			Raybestos/680982P			
12	Brake Rotor,brand: Wagner, part # BD180409E	141	EA	No Bid			
	Alternative Part Price			\$206.50	\$29,116.50	\$54.40	\$7,670.40
	Alternate Make/Part Number			Raybestos/580875PER			
13	Fuel Filter, brand: AC Delco, part #TP1015	10	EA	No Bid			
	Alternative Part Price			\$35.03	\$350.30	\$27.48	\$274.80
	Alternate Make/Part Number			WIX/WF10451			
14	Fuel Filter, brand: WIX, part # WF10255NP	9	EA	No Bid			
	Alternative Part Price			\$47.93	\$431.37	\$37.83	\$340.47
	Alternate Make/Part Number			WIX/WF10255NP			
15	Wiper blade, brand: Trico, part # 14-1HB	10	EA	\$27.52	\$275.20	\$10.03	\$100.30
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			
16	Wiper Blade, brand: ANCO, part # 31-13	20	EA	No Bid			
	Alternative Part Price			\$4.50	\$90.00	\$10.03	\$200.60
	Alternate Make/Part Number			Trico/31-130			
17	Brake Cleaner, brand: Berrymans, part # 1420	180	EA	\$7.99	\$1,438.20	No Bid	
	Alternative Part Price			No Bid			
	Alternate Make/Part Number			No Bid			
18	Miniature Lamp, brand: Philips, part # 194CP	40	EA	No Bid			
	Alternative Part Price			\$2.20	\$88.00	No Bid	

Bid No. F2024111 Annual Contract for Aftermarket
Automotive Parts

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Award			Award			Award		
				NAPA Auto Parts Fort Worth, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Parts Authority LLC New Hyde Park, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	XL Parts LLC Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	Total Price	Unit	Extended	Total Price	Unit	Extended
19	Miniature lamp, brand: Philips, part # 3157CP	36	EA	Alternate Make/Part Number			Alternate Make/Part Number			Alternate Make/Part Number		
				NAPA/BP194N			NAPA/BP157N			NAPA/BP157N		
20	AC Delco brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				50%			50%			50%		
	Exide brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				62%			62%			62%		
	Continental brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				73%			73%			73%		
	NAPA brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				61.63%			61.63%			61.63%		
	Baldwin brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				80%			80%			80%		
	East Penn brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				38.8%			38.8%			38.8%		
	Premium Guard brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				77%			77%			77%		
	WIX brand parts percentage discount offered			75%			75%			75%		
				No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
	Centric brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				71%			71%			71%		
	Brembo brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				62%			62%			62%		
	Wagner brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				62%			62%			62%		
	MPA brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				71%			71%			71%		
	Trico brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				69%			69%			69%		
	PowerStop Top Cop brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				57%			57%			57%		
	Durago DTS brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				50%			50%			50%		
	Anco brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				82%			82%			82%		
	Berrymans brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				58%			58%			58%		
	Raybestos brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				50%			50%			50%		
	Johnsen's brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				58%			58%			58%		
	CRC Chemical brand parts percentage discount offered			74%			74%			74%		
				No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
	Eiko brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				50%			50%			50%		
	Philips brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
				70%			70%			70%		

*Straus-Frank Enterprises, LLC and Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. were

deemed nonresponsive for failing to provide pricing for each item as

required per specifications.

No bids were submitted by Industrial Power LLC, Hi-Line Electric Co. Inc, and
Main Street Signs & Graphics.

Bid No. F20241111 Annual Contract for Aftermarket
Automotive Parts

Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Bumper to Bumper Cleburne, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. Fort Worth, TX HUB - No			Custom Trucks Unlimited Of NRH Haltom City, TX HUB - No		
				Total Price	Unit	Extended	Total Price	Unit	Extended	Total Price	Unit	Extended
19	Miniature lamp, brand: Philips, part # 3157CP	36	EA	<u>\$1.31</u>		<u>\$47.16</u>	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Alternate Make/Part Number											
	Alternate Part Price											
20	Alternate Make/Part Number											
	Percentage discount for parts not listed											
	AC Delco brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>40%</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Exide brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>53%</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Continental brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>51%</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	NAPA brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Baldwin brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	East Penn brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Premium Guard brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	WIX brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>80%</u>			No Bid		29%	No Bid		25%
	Centric brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Brembo brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Wagner brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>55%</u>			No Bid		25%	No Bid		25%
	MPA brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Trico brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>54.52%</u>			No Bid		30%	No Bid		No Bid
	PowerStop Top Cop brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Durago DTS brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Anco brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>56.19%</u>			No Bid		20%	No Bid		No Bid
	Berrymans brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>55%</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Raybestos brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Johnsen's brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	CRC Chemical brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Eiko brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>No Bid</u>			No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid
	Philips brand parts percentage discount offered			<u>55%</u>			No Bid		30%	No Bid		No Bid

*Straus-Frank Enterprises, LLC and Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. were

deemed nonresponsive for failing to provide pricing for each item as

required per specifications.

No bids were submitted by Industrial Power LLC, Hi-Line Electric Co. Inc, and
Main Street Signs & Graphics.

Bid No. F20241111 Annual Contract for Aftermarket
Automotive Parts

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	O'Reilly Auto Parts Springfield, MO HUB - No		Straus-Frank Enterprises, LLC Raleigh, NC HUB - No	
				Total Price	Extended	Total Price	Extended
19	Miniature lamp, brand: Philips, part # 3157CP	36	EA	Unit	Eiko/194	Unit	No Bid
20	Alternative Part Price			\$5.73	\$206.28	\$0.73	\$26.28
				Eiko/3157		Carquest/CQ-3157	
	Alternative Make/Part Number			41%		50%	
	Percentage discount for parts not listed			No Bid		50%	
	AC Delco brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Exide brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Continental brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	NAPA brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Baldwin brand parts percentage discount offered			64%		No Bid	
	East Penn brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Premium Guard brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	WIX brand parts percentage discount offered			66%		65%	
	Centric brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Brembo brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Wagner brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		50%	
	MPA brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Trico brand parts percentage discount offered			44%		50%	
	PowerStop Top Cop brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Durago DTS brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Anco brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		50%	
	Berrymans brand parts percentage discount offered			41%		50%	
	Raybestos brand parts percentage discount offered			44%		No Bid	
	Johnsen's brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	CRC Chemical brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		No Bid	
	Eiko brand parts percentage discount offered			67%		No Bid	
	Philips brand parts percentage discount offered			No Bid		50%	

*Straus-Frank Enterprises, LLC and Buck's Wheel & Equipment Co. were

deemed nonresponsive for failing to provide pricing for each item as required per specifications.
No bids were submitted by Industrial Power LLC, Hi-Line Electric Co. Inc, and Main Street Signs & Graphics.