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January 17, 2024

Pursuit Safety, Inc.

4947 State Hwy 276

Royse City, TX. 75189

Contact: Tony Edgemon at 972-772-4747
E-mail: tony@pursuitsafety.com

Preferred E-mail: Sales@pursuitsafety.com
Additional Contact: Wade Schleif

Vendor Number: 7003328

Re: BID NO. 2022—151 Annual Contract for Prisoner Transport Van Conversion
Dear Sir/Madam:

Referenced bid was for twelve (12) months with two (2) options to renew for additional twelve (12) months
each. The original contract was for the period of June 28, 2022 through June 27, 2023. The effective
dates for the first renewal option ran from June 28, 2023 through June 27, 2024. The final renewal is
effective June 28, 2024 through June 27, 2025.

Y?(Yes, Pursuit Safety, Inc. will accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing through the renewal
period. Please include a current 1295 Form with your response.

0 No, Pursuit Safety, Inc. will NOT accept the offer to extend the same contract pricing through the
renewal period.

Are any other governmental entities currently utilizing this contract? 0O Yes Q/ No
If yes, please return a listing of the participating entities with this letter.

Please fax or email your signed response.

Sincerely,

e Nidhels

#

v

Name:
Wade Schleif

Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer Wade Schleif

(P) 817.884.1133

(F) 817.884.1133
(E) jmnichols@tarrantcountytx.gov

(P) (972) 772-4747
(F) (972) 722-1624
(E) sales@pursuitsafety.com




Memorandum

To: Joylee Russell

Dept.. Transportation

From: Julie Nichols, Senior Buyer, Purchasing Department
Date: December 27, 2023

Re: BID 2022—151 Annual Contract for Prisoner Transport Van Conversion

The above referenced contract will expire on 06/27/2024. This contract included options to
renew with the vendor for two (2) additional twelve (12) month terms. The first renewal term
commenced June 28, 2023 through June 27, 2024. This final renewal term will commence
June 28, 2024 through June 27, 2025.

If you wish to exercise this option to renew and continue this contract with the vendor(s) listed
below for twelve (12) more months, please check the appropriate boxes and email this form
back to me on or before Friday, January 5, 2024.

Pursuit Safety, Inc.

X Yes, | wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned vendor(s) for

the first and final renewal term of the contract. Account information must be
provided below.

10000-2024 /111600 /6840200000 / NGR

(GL acct) / _(Fund #) | _(Cost Center) /_(Grant# or NRG) _

|:| No, | do not wish to continue the current contract with the above mentioned
vendor(s) for the following reason(s).

SIGNATURE: Joylee Russell DATE: 12/27/2023



RFB 2022-151 A/C for Prisoner Van Conversion

Award

PURSUIT SAFETY, INC

ROYSE CITY, TX
Coop Yes
HUB No
ltem| Description | Qty Price Total
Section 1: New System Installation - Custom Built
1 Extradition System 2 No bid No bid
2 Transport System No bid No bid
3 | Pick Up Delivery Fee No bid No bid
Section Total
Section 2: New System Installation - Prefabricated Kit
1 Extradition System $ 15,500.00 | $ 15,500.00
2 Transport System $ 28,800.00 | $ 28,800.00
3 | Pick Up Delivery Fee CGtoPU/Deliver | CGtoPU/Deliver
Section Total $ 44,300.00
Section 3: Refurbishment of Existing System - Custom Built
1 Extradition System 11% 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00
2 Transport System 719 9,200.00 | $ 64,400.00
3 | Pick Up Delivery Fee | 1 | CGtoPU/Deliver [ CGtoPU/Deliver
Section Total $ 71,900.00
Section 4; Refurbishment of Existing System - Prefabricated Kit
1 Extradition System $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00
2 Transport System $ 9,200.00 | § 9,200.00
3 | Pick Up Delivery Fee CGtoPU/Deliver | CGtoPU/Deliver
Section Total $ 16,700.00
Additional Pricing
Hourly Rate for Repairs to Existing
Systems $85.00
Parts Mark-Up for Parts Used
During Repairs 5%






