

Bid No. F2024078 Annual Contract for Tactical Gear

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award

				RG Beck AZ, Inc. d/b/a TYR Tactical, LLC Peoria, AZ HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Z Bar Supply Company LLC Muleshoe, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section 1. Tactical Entry Body Armor Carrier System	1	EA	<u>P \$16,291.85</u>	<u>\$16,291.85</u>	No Bid	
1.1	Tactical Entry Body Armor Carrier (includes Carrier, Chest & Rear Plate, and Side Ballistics)	5	EA	<u>\$2,916.97</u>		No Bid	
1.2	Carrier Accessory Pouch	10	EA	<u>\$170.70</u>		No Bid	
1.3	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA	<u>15.0%</u>		No Bid	
2	Section 2. Tactical Headgear System	1	EA	No Bid		<u>P \$414,520.00</u>	<u>\$414,520.00</u>
2.1	Tactical Communication Over-Ear Headset	5	EA			<u>\$1,420.00</u>	
2.2	Tactical Communication Headset Rail Mount adapter kit	5	EA			<u>\$145.00</u>	
2.3	Tactical Communication Headsets PTT system with cables	5	EA			<u>\$1,975.00</u>	
2.4	Tactical Communication In-Ear Headset	20	EA			<u>\$840.00</u>	
2.5	Tactical Helmet	35	EA			<u>\$1,560.00</u>	
2.6	Tactical Protective Gas Mask with Laser Outsert	32	EA			<u>\$1,910.00</u>	
2.7	Night Vision Goggles with Advanced Target Pointer/Illuminator	20	EA			<u>\$12,695.00</u>	
2.8	Target Illuminator Switch	20	EA			<u>\$120.00</u>	
2.9	Helmet Mounted IR Umbrella Light	20	EA			<u>\$400.00</u>	
3	Section 3. Stand Alone Tactical Shield System	1	EA	<u>P \$11,206.24</u>	<u>\$11,206.24</u>	No Bid	
3.1	Stand Alone Tactical Shield with Viewport	2	EA	<u>\$5,096.56</u>		No Bid	
3.2	Shield Light	2	EA	<u>\$506.56</u>		No Bid	
4	Section 4. Mobile Tactical Shield System	1	EA	<u>P \$29,297.40</u>	<u>\$29,297.40</u>	No Bid	
4.1	Mobile Tactical Shield with Viewport	2	EA	<u>\$5,946.56</u>		No Bid	
4.2	Mobile Tactical Shield without Viewport	2	EA	<u>\$4,462.46</u>		No Bid	
4.3	Shield Light	4	EA	<u>\$506.56</u>		No Bid	
4.4	Ballistic Shield Dolly	2	EA	<u>\$3,226.56</u>		No Bid	

Bid No. F2024078 Annual Contract for Tactical Gear

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award

Line # Description		QTY	UOM	G T Distributors, Inc. Pflugerville, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Princip Defense LLC Mount Pleasant, SC HUB - No	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section 1. Tactical Entry Body Armor Carrier System	1	EA	S \$22,100.60	\$22,100.60	\$7,500.00	\$7,500.00
1.1	Tactical Entry Body Armor Carrier (includes Carrier, Chest & Rear Plate, and Side Ballistics)	5	EA	\$3,383.52		\$1,450.00	
1.2	Carrier Accessory Pouch	10	EA	\$518.30		\$25.00	
1.3	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA	33.0%			
2	Section 2. Tactical Headgear System	1	EA	No Bid		No Bid	
2.1	Tactical Communication Over-Ear Headset	5	EA				
2.2	Tactical Communication Headset Rail Mount adapter kit	5	EA				
2.3	Tactical Communication Headsets PTT system with cables	5	EA				
2.4	Tactical Communication In-Ear Headset	20	EA				
2.5	Tactical Helmet	35	EA			No Bid	
2.6	Tactical Protective Gas Mask with Laser Outsert	32	EA				
2.7	Night Vision Goggles with Advanced Target Pointer/Illuminator	20	EA				
2.8	Target Illuminator Switch	20	EA				
2.9	Helmet Mounted IR Umbrella Light	20	EA				
3	Section 3. Stand Alone Tactical Shield System	1	EA	No Bid		\$4,900.00	\$4,900.00
3.1	Stand Alone Tactical Shield with Viewport	2	EA			\$2,300.00	
3.2	Shield Light	2	EA			\$150.00	
4	Section 4. Mobile Tactical Shield System	1	EA	No Bid		No Bid	
4.1	Mobile Tactical Shield with Viewport	2	EA				
4.2	Mobile Tactical Shield without Viewport	2	EA				
4.3	Shield Light	4	EA				
4.4	Ballistic Shield Dolly	2	EA				

*The apparent low bid received from Princip Defense LLC did not meet specified ballistics ratings for section 1 and the offered carrier did not include ballistics in the shoulder straps as required. The apparent low bid received from Princip Defense LLC did not meet specifications for section 3 because the offered shield does not meet specified ballistics rating and exceeds plate thickness as required.