

Bid No. F2024087 Annual Contract for Ammunition

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	G T Distributors, Inc. Pflugerville, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			IOF Inc. Dalton Gardens, ID HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
1	Section 1. Speer	1	Rounds	P	\$33,465.50		S	\$34,575.00	
1.1	Speer Duty: 9mm +P 124 gr. Gold Dot Hollow Point, Speer LE, 53617	35000	Rounds		\$0.5445			\$0.529	
1.2	Speer Duty: 45 Auto 230gr Gold Dot Hollow Point, 53966	10000	Rounds		\$0.6604			\$0.64	
1.3	Speer Duty: .40 S&W 180gr Gold Dot Hollow Point, 53962	10000	Rounds		\$0.6031			\$0.57	
1.4	Speer Duty: 357 SIG 125gr Gold Dot Hollow Point LP, 53918	3000	Rounds		\$0.591			\$1.32	
1.5	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA		8.0%			20.0%	
2	Section 2. Federal	1	Rounds	S	\$153,972.80		P	\$134,740.00	
2.1	Federal Duty: Tactical Buckshot 12 Gauge 9-Pellet 00-Buck, Federal LE, LE132 00	8000	Rounds		\$0.789			\$0.92	
2.2	Federal Duty: .223 62 gr. Tactical Bonded SP, Federal, LE223T3, 223 Remington Caliber	50000	Rounds		\$1.7161			\$1.32	
2.3	Federal Training: .223 55 gr. Full Metal Jacket (FMJ) Boat Tail, AE223, 223 Remington Caliber	75000	Rounds		\$0.5802			\$0.56	
2.4	Federal Training: 9mm Luger 147 gr. Full Metal Jacket (FMJ) Flat Point, AE9FP, 9 mm Luger Caliber	54000	Rounds		\$0.2894			\$0.31	
2.5	Federal Training: American Eagle 230gr. .45acp FMJ, AE45A	6000	Rounds		\$0.4522			\$0.44	
2.6	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA		8.0%			20.0%	
3	Section 3. Hornady	1	Rounds	P	\$247,856.30			\$0.00	
3.1	Hornady Duty: 53 Gr. GMX Tap Patrol, 80295, 0.223 Caliber	100000	Rounds		\$1.231		No Bid		
3.2	Hornady Duty: 135 gr. 9mm Luger +P, 90225, 9mm Caliber	1000	Rounds		\$0.6062		No Bid		
3.3	Hornady Duty: 175 Gr. Critical Duty, 91375, 40 Caliber	5000	Rounds		\$0.6398		No Bid		

Bid No. F2024087 Annual Contract for Ammunition

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award

					Precision Delta Corporation Ruleville, MS HUB - No CO-OP - No		Promo Solutions Frisco, TX HUB - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM		Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Section 1. Speer	1	Rounds		No Bid		* \$980,875,000.00	
1.1	Speer Duty: 9mm +P 124 gr. Gold Dot Hollow Point, Speer LE, 53617	35000	Rounds		No Bid		\$25,725.00	
1.2	Speer Duty: 45 Auto 230gr Gold Dot Hollow Point, 53966	10000	Rounds		No Bid		No Bid	
1.3	Speer Duty: 40 S&W 180gr Gold Dot Hollow Point, 53962	10000	Rounds		No Bid		\$8,050.00	
1.4	Speer Duty: 357 SIG 125gr Gold Dot Hollow Point LP, 53918	3000	Rounds		No Bid		No Bid	
1.5	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA		No Bid		20.0%	
2	Section 2. Federal	1	Rounds		No Bid		* \$1,230,720,000.00	
2.1	Federal Duty: Tactical Buckshot 12 Gauge 9-Pellet 00-Buck, Federal LE, LE132 00	8000	Rounds				\$3,840.00	
2.2	Federal Duty: 223 62 gr. Tactical Bonded SP, Federal, LE223T3, 223 Remington Caliber	50000	Rounds				\$24,000.00	
2.3	Federal Training: 223 55 gr. Full Metal Jacket (FMJ) Boat Tail, AE223, 223 Remington Caliber	75000	Rounds				No Bid	
2.4	Federal Training: 9mm Luger 147 gr. Full Metal Jacket (FMJ) Flat Point, AE9FP, 9 mm Luger Caliber	54000	Rounds				No Bid	
2.5	Federal Training: American Eagle 230gr. 45acp FMJ, AE45A	6000	Rounds				No Bid	
2.6	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA				20.0%	
3	Section 3. Hornady	1	Rounds		No Bid		No Bid	
3.1	Hornady Duty: 53 Gr. GMX Tap Patrol, 80295, 0.223 Caliber	100000	Rounds					
3.2	Hornady Duty: 135 gr. 9mm Luger +P, 90225, 9mm Caliber	1000	Rounds					
3.3	Hornady Duty: 175 Gr. Critical Duty, 91375, 40 Caliber	5000	Rounds					

Bid No. F2024087 Annual Contract for Ammunition

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	G T Distributors, Inc. Pflugerville, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IOF Inc. Dalton Gardens, ID HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
3.4	Hornady Duty: 135 gr. Flexlock Critical Duty, 91295, 357 Caliber	1000	Rounds	<u>\$0.7712</u>		No Bid	
3.5	Hornady Duty: 168 gr. A-Max Tap Precision, 80965, 308 Caliber	5000	Rounds	<u>\$1.4395</u>		No Bid	
3.6	Hornady Training: 135gr. FMJ, 90238, 9mm Caliber	100000	Rounds	<u>\$0.5612</u>		No Bid	
3.7	Hornady Training: 55Gr. SP, 80255, .223 Remington Caliber	1000	Rounds	<u>\$0.7112</u>		No Bid	
3.8	Hornady Training: 55Gr. FMJ-BT, 80275, .223 Remington Caliber	1000	Rounds	<u>\$0.7112</u>		No Bid	
3.9	Hornady Training: 55Gr. FMJ, 80271, .223 Remington Caliber	100000	Rounds	<u>\$0.5142</u>		No Bid	
3.10	Hornady Training: 175 gr. FMJ, 91374, 40 Caliber	5000	Rounds	<u>\$0.5382</u>		No Bid	
3.11	Hornady Training: 90 gr. Frangible, 90230, 9mm Caliber	1000	Rounds	<u>\$0.5928</u>		No Bid	
3.12	Hornady Training: 125 gr. Frangible, 91319, 40Caliber	1000	Rounds	<u>\$0.7362</u>		No Bid	
3.13	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA	<u>40.0%</u>		0.0%	
4	Section 4. Winchester	1	Rounds	No Bid		\$0.00	
4.1	Winchester Duty: 147g Ranger, 9mm Caliber, RA9T-DS	1000	Rounds			No Bid	
4.2	Winchester Duty: 180g Ranger, 40 CAL Caliber, RA40T	1500	Rounds			No Bid	
4.3	Winchester Duty: 230g Ranger, 45 CAL Caliber, RA45T	1	Rounds			No Bid	
4.4	Winchester Duty: 64g Ranger, 223 CAL Caliber, RA223R2	1	Rounds			No Bid	
4.5	Winchester Duty: 00 9 pellet, 12ga Caliber, RA12005	1	Rounds			No Bid	
4.6	Winchester Duty: 95g Ranger, 380 Caliber, RA380T-DS	500	Rounds			No Bid	

Bid No. F2024087 Annual Contract for Ammunition

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award

				Precision Delta Corporation Ruleville, MS HUB - No CO-OP - No		Promo Solutions Frisco, TX HUB - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
3.4	Hornady Duty: 135 gr. Flexlock Critical Duty, 91295, 357 Caliber	1000	Rounds				
3.5	Hornady Duty: 168 gr. A-Max Tap Precision, 80965, 308 Caliber	5000	Rounds				
3.6	Hornady Training: 135gr. FMJ, 90238, 9mm Caliber	100000	Rounds				
3.7	Hornady Training: 55Gr. SP, 80255, .223 Remington Caliber	1000	Rounds				
3.8	Hornady Training: 55Gr. FMJ-BT, 80275, .223 Remington Caliber	1000	Rounds				
3.9	Hornady Training: 55Gr. FMJ, 80271, .223 Remington Caliber	100000	Rounds				
3.10	Hornady Training: 175 gr. FMJ, 91374, 40 Caliber	5000	Rounds				
3.11	Hornady Training: 90 gr. Frangible, 90230, 9mm Caliber	1000	Rounds				
3.12	Hornady Training: 125 gr. Frangible, 91319, 40Caliber	1000	Rounds				
3.13	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA				
4	Section 4. Winchester	1	Rounds	P	<u>\$9,982.68</u>	No Bid	
4.1	Winchester Duty: 147g Ranger, 9mm Caliber, RA9T-DS	1000	Rounds		<u>\$0.39</u>		
4.2	Winchester Duty: 180g Ranger, 40 CAL Caliber, RA40T	1500	Rounds		<u>\$0.45</u>		
4.3	Winchester Duty: 230g Ranger, 45 CAL Caliber, RA45T	1	Rounds		<u>\$0.50</u>		
4.4	Winchester Duty: 64g Ranger, 223 CAL Caliber, RA223R2	1	Rounds		<u>\$0.68</u>		
4.5	Winchester Duty: 00 9 pellet, 12ga Caliber, RA12005	1	Rounds		<u>\$0.72</u>		
4.6	Winchester Duty: 95g Ranger, 380 Caliber, RA380T-DS	500	Rounds		<u>\$0.43</u>		

Bid No. F2024087 Annual Contract for Ammunition

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	G T Distributors, Inc. Pflugerville, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		IOF Inc. Dalton Gardens, ID HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
4.7	Winchester Duty: 127 Grain, 9mm Luger +Pt, Ranger T-Series RA9TA	2000	Rounds			No Bid	
4.8	Winchester Duty: 124 Grain, 9mm Luger +P, Ranger T-Series RA9124TP	2000	Rounds			No Bid	
4.9	Winchester Duty: 230 Grain, .45 Automatic, Ranger T-Series RA45T	1500	Rounds			No Bid	
4.10	Winchester Training: 115 gr. FMJ, 9mm Caliber	12000	Rounds			No Bid	
4.11	Winchester Training: 180 gr. FMJ, 40 CAL Caliber	5000	Rounds			No Bid	
4.12	Winchester Training: 230 gr. FMJ, 45 ACP Caliber	2000	Rounds			No Bid	
4.13	Winchester Training: 147g FMJ, 9mm Caliber, USA9MM1-DS	2000	Rounds			No Bid	
4.14	Winchester Training: 55g FMJ, 5.56mm Caliber, Q3131	1	Rounds			No Bid	
4.15	Winchester Training: 95gr FMJ, 380 Caliber, Q4206-DS	1	Rounds			No Bid	
4.16	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA				0.0%
5	Section 5. Idaho Ordnance	1	Rounds	No Bid		P	<u>\$2,820.00</u>
5.1	Idaho Ordnance Training: 9mm Luger 9MM 147 GR. Copper Jacketed FP	4000	Rounds				<u>\$0.29</u>
5.2	Idaho Ordnance Training: .40 Cal Smith & Wesson 180 GR Copper Jacketed FP	2000	Rounds				<u>\$0.39</u>
5.3	Idaho Ordnance Training: .45 AUTO 230 GR. FMJ	2000	Rounds				<u>\$0.44</u>

Bid No. F2024087 Annual Contract for Ammunition

P - Primary Award
S - Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Precision Delta Corporation Ruleville, MS HUB - No CO-OP - No			Promo Solutions Frisco, TX HUB - Yes		
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
4.7	Winchester Duty: 127 Grain, 9mm Luger +P+, Ranger T-Series RA9TA	2000	Rounds		<u>\$0.39</u>				
4.8	Winchester Duty: 124 Grain, 9mm Luger +P, Ranger T-Series RA9124TP	2000	Rounds		<u>\$0.39</u>				
4.9	Winchester Duty: 230 Grain, .45 Automatic, Ranger T-Series RA45T	1500	Rounds		<u>\$0.50</u>				
4.10	Winchester Training: 115 gr. FMJ, 9mm Caliber	12000	Rounds		<u>\$0.28</u>				
4.11	Winchester Training: 180 gr. FMJ, 40 CAL Caliber	5000	Rounds		<u>\$0.33</u>				
4.12	Winchester Training: 230 gr. FMJ, 45 ACP Caliber	2000	Rounds		<u>\$0.38</u>				
4.13	Winchester Training: 147g FMJ, 9mm Caliber, USA9MM1-DS	2000	Rounds		<u>\$0.31</u>				
4.14	Winchester Training: 55g FMJ, 5.56mm Caliber, Q3131	1	Rounds		<u>\$0.49</u>				
4.15	Winchester Training: 95gr FMJ, 380 Caliber, Q4206-DS	1	Rounds		<u>\$0.29</u>				
4.16	Discount off list for optional items not included in the base specifications	1	EA		<u>47.0%</u>				
5	Section 5. Idaho Ordnance	1	Rounds	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
5.1	Idaho Ordnance Training: 9mm Luger 9MM 147 GR. Copper Jacketed FP	4000	Rounds						
5.2	Idaho Ordnance Training: .40 Cal Smith & Wesson 180 GR Copper Jacketed FP	2000	Rounds						
5.3	Idaho Ordnance Training: .45 AUTO 230 GR. FMJ	2000	Rounds						

* The bid received from Promo Solutions did not meet specifications because they did not bid on all items within a section as required.