

BID NO. F2024038 Annual Contract for Biomedical and Hazardous Waste Pickup and Disposal

PRIMARY AWARD

SECTION I - BIOMEDICAL WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL											
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Ventrex Environmental Services, LLC Everman, TX HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes		AdvoWaste Medical Lakewood, NJ HUB - No		Tradebe Environmental Services, LLC Merrillville, IN HUB - No			
				Total Price	Extended	Total Price	Extended	Total Price	Extended	No Bid	
				Unit		Unit		Unit			
					<u>\$57.00</u>		\$561.00		No Bid		
1.1	Scheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Biomedical Waste (not including pathological waste)	1	Per Box	<u>\$19.00</u>		\$19.50		No Bid			
1.2	Unscheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Biomedical Waste (not including pathological waste)	1	Per Box	<u>\$19.00</u>		\$19.50		No Bid			
1.3	Scheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Pathological waste	1	Per Pickup	<u>\$19.00</u>		\$522.00		No Bid			

SECONDARY AWARD

SECTION I - BIOMEDICAL WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL					Sharps Compliance Inc. Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Green Planet, Inc. Royse City, TX HUB - Yes		
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Total Price	Unit	Extended	Total Price	Unit	No Bid
1.1	Scheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Biomedical Waste (not including pathological waste)	1	Per Box	\$21.00		\$79.00		No Bid	No Bid
1.2	Unscheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Biomedical Waste (not including pathological waste)	1	Per Box	\$21.00				No Bid	
1.3	Scheduled Pick-Up and Disposal of Pathological waste	1	Per Pickup	\$37.00				No Bid	

BID NO. F2024038 Annual Contract for Biomedical and Hazardous Waste Pickup and Disposal

PRIMARY AWARD

SECTION II - HAZARDOUS WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL									
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Ventrex Environmental Services, LLC Everman, TX HUB - Yes		AdvoWaste Medical Lakewood, NJ HUB - No		Tradebe Environmental Services, LLC Merrillville, IN HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
				Total Price Unit	No Bid Extended	Total Price Unit	No Bid Extended	Total Price Unit	Extended
					No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$2,253.00</u>
2.1	DNA Extraction Cartridges	1	55 Gal. Open Drum	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$677.00</u>	
2.2	Formalin and Water	1	Closed Drum	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$417.00</u>	
2.3	Inorganic Salts Solution	1	35 Gal. Open Drum	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$224.00</u>	
2.4	Paraffin and Xylene	1	35 Gal. Open Drum	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$244.00</u>	
2.5	Spent Acid in Rinse Water	1	5 Gal. Container	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$126.00</u>	
2.6	Spent Organic Solvents	1	Closed Drum	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$232.00</u>	
2.7	Liquid Waste Stream for Public Health Lab	1	15 Gal. Drum	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$232.00</u>	
2.8	Halogenated Solvents	1	5 Gal. Drum	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$101.00</u>	

SUPPLIES (IF NEEDED)

3.1	Empty, Poly, Open Top Drum - 55 gallon Quantity Unknown	1	Closed Drum	No Bid		No Bid		\$110.00	
3.2	Empty, Poly, Open Top Drum - 5 gallon Quantity Unknown	1	15 Gal. Drum	No Bid		No Bid		\$25.00	
3.3	Empty, Poly, Closed Top Drum - 5 gallon Quantity Unknown	1	5 Gal. Drum	No Bid		No Bid		\$25.00	

BID NO. F2024038 Annual Contract for Biomedical and Hazardous Waste Pickup and Disposal

SECONDARY AWARD

SECTION II - HAZARDOUS WASTE PICKUP AND DISPOSAL				Sharps Compliance Inc. Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Green Planet, Inc. Royse City, TX HUB - Yes	
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Total Price Unit	Extended	Total Price Unit	Extended
2.1	DNA Extraction Cartridges	1	55 Gal. Open Drum	\$900.00	\$2,475.93	\$989.00	\$2,639.00
2.2	Formalin and Water	1	Closed Drum	\$250.00		\$300.00	
2.3	Inorganic Salts Solution	1	35 Gal. Open Drum	\$175.00		\$200.00	
2.4	Paraffin and Xylene	1	35 Gal. Open Drum	\$365.00		\$350.00	
2.5	Spent Acid in Rinse Water	1	5 Gal. Container	\$182.86		\$125.00	
2.6	Spent Organic Solvents	1	Closed Drum	\$189.20		\$200.00	
2.7	Liquid Waste Stream for Public Health Lab	1	15 Gal. Drum	\$140.30		\$350.00	
2.8	Halogenated Solvents	1	5 Gal. Drum	\$273.57		\$125.00	

SUPPLIES (IF NEEDED)

3.1	Empty, Poly, Open Top Drum - 55 gallon Quantity Unknown	1	Closed Drum	\$77.97	\$65.00
3.2	Empty, Poly, Open Top Drum - 5 gallon Quantity Unknown	1	15 Gal. Drum	\$20.00	\$20.00
3.3	Empty, Poly, Closed Top Drum - 5 gallon Quantity Unknown	1	5 Gal. Drum	\$20.00	\$30.00

VEERINDER (VINNY) TANEJA, MBBS; MPH
PUBLIC HEALTH DIRECTOR



CATHERINE A. COLQUITT, M.D.
LOCAL HEALTH AUTHORITY & MEDICAL DIRECTOR

Public Health

December 28, 2023

Kehinde Olugbile
Senior Buyer
Tarrant County Purchasing Department

RE: Bid No. F2024038 Annual Contract for Biomedical and Hazardous Waste and Pickup and Disposal

Kehinde,

After consideration and evaluation of the Vendor responses for the above bid, the Public Health Department recommends that the following Vendor receive this award:

Ventrex Environmental

Thank you for your guidance and assistance during this process.

Debbie MacLeod

Debbie MacLeod
Account Analyst
Tarrant County Public Health



Tarrant County Public Health





OFFICE OF CHIEF MEDICAL EXAMINER AND FORENSIC LABORATORIES

200 Feliks Gwozdz Place • Fort Worth, Texas 76104
817.920.5700 phone • 817.920.5713 fax

To whom it may concern:

Tarrant County Medical Examiner's Office has evaluated bid 2024-038, Annual Contract for Biomedical and Hazardous Waste Pick-up and Disposal and recommends the low bids referenced in the spreadsheet meet out specifications and we recommend for award.



Rufus G. Dill
Director of Morgue & Laboratory Services
Office of Chief Medical Examiner
200 Feliks Gwozdz Place
Fort Worth Texas 76104-4919

12/22/2023