

Bid No. F2024056 Sale of Weapons and Accessories

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Proforce Marketing, Inc. d/b/a Proforce Law Enforcement Prescott, AZ HUB - No		GT Distributors, Inc. Pflugerville, TX HUB - No		Defiant Arms, L.L.C. Haltom City, TX HUB - No	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Lot 1	1	Lot		\$1,545.60	<b>P</b>	<b>\$1,810.00</b>	No Bid	
2	Lot 2	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$2,856.00</b>		\$1,575.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
3	Lot 3	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$2,464.00</b>		\$2,440.00	\$800.00	\$800.00
4	Lot 4	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$2,150.40</b>		\$1,420.00	No Bid	
5	Lot 5	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$4,334.40</b>		\$1,865.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00
6	Lot 6	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$1,803.20</b>		\$1,380.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
7	Lot 7	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$1,803.20</b>		\$919.00	\$300.00	\$300.00
8	Lot 8	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$2,576.00</b>		\$1,518.00	\$600.00	\$600.00
9	Lot 9	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$1,640.80</b>		\$1,072.00	\$600.00	\$600.00
10	Lot 10	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$2,402.40</b>		\$1,694.00	\$600.00	\$600.00
11	Lot 11	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$800.80</b>		\$672.00	\$250.00	\$250.00
12	Lot 12	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$1,680.00</b>		\$849.00	\$800.00	\$800.00
13	Lot 13	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$4,600.00</b>		\$2,805.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
14	Lot 14	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$2,520.00</b>		\$1,330.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
15	Lot 15	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$3,477.60</b>		\$1,750.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
16	Lot 16	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$2,128.00</b>		\$1,459.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
17	Lot 17	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$1,551.20</b>		\$1,299.00	\$500.00	\$500.00
18	Lot 18	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$2,245.60</b>		\$1,780.00	\$600.00	\$600.00
19	Lot 19	1	Lot	<b>P</b>	<b>\$2,178.40</b>		\$1,620.00	No Bid	
20	Lot 20	1	Lot		\$252.00	<b>P</b>	<b>\$300.00</b>	\$100.00	\$100.00
21	Lot 21	1	Lot		\$313.60	<b>P</b>	<b>\$1,000.00</b>	\$100.00	\$100.00



Bid No. F2024056 Sale of Weapons and Accessories

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Elliot White Gun Co (Whites Gun Company LLC) North Richland Hills, TX HUB - No			Kings Firearms LLC Columbia, TN HUB - No			R BAR K Gunworks Granbury, TX HUB - No		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
1	Lot 1	1	Lot	\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00	No Bid				\$100.00	\$100.00	
2	Lot 2	1	Lot	\$1,750.00	\$1,750.00		\$1,625.00	\$1,625.00		\$500.00	\$500.00	
3	Lot 3	1	Lot	\$1,800.00	\$1,800.00		\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00		\$200.00	\$200.00	
4	Lot 4	1	Lot	\$1,650.00	\$1,650.00		\$2,120.00	\$2,120.00		\$500.00	\$500.00	
5	Lot 5	1	Lot	\$2,475.00	\$2,475.00		\$3,040.00	\$3,040.00		\$400.00	\$400.00	
6	Lot 6	1	Lot	\$950.00	\$950.00		\$1,370.00	\$1,370.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
7	Lot 7	1	Lot	\$700.00	\$700.00		\$1,100.00	\$1,100.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
8	Lot 8	1	Lot	\$975.00	\$975.00		\$1,835.00	\$1,835.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
9	Lot 9	1	Lot	\$750.00	\$750.00		\$1,430.00	\$1,430.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
10	Lot 10	1	Lot	\$1,050.00	\$1,050.00		\$1,505.00	\$1,505.00		\$400.00	\$400.00	
11	Lot 11	1	Lot	\$355.00	\$355.00		\$755.00	\$755.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
12	Lot 12	1	Lot	\$825.00	\$825.00		\$1,150.00	\$1,150.00		\$400.00	\$400.00	
13	Lot 13	1	Lot	\$1,700.00	\$1,700.00		\$2,445.00	\$2,445.00		\$500.00	\$500.00	
14	Lot 14	1	Lot	\$1,400.00	\$1,400.00		\$1,950.00	\$1,950.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
15	Lot 15	1	Lot	\$1,450.00	\$1,450.00		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
16	Lot 16	1	Lot	\$1,025.00	\$1,025.00		\$1,675.00	\$1,675.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
17	Lot 17	1	Lot	\$675.00	\$675.00		\$1,325.00	\$1,325.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
18	Lot 18	1	Lot	\$1,250.00	\$1,250.00		\$1,840.00	\$1,840.00		\$100.00	\$100.00	
19	Lot 19	1	Lot	\$1,050.00	\$1,050.00		\$2,075.00	\$2,075.00		\$200.00	\$200.00	
20	Lot 20	1	Lot	\$50.00	\$50.00		\$275.00	\$275.00		\$50.00	\$50.00	
21	Lot 21	1	Lot	\$50.00	\$50.00		\$100.00	\$100.00		\$50.00	\$50.00	

Bid No. F2024056 Sale of Weapons and Accessories

Line #		Description	QTY	UOM	Weg's Guns (3GWE LLC) Farmers Branch, TX HUB - No	
					Unit	Extended
1	Lot 1	1	Lot		\$1,200.00	\$1,200.00
2	Lot 2	1	Lot		\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
3	Lot 3	1	Lot		\$1,600.00	\$1,600.00
4	Lot 4	1	Lot		\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
5	Lot 5	1	Lot		\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00
6	Lot 6	1	Lot		\$600.00	\$600.00
7	Lot 7	1	Lot		\$380.00	\$380.00
8	Lot 8	1	Lot		\$800.00	\$800.00
9	Lot 9	1	Lot		\$525.00	\$525.00
10	Lot 10	1	Lot		\$500.00	\$500.00
11	Lot 11	1	Lot		\$100.00	\$100.00
12	Lot 12	1	Lot		\$500.00	\$500.00
13	Lot 13	1	Lot		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00
14	Lot 14	1	Lot		\$500.00	\$500.00
15	Lot 15	1	Lot		\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00
16	Lot 16	1	Lot		\$800.00	\$800.00
17	Lot 17	1	Lot		\$400.00	\$400.00
18	Lot 18	1	Lot		\$800.00	\$800.00
19	Lot 19	1	Lot		\$800.00	\$800.00
20	Lot 20	1	Lot		\$50.00	\$50.00
21	Lot 21	1	Lot		\$100.00	\$100.00