

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award
S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Con10gency Consulting, LLC. Beaverton, OR HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes			GoRescue Brands Inc. Birmingham, AL HUB - No			One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 PlusCardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	25	EA	No Bid			No Bid		P	<u>\$309.97</u>	\$7,749.25	
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	25	EA	No Bid			No Bid		S	\$286.34	\$7,158.50	
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for PowerheartG3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	25	EA	No Bid			No Bid		P	<u>\$96.49</u>	\$2,412.25	
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for PowerheartG3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	100	EA	No Bid			No Bid		P	<u>\$35.47</u>	\$3,547.00	
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	6	EA	No Bid			No Bid		P	<u>\$90.29</u>	\$541.74	
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	100	EA	No Bid			No Bid			\$71.14	\$7,114.00	

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award
S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Rescue One Training For Life, Inc. Gaithersburg, MD HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Henry Schein, Inc Melville, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 PlusCardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	25	EA	\$330.00	\$8,250.00	S	\$329.25	\$8,231.25		\$332.69	\$8,317.25	
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	25	EA	\$327.75	\$8,193.75		\$327.00	\$8,175.00	P	\$281.49	\$7,037.25	
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for PowerheartG3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	25	EA	\$103.25	\$2,581.25		\$102.50	\$2,562.50		\$98.90	\$2,472.50	
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for PowerheartG3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	100	EA	\$38.25	\$3,825.00	S	\$37.70	\$3,770.00		\$50.28	\$5,028.00	
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAED003A	6	EA	\$96.25	\$577.50		\$95.90	\$575.40		\$93.10	\$558.60	
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAED001B	100	EA	\$71.00	\$7,100.00		\$70.50	\$7,050.00	S	\$67.90	\$6,790.00	

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award
S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	R.D.B. Distributions LLC Kansas City, MO HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Uncharted Territory Solutions (Uncharted Territory LLC) Houston, TX HUB - No			Fisher Healthcare (Thermo Fisher Scientific LLC) Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 PlusCardiac Science #9146-302 (Yellow)	25	EA	\$445.25	\$11,131.25		\$395.00	\$9,875.00		\$398.00	\$9,950.00	
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XBTAED001A (Orange)	25	EA	\$425.00	\$10,625.00		\$395.00	\$9,875.00		\$395.00	\$9,875.00	
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for PowerheartG3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	25	EA	\$98.00	\$2,450.00	S	\$105.00	\$2,625.00		\$103.39	\$2,584.75	
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for PowerheartG3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	100	EA	\$55.00	\$5,500.00		\$60.00	\$6,000.00		\$51.00	\$5,100.00	
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAEED003A	6	EA	\$95.00	\$570.00		\$100.00	\$600.00		\$110.00	\$660.00	
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAEED001B	100	EA	\$71.75	\$7,175.00		\$75.00	\$7,500.00		\$77.17	\$7,717.00	

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award
S=Secondary Award

		Cardio Partners, Inc. Dublin, OH HUB - No CO-OP - Yes				Medco Supply Company (Performance Health Supply LLC) Warrenville, IL HUB - No			
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended
1	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G3/G3 PlusCardiac Science #9146- 302 (Yellow)	25	EA		\$415.00	\$10,375.00		\$426.36	\$10,659.00
2	Battery, AED, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XBTAE0001A (Orange)	25	EA		\$450.00	\$11,250.00		\$445.33	\$11,133.25
3	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for PowerheartG3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9730-002	25	EA		\$105.00	\$2,625.00		\$125.61	\$3,140.25
4	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for PowerheartG3/G3 Plus Cardiac Science #9131-001	100	EA		\$53.00	\$5,300.00		\$68.29	\$6,829.00
5	Defibrillation Pads, Pediatric, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAE0003A	6	EA	S	\$92.00	\$552.00		\$116.47	\$698.82
6	Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAE0001B	100	EA	P	<u>\$64.00</u>	\$6,400.00		\$90.59	\$9,059.00

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award
S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Con10gency Consulting, LLC. Beaverton, OR HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes			GoRescue Brands Inc. Birmingham, AL HUB - No			One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	5	EA	No Bid			No Bid		P	\$215.12	\$1,075.60	
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual- LanguageCardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	3	EA	No Bid			No Bid		S	\$1,365.00	\$4,095.00	
9	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 PlusCardiac Science #168-6000-006	2	EA	No Bid			No Bid			\$107.11	\$214.22	
10	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #9157-004	2	EA	No Bid			\$310.00	\$620.00	P	\$309.84	\$619.68	
11	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	2	EA	No Bid			No Bid		P	\$88.75	\$177.50	
12	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	2	EA	No Bid			No Bid		P	\$348.80	\$697.60	
13	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	2	EA	No Bid			No Bid		S	\$140.76	\$281.52	

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),

Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award

S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Rescue One Training For Life, Inc. Gaithersburg, MD HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Henry Schein, Inc Melville, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	5	EA		\$229.00	\$1,145.00		\$228.50	\$1,142.50	\$223.87	\$1,119.35	
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-LanguageCardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	3	EA	P	\$1,337.50	\$4,012.50		\$1,500.00	\$4,500.00	\$1,772.00	\$5,316.00	
9	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 PlusCardiac Science #168-6000-006	2	EA		\$114.75	\$229.50		\$104.20	\$208.40	\$105.20	\$210.40	
10	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #9157-004	2	EA		\$330.00	\$660.00		\$329.00	\$658.00	\$320.25	\$640.50	
11	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	2	EA		\$95.00	\$190.00	S	\$94.25	\$188.50	\$110.80	\$221.60	
12	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	2	EA		\$371.00	\$742.00		\$370.50	\$741.00	\$360.18	\$720.36	
13	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	2	EA		\$149.75	\$299.50		\$149.50	\$299.00	\$135.06	\$270.12	

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),

Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award

S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	R.D.B. Distributions LLC Kansas City, MO HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Uncharted Territory Solutions (Uncharted Territory LLC) Houston, TX HUB - No			Fisher Healthcare (Thermo Fisher Scientific LLC) Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAED002B	5	EA		\$245.50		\$225.00	\$1,125.00		\$250.02	\$1,250.10	
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual-LanguageCardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	3	EA		\$1,895.95		\$1,699.00	\$5,097.00		\$1,921.30	\$5,763.90	
9	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 PlusCardiac Science #168-6000-006	2	EA	P	\$63.00		No Bid		S	\$76.21	\$152.42	
10	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #9157-004	2	EA		\$365.00		No Bid			No Bid		
11	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	2	EA		\$121.00		\$100.00	\$200.00		\$124.49	\$248.98	
12	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	2	EA		\$415.66		No Bid			\$405.39	\$810.78	
13	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	2	EA		\$161.20		\$176.00	\$352.00		\$163.59	\$327.18	

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award
S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Cardio Partners, Inc. Dublin, OH HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Medco Supply Company (Performance Health Supply LLC) Warrenville, IL HUB - No		
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Unit	Extended	Unit
7	ICPR Defibrillation Pads, Adult, for Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XELAEED002B	5	EA	\$240.00	\$1,200.00	No Bid			
8	AED, Fully Automatic, Dual- LanguageCardiac Science Powerheart G5 #G5A-80A-P	3	EA	\$1,900.00	\$5,700.00	\$2,031.15		\$6,093.45	
9	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G3/G3 PlusCardiac Science #168-6000-006	2	EA	\$116.00	\$232.00	No Bid			
10	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #9157-004	2	EA	\$350.00	\$700.00	No Bid			
11	Carry Case, Semi-Rigid, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAAED007A	2	EA	\$116.00	\$232.00	No Bid			
12	Carry Case, Hard-Sided, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAAED003A	2	EA	\$374.00	\$748.00	No Bid			
13	Rescue Backpack, Powerheart G3/G3 Plus/G5Cardiac Science, #XBPAED001A	2	EA	\$149.00	\$298.00	\$213.75		\$427.50	

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award
S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Con10gency Consulting, LLC. Beaverton, OR HUB - Yes CO-OP - Yes			GoRescue Brands Inc. Birmingham, AL HUB - No			One Beat CPR Learning Center LLC Miramar, FL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
14	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAAED008A	2	EA	No Bid			\$79.00	\$158.00		\$81.17	\$162.34	
15	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	3	EA	No Bid			\$75.00	\$225.00	P	<u>\$31.71</u>	\$95.13	
16	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with AlarmCardiac Science #50-00392- 20	5	EA	No Bid			\$269.00	\$1,345.00	P	<u>\$241.64</u>	\$1,208.20	
17	Kit, Bleed Control, Individual. North American Rescue #80-0465.	10	EA				No Bid			\$52.00	\$520.00	

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award
S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	School Health Corporation Rolling Meadows, IL HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Rescue One Training For Life, Inc. Gaithersburg, MD HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		Henry Schein, Inc Melville, NY HUB - No CO-OP - Yes	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
14	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAED008A	2	EA	\$54.75	\$109.50	\$54.00	\$108.00	\$49.90	\$99.80
15	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	3	EA	\$34.25	\$102.75	\$33.70	\$101.10	\$60.60	\$181.80
16	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with AlarmCardiac Science #50-00392- 20	5	EA	\$257.25	\$1,286.25	\$257.00	\$1,285.00	\$249.95	\$1,249.75
17	Kit, Bleed Control, Individual. North American Rescue #80-0465.	10	EA	\$50.50	\$505.00	\$49.35	\$493.50	\$43.60	\$436.00

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award
S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	R.D.B. Distributions LLC Kansas City, MO HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Uncharted Territory Solutions (Uncharted Territory LLC) Houston, TX HUB - No			Fisher Healthcare (Thermo Fisher Scientific LLC) Houston, TX HUB - No CO-OP - Yes		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
14	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAED008A	2	EA	\$63.02	\$126.04		\$75.00	\$150.00		\$63.55	\$127.10	
15	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	3	EA	\$61.25	\$183.75		\$35.00	\$105.00		\$67.90	\$203.70	
16	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with AlarmCardiac Science #50-00392- 20	5	EA	\$283.75	\$1,418.75		\$305.00	\$1,525.00		\$258.95	\$1,294.75	
17	Kit, Bleed Control, Individual. North American Rescue #80-0465.	10	EA	\$98.20	\$982.00		\$48.00	\$480.00		\$53.55	\$535.50	

Bid No. F2024036 Annual Contract for Automated External Defibrillators (AED's),
Accessories, and Bleed Control Kits

P=Primary Award

S=Secondary Award

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Cardio Partners, Inc. Dublin, OH HUB - No CO-OP - Yes			Medco Supply Company (Performance Health Supply LLC) Warrenville, IL HUB - No		
				Unit	Extended		Unit	Extended	
14	Carry Sleeve, Powerheart G5Cardiac Science #XCAED008A	2	EA	\$65.00	\$130.00		No Bid		
15	AED Ready Kit Cardiac Science #UKIT001A	3	EA	\$49.00	\$147.00		No Bid		
16	Wall Cabinet, Surface Mount with AlarmCardiac Science #50-00392- 20	5	EA	\$260.00	\$1,300.00		No Bid		
17	Kit, Bleed Control, Individual. North American Rescue #80-0465.	10	EA	\$48.00	\$480.00		\$93.98	\$939.80	

* No bids were received from Emergency Medical Products,
Bound tree Medical, and Unipak Corp.

**Uncharted Territory withdrew their bid for items 10 and 12
due to pricing errors.